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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent Friday,23 March 2018 8:16 AM

To: Kitty Teo Poh Guek

Cc: 'ANG Yvonne'; 'Jas Tan Siok Thiew'; birdie.ong@axa.com.sg; winnie.ho@axa.com.sg;

. kitty.teo@axa.com.sg; SUR

Subject RE: [MV] Check Market Value (MV) - SU 3785D / S8M00B54 DOA: 17-Mar-2018

Dear Kitty,

The market value for SU 3785D is S120K-5125K (EST) as at March 2018.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-43t5

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, ubiAvenue L,#02-25 | s(408933)

From: Elise Chong [mailto:surveyadminS@fta.com.sg]
Sent: Thursd ay, 22 March 2018 4:31 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)<veronchen@lkkauto.com>; 'admin'<admin@lbs-auto.com>; 'chowauto'
<chowauto@singnet.com.sg>;'rta'<rta@rta.com.sg>;'admin'<admin@autoprobe.com.sg>;'cynthia.ong'

. <cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'ANG Yvonne' <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; 'Jas Tan Siok Thiew' <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>; birdie.ong@axa.com.sg;

winnie.ho@axa.com.sg; kitty.teo@axa.com.sg; Wendy Tan <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; Betty Chew
<su rveyadmin 1 @fta.com.sg>
Subject: [MV] Check Market Value (MV) - SU 3785D / S8M00B54 DOA: 17-Mar-2O78

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to kittv.teo@axa.com.ss and cc to all OD case handler within 48 hours.

Please find attached Parf Rebate for your refer.

Tha'nLv yow €t warmt re$ard,Y

Elise Chong
FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd
No. 33 UbiAve 3,#02-15 Vertex, Singapore 408868
Tel : (65) 6509 1788. Fax: (65) 6509622'l
Email:@
Website: www.fta.com.sg
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Enquire PARF/COE Be.bate for Registered Veticle
, Vehicle Orvner Partlculars

Owner lDType:

Owner lD:

Vehlcle Details
. Vehicle No.:

vehicle to be Exported:

r 
. t1te.n!9a O{egistration _Date:

: Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

PrimaryColour:

Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum PowerOutPut:

Open MarketValue:

Original ReSistration Date:

First ReSistration Date:

Transfer Count

' ActualARFPaid:
: lntendg!_P,AlF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

lntended COE Rebate Detalls

COE Expiry Date:

COE Catego4tl

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE RebateAmount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Mar 2018
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JAGUAR

XF 2.OPTSS

Black

2074

277714022622204W

SAJACOsM6FPU54242

177.0 kw (237 bhp)

$50,302.00

29 Apt2O75

29 Apr2Otl
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$62,s44.6 )t vl i
Yes

28Apr2025

$46,908.00

28Apr2025

B - Car abole 16o0cc or 97kW (13obhp)

10

$78,m10o

$55,380.@

S102,288.@
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