‘Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LEK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 11:55 AM

To: Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Irene Tay

Subject: RE: URGENT <Seek Mandate> Direct Settliement - Accident Involving YLB176P (Ol :
CTl - SNM18D01528C02) AND SKKBOBEG (TP : LKK REF - CCE/CTI18005408/Upb3)
an 22.03.2018

Dear Alfred,

Kindly note that we have settled the claim at 54,900.00 with Third Party. We will proceed to close and submit
document as soon as possible.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: liale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-
25 | 5(408933)

—-Original Message—

From: Alfred Toh [mailto:alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com)

Sent: Monday, 1 July 2019 10:52 AM

To: Jia Le [LKK Auto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: URGENT <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YLB176P (Ol : CT1 - SNM18D01528C02)
AND SKKBOBBG (TP : LKK REF - CCB/CTI18005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

Dear Hsiao Tong
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 54,923.00
Best Regards

Alfred

From: lia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 26, 2019 3:29:09 PM

To: Irene Tay

Cc: Chee So Chow; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: URGENT <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL8176P (Ol : CTl - SNM18D01528C02)
AND SKKBOSAG (TP : LKK REF - CC&/CTI12005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

Dear Irene,

We refer to our mandate request dated 14/04/2018.



We have yet hear from your good office up-to-date.

Kindly let us have your mandate/ instruction as third party is chasing for offer.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: liale@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-
25 | 5(408933)

——-0Original Messagg--——

From: Alfred Toh [mailto:alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Monday, 3 June 2019 4:42 PM

To: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto); Irene Tay; Admin A; lia Le [LKK Auto)

Cc: Chee So Chow; Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: URGENT <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YLB176P (Ol : CTi - SNM18D01528C02)
AND SKKBOB8G (TP : LKK REF - CC&/CTI18005408/Uph3) on 22.03.2018

Dear Irene
Please assist to check and authorise claim if in order.
Regards

Alfred

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, June 3, 2019 2:30:19 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Alfred Toh; Admin A; Irene Tay; lia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: URGENT <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YLB176P (Ol : CT1 - SNM18D01528C02)
AND SKK8088G (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

URGENT

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our mandate request dated 14/04/2018.

We have yet hear from your good office up-to-date.

Kindly advise if there is any Issue an this case and let us have your mandate/ instruction as third party is chasing for
offer.

Best Regards,

Hslao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com<mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



" From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 17 May 2019 3:58 PM
To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Cc: Alfred Toh (alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com) <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>;
Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: URGENT <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL8176P (O : CTI - SNM18D01528C02)
AND SKK8088G (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118005408/Upb3) on 22.03,2018

URGENT

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our mandate request dated 14/04/2018.

We have yet hear from your good office up-to-date.

Kindly advise if there is any issue on this case and let us have your mandate/ instruction as third party is chasing for
offer.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | emall: chewht@Ilkkauto.com<mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 9:15 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh (alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping. com<mailto:alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>)
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com<mallto:alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com<mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com>>; Irene Tay

<jrene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:irene.tay @sg.cntaiping.com>>

Subject: Re: URGENT <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL8176P (Ol : CTI - SNM18D01528C02)
AND SKK80BEG (TP : LKK REF - CCB/CT118005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

URGENT

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



We refer to our mandate request dated 14/04/2018.

We have yet hear from your good office up-to-date.

Kindly advise if there is any issue on this case and let us have your mandate/ instruction as third party Is chasing for
offer.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com<mailto:chewht@I|kkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Iindustrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Sunday, 31 March 2019 9:56 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A; Irene Tay; Alfred Toh (alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>)

Subject: RE: URGENT <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL8176P (OI : CTl - SNM18D01528C02)
AND SKKBO8SG (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

URGENT

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our mandate request dated 14/04/2018.

We have yet hear from your good office up-to-date.

Kindly advise if there is any issue on this case and let us have your mandate/ instruction as third party is chasing for
offer.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | emall: chewht@Ilkkauto.com<mailto:chewht@|kkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 2:46 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:irene.tay @sg.cntaiping.com>>; Admin A <admin-
ai@lkkauto.comemailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com>>

Subject: URGENT <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YLB176P (Ol : CTI - SNM18D01528C02)
AND SKKB0BS8G (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI118005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

URGENT

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our mandate request dated 14/04/2018.

We have yet hear from your good office up-to-date.

Kindly advise if there is any issue on this case and let us have your mandate/ instruction as third party is chasing for
offer,



~ Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com<mallto:chewht@Ikkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 25 lanuary 2019 5:05 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping. com<mallto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com<mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com>>; KKLau <kklau@Ilkkauto.com<mailto:kklau@lkkauto.com>>
Subject: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YLB176P (O1 : CT1 - SNM1BD01528C02) AND
SKK80D88G (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our mandate request dated 14/04/2018.

We have yet hear from your good office up-to-date.

Kindly advise if there is any issue on this case and let us have your mandate/ instruction as third party is chasing for
offer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,



Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht @lkkauto.com<mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 3 November 2018 10:50 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI" <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com<mallto:claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:irene. tay@sg.cntaiping.com>>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com<mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com>>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YLB176P (Ol : CT1 - SNM18D01528C02) AND SKK8088G (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI18005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

Hi Sirs,

We refer to our mandate request dated 14/04/2018.

Kindly let us have your mandate/ instruction,

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com<mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 15 September 2018 11:02 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>>

Cc: 'lrene Tay' <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping. com<mailto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com<mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com>>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YLB176P (O : CTI - SNM18D01528C02) AND SKKBOBBG (TP : LKK
REF - EEE!L‘[IIEDIJSilDBIUpbi} on 22.03.2018

Hi Sirs,

We refer to our mandate request dated 14/04/2018,

Kindly let us have your mandate/ Instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | emall: chewht@lkkauto.comemailto:chewht@|kkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 11 August 2018 10:29 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:irene.tay @sg.cntaiping.com>>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com<mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com>>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL8176P (Ol : CTI - SNM18D01528C02) AND SKKBOBSG (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI18005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

Hi Sirs,



We refer to our mandate request dated 14/04/2018.

Kindly let us have your mandate/ instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.come<mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 28 July 2018 11:25 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene tay@sg.cntaiping. com<mailto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com<mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com>>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YLB176P (Ol : CT1 - SNM18D01528C02) AND SKKBOBBG (TP : LKK
REF - CCB/CTI1B005408/Upb3) on 22,03.2018

Hi Sirs,

We refer to our mandate request dated 14,/04/2018.

Kindly let us have your mandate/ Instruction.

Best Regards,



Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com<mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 7 July 2018 11:51 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com<mallto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com<mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com>>; 'Irene Tay'
<irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com<mallto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL8176P (O : CTI - SNM18D01528C02) AND SKKBOBBG (TP : LKK
REF - CCB/CTI18005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

Dear Sirs/Madam,

Further to our below email.

Kindly let us have your approval/ instruction

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ilkkauto.com<mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 2 June 2018 1:35 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.comemaiito:claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@/kkauto.com<mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com>>; 'Irene Tay'
<irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:irene.tay @sg.cntaiping.com>>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL8176P (Ol : CTI - SNM18D01528C02) AND SKKB0BEG (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI18005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

Dear Sirs/Madam,

Further to our below email.

Kindly let us have your approval/ instruction

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | emall: chewht@lkkauto.com<mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hslao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 28 April 2018 3:21 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com<malito:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com<mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com==; 'Irene Tay'
<irene.tay@sg.cntalping.com<mailto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>>
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~ Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL8176F (O1: CTI - SNM18D01528C02) AND SKK8088G (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI118005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to email dated 14/04/2018.

Kindly let us have your approval/ instruction

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com<mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 14 April 2018 3:18 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntalping.com<mallto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com<mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com>>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving YLB176P (Ol : CTI - SNM18D01528C02) AND SKKB088G (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI18005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

Your ref : SNM18D0152BC02

Our ref : CC6/CT118005408/Upb3n2

Dear Sirs/Madam,

12



ACCIDENT INVOLVING YL 8176P{0I) & SKK B088G(TP) ON 22/03/2018

We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our insured driver changed lane and collided onto third party who was driving within
his lane. Liabllity is not in our insured’s driver.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "Fastech Auto Pte Ltd" at 54,923.00{all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed

Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)

$15,722.15

S5 4,601.00

2. Loss of Rental (2days x 5180.00)

$ 360.00

$ 320.00(2days x $160.00)

3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee

S 2.00



Total

$516,084.15

54,923.00

**04 days recommendation for repair.

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Best Regards,

Hslao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ilkkauto.com<mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 April 2018 9:56 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com<mallto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>>; Admin A <admin-
ai@lkkauto.comemailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com>>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YLB176P (Ol : CT1 - SNM18D01528C02) AND SKKBOBBG (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI18005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018
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Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed for your perusal is; -

* Estimated cost of repair
* Preliminary advice
* Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht @lkkauto.com<mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Lucas Lee [mailto:lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com)

Sent; Wednesday, 28 March 2018 5:25 PM

To: Shu Pei [LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com<malito:shupei@lkkauto.com>>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping. com<mailto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YLE8176P (Ol : CTI - SNM18D01528C02) AND SKK8088G (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI118005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

Dear Sirs,

Kindly refer to the above attachment.
15



Case Handler: Irene Tay

Regards,

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3, Anson Road, #16-00

Springleaf Tower,

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6181

Fax: 6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Email: lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com<http://www.5g.cntaiping.com/>

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupel@lkkauto.com)]

Sent: Friday, 23 March, 2018 3:50 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Irene Tay; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Zaini (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YLB176P (Ol : CT| - TBA) AND SKK8088G (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18005408/Upb3) on 22.03.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
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_Dear 5ir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This Is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle SKK 8088G at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

- TP GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197,

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupel@lkkauto.com<mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

I Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405 / 67465376 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 2000062621

Date 28.03.2018

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Clmim Department
Dear Sir'Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES :  SKK S088G / YL 8176F ON 22.03.2018

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: SKK 8088CG | which was involved in
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no: YL 81761 The vehicle owner has requested and
authorized us 1o assist him in presenting hisher claim against the party responsible for the damage 1o the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of vour insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
vour consideration on behall of the owner/claimant

I} Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) s 4.601.00

2} Loss of Rental (2 days X 55180) 5 360,00

3) GIA Search Fee ] 2.00
5 4.963.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

#) Final Repair Invoice b) Car Rental Invoice / Agreement

c) GIA Search Result d) Letter of Authorisation, eic...

e) GIA Report ) 1VC & Driving Licence

£} Insurance Cerificate h) Vehicle Registration Log Card

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s cloims
as s00n os possible,

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury elaim (ifany) of the owner/clnimant,

I'hamk you
Yours faithfully,

\

Jason Tang (jason@ fisdechauto com.sg)
For Fastech Auto Pie Lid
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Our Ref: CC6/CTI18005408/Upb3
(4 APRIL 2018

BUILDERS-TECH CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD
3 PEMIMPIN DRIVE

#035-05 LIP HING INDUSTRIAL BUILDING
SINGAPORE 576147

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir'Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YL 8176P AND SKK 8088G ON 22/03/2018

We refer to the above subject matter, We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with
the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SKK 8088G against vour insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this lener.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithiully,

oty

CHEW HSIAD TONG

Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht(@lkkauto.com

c.¢.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid
fMotor Claims Dept)
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owner of vetiicleno. Mtk 8886 ' in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO

PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle _ oLf 1081 £l at my/our instruction and hereby
authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settlement whatever

amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal
proceedings, if necessary. under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use,
etc. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I/'We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against the above-mentioned claim cost
which may arisen therewith.

Signature of Owner

Name of Owner :
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MOTCR CLATMS DISCHARGE ?q_ﬂ_i':_!iE_&

Palicy Nao ; DMCVENIO4E141703 Claim Ho : SHNMIEDO1SZECOZ
Claimant ONG GHEE TECK
Amount :  S554,900.00

Singapore Dollars Four Thousand Nine Hundred Only

I/We agree to accept the abeve mantioned amount to be pald to me/fus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident lavolving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SKK BOSSG
Insured Vehicle No. : YL B176P

Date of Loss : 22/03/2018
Place of Accldent : WOODLANDS AVE &

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforemsntloned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE! PTE. LTD., I/We agres absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Name : BUILDERS-TECH COMSTRUCTION PTE LTD
Deiver MName i SELVARAJ VAIKUNDARAJIAN

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/fus arising out of the saild accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admimsion of liability an the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE] PTE. LTD.

{1] Global Sum 5% 4,900.00
POTRLE . o v wimin i o % % 5 3 ow BB 4,900.00
Claimant Hame : l].mi Bhw TEC}L HRIC No : Eqﬁlhésl‘ E_

Signature 1 / Date s 1l |Dﬂ! 1q(



TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Tax Invoice - 20206
China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Lid

3 Anson Road Date 28032018
£16-00 Springleal Tower Vehicle No  SKK BOB8G
Singapore 079909 Muke/Model  TOYOTA ESTIMA
Chassis/Engd
Attn : Mator Claim Department Accident Date  22.03.2018
Clam No
Reference 0318 -20206
Palicy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair S$ 4300.00
E. & O E. Total : S% 4300.00
GST (@ 7% : S§ 301.00
Amount Due = S8 4601.00

for FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
All Invoices are subjected to GST



DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

I Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883
Tel No: 6741 7244 /6746 5405 Fax No: 6745 8520/ 6746 5786

Co. Reg No: 52928467K

To: ONG GHEE TECH Invoice - DCR-2018-03-17

Date : 24.03.2018
Agreement No : 20505
Payment Term | LOD

. DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle : SJ5 2873R { D31B-20206 ) 5 360.00
Rental Period from 22.03.2018 to 24.03.2018
E.£0.E. Total $ 360.00
Lina Pang

for Dynamic Car Rental



Dynamic Car Rental

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, #01464850 AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417883

TEL: (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405

Co. Rag. No. 52928467K

RENTAL TEAMS AND CONDITIONS

FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 6746 5786

No. 20505
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Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
.= RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
mm 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
'WE Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Dperating Hours: Monday 1o Friday Sam to S5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Refl No GR-1B8-043470
Date of Request. 22/03/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pl Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue & #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Dear Sir'fMadam),

Enquiry Date 2210372018

Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee. Allan

TP Vehicle No YLB17T6P

Accident Date 22/042018

Enguiry Resull

TP Vehice No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel, No.
YLB1TGP China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. 1310/2017-12110/2018 B3B8 6111
Thank You.

The images provided fo you are taken from the onginal reports forwarded (o the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no fiability whatsoaver for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or thelr Images

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

hitps:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ... 22-Mar-18



Invoice

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref No: GR-18-043470
Date of Request. 22/03/2018

Kim Chwes Aulo Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kak Bukit

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No Online Purchase

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Oparating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Singapore 417883

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 22/03/2018

Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee. Allan

TP Vehicle No. YLB176P

Accident Date 22/03/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amouni D.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is 8 computer generaled documeant and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:

Date:

[%] GIRQ [ ] Cash [ ] Cheqgue
https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfim?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ... 22-Mar-18



