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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 28, 2018 1:28 PM

To: KHOO, Weiboon

Cc: SUR; Evelyn Lim; Chan, Peggy

Subject: RE: GIA report XD5267J

Our Claim ref: NSV1800145 

Dear Wei Boon, 

Thank you for the update. 

 

 

Regards  

Stella Goh  

Claims Analyst  

Claims Group  

Global Markets  

   

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd  

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914  

T: +65 6423 0857  

F: +65 6423 0864  

E: stella.goh@awac.com  

W: www.awac.com 

 

From: KHOO, Weiboon <weiboon.khoo@airliquide.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 27 March 2018 3:03 PM 

To: Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com> 

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com; Evelyn Lim <evelyn.lim@aon.com>; Chan, Peggy <Peggy.Chan@awac.com> 

Subject: Re: GIA report XD5267J 

 

Hi Stella, 

 

We had informed Public Trailer Ptd Ltd to claim against third party on the repair cost. 

 

 

Regards 

Wei Boon 

 

 

On Tue, Mar 27, 2018 at 2:46 PM, Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com> wrote: 

Our Claim ref: NSV1800145 

  

Dear Wei Boon, 
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We refer to our email dated 26.03.2018. 

  

Please do let me know whether XD 5267 J is claiming against third party as we are still holding onto the own damage 

authorization. 

  

Hope this clarifies. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Regards  

Stella Goh  

Claims Analyst  

Claims Group  

Global Markets  

   

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd  

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914  

T: +65 6423 0857  

F: +65 6423 0864  

E: stella.goh@awac.com  

W: www.awac.com 

  

From: Goh, Stella  

Sent: Monday, 26 March 2018 2:00 PM 

To: 'KHOO, Weiboon' <weiboon.khoo@airliquide.com>; sur@lkkauto.com 

Cc: Evelyn Lim <evelyn.lim@aon.com>; Chan, Peggy <Peggy.Chan@awac.com> 

Subject: RE: GIA report XD5267J 

  

Our Claim ref: NSV1800145 

  

Dear Wei Boon, 
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We refer to our earlier tele-conversation. 

  

As mentioned, if XD 5267 J wishes to claim against own damage, there would be an excess of $ 2,500 applicable. 

  

Your workshop would assist you on this $ 2,500 excess recovery against the insurer of PC 722 W. 

  

However if you wish to proceed with third party claim, you may get your workshop to advise you. 

  

Hope this clarifies. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Regards  

Stella Goh  

Claims Analyst  

Claims Group  

Global Markets  

   

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd  

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914  

T: +65 6423 0857  

F: +65 6423 0864  

E: stella.goh@awac.com  

W: www.awac.com 

  

From: KHOO, Weiboon <weiboon.khoo@airliquide.com>  

Sent: Monday, 26 March 2018 11:44 AM 

To: sur@lkkauto.com 

Cc: Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com> 

Subject: GIA report XD5267J 

  

Hi Janic, 
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Please see attached for the GIA report. 

Report indicated Third Party Claim. 

  

  

--  

Best Regards 

Khoo Wei Boon (Mr) 

Senior Executive Fleet Maintenance 

 

Air Liquide Singapore 

Private Limited 
24 Jalan Buroh  

Singapore 619480 

Main: +65 6268 3788 

DID:  +65 6496 5919 

Fax:  +65 6262 1752 

  

  

  

  

  

The information contained in this e-mail and any attachments hereto is confidential. If you are not the intended 

recipient, you must not use or disseminate any of this information. If you have received this e-mail in error, 

please immediately notify the sender by reply e-mail and permanently delete the original e-mail (and any 

attachments hereto) and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this e-mail and any attachments hereto are 

believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received 

and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is 

accepted by Allied World Assurance Company Holdings, GmbH or its subsidiaries or affiliates, either jointly 

or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 

 

 

 

 

--  
Best Regards 
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Khoo Wei Boon (Mr) 

Senior Executive Fleet Maintenance 

 

Air Liquide Singapore 

Private Limited 
24 Jalan Buroh  

Singapore 619480 

Main: +65 6268 3788 

DID:  +65 6496 5919 

Fax:  +65 6262 1752 

 

 
 

 

 


