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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 October, 2018 9:41 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Taufikh (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Accident Involving GY9032J with PA8290G on 19/03/2018 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/ASM18005331/T1ua3

Attachments: GY9032J_19032018_DV.pdf

Hi Ms Thin Thin, 
 
Please find attached signed DV. 
 
 
Thank You 
Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 
  
 
 
 
On Tue, 23 Oct 2018 at 17:02, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Dear Susan, 

 
We refer to the below matter. 

  

Please duly sign the document enclosed and return to us for our necessary action. 
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“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an 

admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice 

engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other 

related claims.” 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933 

  

  

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 4:24 PM 
To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; 
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving GY9032J with PA8290G on 19/03/2018 *** LKK REF: 
CC4/ASM18005331/T1ua3 

  

Hi Ms Thin Thin, 

  

Please assist to forward us with the Discharge Voucher. 

 
 

Thank You 
Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 
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On Fri, 19 Oct 2018 at 12:12, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Yes, we agree.  

 
 

Thank You 
Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Fri, 19 Oct 2018 at 11:59, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Hi Susan, 

  

We refer to the below matter. 

  

On a without prejudice, for a quick and amicable settlement, we propose the settlement at Global Sum S$ 
1,840.00 (all-in).  

   

Please confirm acceptance. 



4

  

  

  

  

  

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as 

an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without 

prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in 

any other related claims.” 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933 

  

  

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 16 October 2018 1:33 PM 
To: 'sinsheng engineeringservices' <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> 
Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; 
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving GY9032J with PA8290G on 19/03/2018 *** LKK REF: 
CC4/ASM18005331/T1ua3 

  

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Dear Susan, 

  

We refer to the below matter. 
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Kindly hold the case and we will revert back to you by this week. 

  

Thanks. 

  

  

  

  

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as 

an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without 

prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in 

any other related claims.” 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933 

  

  

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 16 October 2018 1:04 PM 
To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; 
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving GY9032J with PA8290G on 19/03/2018 *** LKK REF: 
CC4/ASM18005331/T1ua3 

  

Hi Ms Thin Thin, 

  

We refer to the above. 
Despite several reminder, 
unfortunately we still had yet 
to received any 
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response from your end.  
 
We have no choice and to 
close the file on our end and 
will pass back the case to 
our client, any action taken 
by our client are not related 
to us. 

  

Thank You 
Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Thu, 13 Sep 2018 at 12:13, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear All, 

  

FINAL REMINDER 

  

We refer to the above. Despite several reminder, we had yet to received any response. 

  

We could appreciate if can get your response end of 20/09/2018, failing which we have no choice and to close the file on our end.  

  

And will pass back the case to our client, any action taken by our client are not related to us. 

  

 
 

Thank You 
Regards 
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Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

On 2 August 2018 at 12:55, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear All, 

  

2nd reminder  

  

Please assist to revert us with the liability issue/offer if direct settlement is in order. 

  

 
 

Thank You 
Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

On 11 July 2018 at 13:20, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Ms Thin Thin, 
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1st reminder  

  

Kindly assist to revert us with the liability issue/offer if direct settlement is in order. 

  

 
 

Thank You 
Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

On 6 June 2018 at 14:45, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Ms Thin Thin, 

  

We are agreed. 

  

Attached LOC document and ATA for your attention please. 

  

Kindly assist to revert us with the liability issue/offer if direct settlement is in order. 

  

 
 

Thank You 
Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
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3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

On 6 June 2018 at 13:29, Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Susan, 

  

We refer to the below matter. 

  

Our surveyor have finalise COR at L/S $1,250.00 with 3 days, finalize amount subject to our 
principal approval. 

  

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents for us (LKK) to 
proceed on negotiate settlement. 

  

  

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be 

construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of 

our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should 

it be binding in any other related claims.” 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933 
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 6 June 2018 1:17 PM 
To: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
<Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving GY9032J with PA8290G on 19/03/2018 *** LKK REF: 
CC4/ASM18005331/T1ua3 

  

Dear Sir / Madam,  

Thank you for your email.  

   

Please note that: -  

  

LKK ref Officer in charge 

CC4/ASM18005331/T1ua3 Thin Thin – 6841 2360 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 6 June, 2018 12:10 PM 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving GY9032J with PA8290G on 19/03/2018 *** LKK REF: 
CC4/ASM18005331/ua3 
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Hi Mr Taufikh, 

  

Final reminder for the finalized. 

  

Please assist to have your finalized end of this 11/06/2018, failing which our client's request us pass the case the 
to solicitor firm to handle. We trust that will not be necessary.  

  

 
 

Thank You 
Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

On 28 May 2018 at 11:00, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Mr Taufikh, 

  

2nd reminder for the finalized. 

 
 

Thank You 
Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 
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On 17 May 2018 at 11:55, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Mr Taufikh, 

  

Please refer attached and have your finalized. 

 
 

Thank You 
Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> 
Date: 27 March 2018 at 10:17 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving GY9032J with PA8290G on 19/03/2018 *** LKK REF: 
CC4/ASM18005331/ua3 
To: "Rasul (LKK Auto)" <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: "Thin Thin (LKKAuto)" <thinthin@lkkauto.com>, Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>, 
assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Hi Mr Rasul, 

  

Please find attached photo. 

 
 

Thank You 
Regards 
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Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

On 21 March 2018 at 18:14, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that we are currently pending verification for direct settlement. 

  

Fyi, OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 

  

  

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Thin Thin at 

6841 2360. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

Meanwhile, please arrange appointment for survey. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 20 March, 2018 9:52 AM 
To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg> 
Subject: Accident Involving GY9032J with PA8290G on 19/03/2018 

  

Dear Officer Incharge, 

  

We are repairer of motor vehicle GY9032J . Enclosed Accident Statement and LTA search fee for your attention please. 
Kindly assist to arrange for the Pre-Repair Inspection to be conducted within two (2) workings days upon received this 
email. 

Kindly let us have your list of 10 norminated surveyors to conduct the Single-Joint Inspection. 

Kindly assist to revert the liability issue or offer if direct settlement is in order 

  

 
 

Thank You 
Regards 

 

Susan 

Sin Sheng Engineering Services 

3 Tech Park Crescent 

Tuas Tech Park 

Singapore 638129 

Tel: 6863 9595 

Fax: 6863 6477 
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