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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 19-03-2018 Our Ref No. D18002225MFSH

Accident Date 15-03-2018 Claim Type. Third Party

Insured Vehicle SHBE21TY Third Party Vehicle. SLA4S00OD

Survey Location KIA SERVICE CENTRE 208 PANDAN GARDENS

Contact Person. TAY JIAN YE

Contact No. 65684501/ 0 Fax No. 65651240

Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

Aupliste LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Surveyor

Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315

Contact Number. NA

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST
CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA
& " I
Cc : Workshop FTE LTD Attention. NIL
Ce : TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge JOANNEY

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 'days for re-inspaction,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

This is a computer generated latter, no signature required
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Claim Workflow System
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PRI Header Details
|
Claimant
Claim No D18002225MFSH Policy No D-18088936MFSH S.No & 18 CYCLE&
Name
CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA | Survey KIA SERVICE CENTRE 209 PANGAN GARDENS
‘Workshop | FTE LTD Location :
Nama (Contact Persan : TAY & Contact Mobile: 0 , Phone: 65684501 » Fax: 85651240
' H JTAS i COM,
JIAN YE) Detalls Emailld: JIANYE TAY@CYCLECARRIAGE.CO 5G
Our LKK AUTG CONSULTANTS Instructions ]
Surveyor PTELTD Ta Surveyor WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
[
COMFORT TP
Insured : Insured
Nmie TRANSPORTATION PTE Vehicle No SHBE217Y Vehicle SLA4900D
o Na
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved | 20-03-2018 06:32:28 PM Appointed 21-03-2018 09:13:47 AM Accept 21-03-2018 0
Blte Date Date
Survey Report Upload
Upload
Surveyor I
Surveyor Survey
Irspection | | 21-03-2018
R
Date : A, I Report Date 5':!pnr't
Vehicle Particulars
Mike 'Please Select Make ¥| | Model | Please Select Model v | Year | Select Year v
Chasis No | | Engine No | | Mileage I
Cubic
Color | A [
Multiple Documents Upload
| I:.F_ploﬁ;lultiple D-‘GEI_.IH'-IEI'IEII
File Name Actlon

Surveyor Jub Remarks

Remarks

l

ntts Miclaims. com. S001/ClaimWS/SurveyorDetails 236083

17”2



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

=
Erom; Nivitha (LKK Auta) <admin-d@lkkauto.coms
sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 4:15 PM
To: 'Claim Workflow System’; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOMSG: 'SUR’'
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - [318002229MFSHA

[¥ear Sir/Mdm,
Please be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner slready withdraw claim,

We will close this file at our end without billing.

EEST REGARDS,
G Nivitha | Admin
L KK Auito Consultants Pie Lid

Phame: 6841-1072 | smnil: usignments@|kkasto com | fax; 6256-4315

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubj Avenue 1, #02-25 | S4oBaqs)

From: Nivitha {LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com)

Sznt: Wednesday, 21 March 2018 2:25 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirsteapital.com.sg>: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: JCMNNE‘I’DNE@MSF!RST‘C#P[TALEDM.SG; 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002 229MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assigament.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BIST REGARDS,

G Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 68419072 | email: sisignmentsiolklauto dom | fax 62564515

Bl 51, Pava UbQ Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Claim Warkflow System [mailto:ewsmotorclaims @msfirsteapital com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 March 2018 9:13 AM

To: J&S‘T?.FGNM ENTS@LEKAUTO.COM

SMOTOR MS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.SG; JOANNEYONGEMSFIRSTCAPITAL.CO
Subject: PRI SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002229MFSH/1

Dzar Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team
Claim Workflow System



Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fux : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
Www. avg.com



