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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg, Mo 199607 198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Ref : CC3/CTI18005278/R1hb3
2 PRINGLEAR TOWERSINGAPORE 079908 Des;  g1Regie M“M“IWIN”“M
Code: CTI
b i Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJP 1451Y Veh. Inspected SHD 38097
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 21/03/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mim
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  19/03/2018 ilnspel::tlnrl Date 20/03/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD
50 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508965
5a. Remarks

23THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




Consulirs

Pia L #d Company Reglstration Mo, 195607193R
SELHEANVE L f02- 25 PAY A URTINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 405933 TEL @ (65 625635601 FAX 1 (065 61564315
Yourref:  To Be Advised Date: 20.03.2018

Our ref: CC3HCTHIRNE278/R 1hb3

The Motor Claims Department
Mis CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (5) FTELTD

Dear SirfMadam.:
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. 3609
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 20.03.2018

at the premises of M/s ComfornDelGro Engineering Pie Lid _and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 5% 6,003.52
Revised Estimate Amount R h 2,689.04
"Check” Ttems Amount 1 3% -
Marke! Value ;Sh -
LTA Reimbursement Value 53 -
MNen Value a5 -

Description of Damage: [
The vehicle sustained damages at the | g 3 ™
O/S Rear Portion T

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3 days

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. RASUL
Licensed Appraiser



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

B . e e e W

From: Angie Foo <angie foo@sg.cntaiping.com:

Sent: Friday, 23 March 2018 4:48 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAUta)

Cc Chong Boon Sen; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: QUR REF: SNM18D01437C02/1/LKKDS & ¥R REF: SHD3699Z (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTIN8005278/R1hb3)on 19.03 2018

Attachments: MSAT18036856-SIP1451Y pdf; EMAIL REQUEST ARCA pdf; SNM18D01437C02

20180323 TO INSURED -LKK ASSIGNMENT LTR pdf

Dear 5hu Pei,
We refer to yvour email of 21° March 2018
We attached a copy of our Assignment Letter and Insured’s SAS Report for your necessary action.

Please be advised that the ¢ laim handle for this case is Chong Boon Sen 6382 6171,

Thank you,

Regards,

Angie Foo

Executive

Muotor Divisian

Claims Departmant

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple Lid
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079209
Co.Reg.No.200208384E

DID: 6369 6186

Fax: 6224 7478 /6224 7175

Email: angie.foo@sg.cnfaiping,com
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sq.cntaiping.com

Dueclaimer

This massage is confidential, i1 cor
agreement between vau and Shina T [
orakibiad. IF you are not the inlended recipient of the message, please nolify [he sender immeaiarely

& wrihien

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 March, 2018 5:26 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT|

Ce: Chong Boon Sen; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJP1451Y (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SHD3699Z (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18005278/R1hb3)on 19.03.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Boon Sen,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHD 3699Z at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte
Ltd (Loyang).

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.
Thank you

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupaifolkkaute com | fax: 5741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubki industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408333)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hup://www symanteccloud.com
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Our Reference: SNM18D01437/C02/1
Date : 23 MARCH 2018 via Ordinary & Registered Mail

BK LIMOUSINE

1 BUKIT BATOK CRESCENT
#04-25 WCEGA FLAZA
SINGAPORE 658064

Dear Sir/ Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING S5JP1451Y AND SHD36997 ON 19 MARCH 2018
ALONG HAVELOCK ROAD

We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, SHD3699Z  is filing a third party property
claim against your vehicle.

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf
and they will contact you for more information about the accident.

Kindly render your assistance and co-operation accordingly.
Yours truly,
Claims Department

(This is a computer generated letter and no signature is required.)

CC @ LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Attr VIC

Ref TP ' LKK REF - CC3/CTI18005278/R1hk3
Contact No © 6841 23580

vig Email :  vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

CC - Agent - (AND47EA) - INSURE HUE PTE LTD

FO1/LKKDS-2013



Date/Time: 19.03.2018 15:44 Fage . 1

Team: ARC Repair TP(CLSO)1 JOB CARD sales Order: Jono305126429
JSTOMER ' ' - | rean %36992 | MILEAGE

e CDHFGI_;E:[%‘%;;-I;SPDRTATIDN FTE LTD T . e
jﬁ;"’ﬁ"“:‘”ﬁha SIN MING DRIVE P _ ETilE—-F—

Singapore SINGAPORE 575717 ‘1-40 190372018 11:45

! 65508755

L o® 1 YROF Tﬁili 5 2016 TARGET DATE

o) e !
CHAS COMELETION DETETIME:
SCBUNT BARDNG: . “RitB41 uMHU097200
JOB DESCRIPTION

Accident Date: 19.03.2018

NATURE: 3P 19.03.2018

S/NO LABOE CODE DESCRIFTICHN
4ECKED & PASSED OUT BY:

SERVIGE ADVISOR CUSTOMER'S SIGNATURE
wwledgement Shp : Exit Pass
2,
o ..  SHD3699Z CHIANG @ st SHD3699Z
0

8 of Service Advisor Signature/Tate Mame of Sarvice Advisor Date
& relurned 1o Service Reception upon collection To ba.kept by Securty Guard




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE*

VEHICLE NO : SHD 36997

Pl

DATE lﬂa’?,flﬂlﬂ 15:23

({, e I

MAKE i ( (A €
MODEL : HYUNDAL i40 { \
Oty Parts Description/ Labour | Type Unit Price J.-*nmuunt
Rear Burﬁper - i - §  603.60 | s 603.60 [~
Rear Bumper Clips 10 pes S 22.00 ‘NA/F
Rear Fender (RH) $ 2.020.10 R
Rear Fender Inner Lining (RH) § 16440 [ XL
Rear Windscreen Moulding 5 60.00 )( nn
Rear Door (RH) % 1,351.10 1"4'/-—
Rear Wheel Hup-Cap (RH) 3o §  150.70 ST
151 %
SUB TOTAL $ 437190
LESS 20% 249 |5 Teras
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 3,497.52
Rear Bumper Advertisement Logo 5 50.00 Netd*” ~
Rear Windscreen Sealant 5 46.00 :\‘ett)(nﬁ
Rear Door Advertisement Logo (RH) $ 100.00 | Nett me
Rear Door Comfortdelgro & Apps Sticker (RH) 5‘65'\ " 5 pleB0.00 Nelupn;—b
ol - §  276.00
LEK Auto Consy Ira ts hence natify
the Repairer of the following:
.:':' '15"'_““! o fidr spray painitin
2 :-r.w.; irly survey is onla "Without Prejudics” basis
Labour Charge s sujct 2 ! approfa o el :Eaﬁuanr
iy ot ¢ ssenl|¥50
ancl Beating e :
Spray Painting Charge Sati 3 750 4o
Wiring Charge T S 50.00 P&
Tuff Kote (‘2@@ s 50004
Remove/Refix Cushion & Upholstery Rear [ mﬂjy b 1 ;9“0'6 EU
Remove/Refix Rear Windscreen Glass LHD ‘Tﬂ'ﬁ 3 120,00 I
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor C{ﬂ)]& S 12000 Ge X
Transfer of Door |. -) Lm, \"" 5 S 12 é o
Rear Wheel Alignment T 5 1200 é o
TOTAL LABOUR ul [i’(” SV $ 2,230.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL ? SV S W'\}[ S 6,003.52
/ (!8 Gl OY
This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair juantum will
be prepared after the vehicle is surveved by a motor Survevor appointed by the insurance company.




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

R

MATE*

VEHICLE %0 : SIID 36997

el

DATE IWSW
MAKE
MOBEL : HY UNDAL i40 /{ EIIL‘ 'C(
Qiy Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price ﬁmuunt
Rear Bumper S 603,60 R«
Rear Bumper Clips 10 pes 5 22.00
Rear Fender (RH) § 202010
Rear Fender Inner Lining (RH) § 164,40
Rear Windsereen Moulding s l'!, s 5
Rear Door (RH) e $ - 1,351.10
Rear Wheel Hup-Cap (RH) o/, S 150,70 Sl
4
1 219 0% SUB TOTAL ' i_];n*{ S 437190
1lerwv LESS 0% 5 87438
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 5 349752
1Yo rea
#-___'__,.,--""
L6 ewlf
Rear Bumper Advertisement Logo 9 ho $ 5000 le'\"‘ i
Rear Windscreen Sealant - b3 46.00 Nﬂtﬂ
Rear Door Advertisement Logo (RH) $ o 100,00 |Nett S
Rear Door Comfortdelgro & Apps Sticker (RH) 5 §0.00 Nﬂ'lu/.-;_,-
5 276.00
Labour Charge
Panel Beating s ‘51-)'0[]/ WD'
Spray Painting Charge " b3 'i‘;ﬂfﬂtr f{‘o -
Wiring Charge ”_"R!i’u g 50.00 M
Tuff Kote ({Zﬁ' § 500047 ¢
Remove/Refix Cushion & Upholstery Rear (066¥ s 13000 |80
Remove/Reflix Rear Windscreen Glass LHD ‘Iﬂ“ b3 12000 B
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor [ﬁ T") $ 12060 o X
Transfer of Door \S 5 L& g (= ¥4
Rear Wheel Alignment T ¢ s 12406
TOTAL LABOUR ul o3[ (¥ @ nSY §  2,230.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL ?N'" N S o S 600352

be prepared after the vehicle is surveved by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
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' COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

COMPANY - THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS)

CUSTOMER: 7010043

ADDRESS : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTELTD
383 SIN MING DRIVE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 375717
63308755

JOB / PARTS DESCRIPTION

EART REQUISITION

0001 04-01-0101-0111-G - HYUNDAI BUMPER COVER CLIP

G002 04-01-0103-0595-G 140V C PANEL ASSY-RRE DR RH
0003 04-01-0103-0638-G  140VC CAP ASSY-WHEEL HUB ]

0004 28-01-0103-2013-A  140V3 APP LOGO REAR DOOR 1

JOB NATURE

D000 20-05 REAR BUMPER ADVERTISEMENT

QUQ] 20-05 REAR DOOR ADVERTISEMENT

éi',.-ui T PANEL BEATING

0003 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA

0004 20-00 TUFF COAT ON AFFECTED PARTS.

000s 20-204 REMOVE/REFIX UPHOLSTERY ASST REPAIR
0006 20-02 REMOVE/REFIX DOOR PARTS TO ASSIST REP

L _,ZZ.U’[] 20.00
1 1.351.10

150700 20000

Al

Date: 21.03.2018
[ime: 15:32:21
Page: 1
JOB NO 305126429
REGN NO SHD3G9GY
MILEAGE OOOOO00000
MAKE . HYUNDAI
MODEL R ]
DATE OF REGN 15.12.2016
DATETIME IN 19.03.2018 11:45
ACCIDENT DATE 19.03.201%

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

17.60
20,00 1. 080,88

120.56

ROL00 2.00- 8000

SUB-TOTAL : 1.299.04

50,00
100,00
450,00
540.00
50.00
~ R0.00

60, (0

ey



d COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS)

CUSTOMER: 7010045

ADDRESS : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTELTD
383 SIN MING DRIVE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717
R3508755

JOB /! PARTS DESCRIPTION

Page: 2

JOB NO

REGM NO
MILEAGE

MAKE

MODEL

DATE OF REGN
DATETIME IN
ACCIDENT DATE

Date: 21.03.2018

305126429
SHD3699Z
D000000G00
HYUNDAI

[-40

15.12.2016
19.03.2018 11:45
19032018

OTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

0007 20-08 ADIUST FRONT WHEEL ALIGNMENT

MVA NAME & SIGNATURE
DATE : DATE :

60.00 -

SUB-TOTAL : 1.390.00

FOTAL ¢ 2.689.04

AUTHORISED : YES / NO

SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE



COMFORIDELGRO

ENGINEERING

Our Job Ref Mo © 3105126429
! ] ComforiDelGre Enginesring Phe Lid

Date : 2210318 &9 Loyang Drive Singapore S0E969

— e Faix: G546 8156
FINALIZATION FORM
T LKK Fax -
Attn ¢ RASUI
Vehicle Reg No. SHD36992 19/03/2018

The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned vehicle are as follows:-

i The repair job shall bill ta: CHINA SJP1451Y
2, The finalized amount shall be:
{a)  Spare Parts after List discount £1,299.04 L~
(b}  Labour Charges §1,39000 "
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost AE.EE-EI.DA/""/

"

(¢}  Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less:
Final Lumpsum Repair cost

3. Estimated normal period for repains: 5 working days.

4. We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed if there is no reply from you within 7

working days

§  Thank you for your assistag’c'é.. We confirm the estimates and
= = finalized amou
I !

Signature : Vs Signature .

Name : CHIANG Name . RAWlL

Tel . 62148314 Date j_l.l[u‘iffj"

]

Fax - B5468156

For Official U nl
Document Confirm B
Item Amount Attached [S?gnlatures]: Remarks
Yes or No
1. Rental Rate P/Day YES
2. Loss of Incoms Paid N
3. Survey Fees
4. LTA Search Fae 7.449
5. Medical Fees (on behalf
of driver, if applicable)
Overnun

Remarks;




Vic (LKKAuto)

# = e —TEm e E————

From: Vie (LKKAuta)

Sent: Friday, 27 July, 2018 9:59 AM

To: William Tan Thoo Seng

Cc: Catherine Koh Mui Gek; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Yrref SIP1451Y ourtaxi SHD3699Z doa 19.3.18 - ( PIR attached ) LKK REF
CC3/CTIL8005278/R1hb3n2

Attachments: DV pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear William,
We refer further to our below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured's
part, we have our principal’s mandate and we offer a global sum of £3,460.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward the original copy to us for payment processing.
Thank you.

“plegse note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admissian of ligbility on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only, No reference shall be made to this affer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other reflated matters.

Best Regards,

vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: f741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
!' I'! ', LIt »

SL2R2T SN sype the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended reciptent, Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a viclation of law. Il you pelieve that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments. including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all altachments and any copies thereof, Thank you.

From: Vic [LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 July, 2018 5:37 PM

To: Catherine Koh Mui Gek

Cc: William Tan Thoo Seng; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ¥r ref 5JP1451Y our taxi SHD3699Z doa 19.3.18 - | PIR attached ) LKK REF CC3/CTI18005278/R1hb3n2

Without Prejudice

Dear Catherine,



We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

Please be informed that we are still pending for mandate approval from our principal.
wWe will follow up and will get back for an update/offer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

F SRS e
SLERER wn Saue the Fartht Priot only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the a-mail and all attachments. including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Catherine Koh Mui Gek [mailto:catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 10 July, 2018 9:36 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Yr ref S$JP1451Y our taxi SHD36992 doa 19.3.18 - { PIR attached }

Dear Vic
Our LOD of 6.4.18 refers.

Attached PIR for your reference. Your principal's insured in his accident statement admitted to lane changing. Kindly
settle our PD claim as BOLA 515,

Thank you.

Best Regards

Catherine Koh

Claims Department | ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off : 62148733 | Fax : 62141843

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you
are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and
please be advised thal using, copying. distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed.
Statements pertaining Lo any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComlortDelGro
Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes
only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties.
Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a writlen agreement
signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

2



ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment,

We encourage you to print this only il necessary,

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]



VB V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Req. Mo: 195607198R GST Reg. No 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref . CC3/CTI18005278/R1hb3n2
2 PRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 075909 Die:. Bl2018 lemmmuw
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJP 1451Y Veh. Inspected SHD 36992
Policy No. DMHCSN3071851700 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D01437C02/1 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 20/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 40 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMHUO9T200 Colour BLUE
Odometer 185508 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification MIL
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/80 R16 WEST LAKE 5mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/80 R16 WEST LAKE 5mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/fS REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date 19/03/2018 tlnspaction Date 20/03/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD
50 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508569
5a, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REFAIR: 5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Ubi Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. Mo 109B07198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 36992

Page Mo.:1 of 2

aty Description of Parts Condition ﬁmg} Our ﬁﬁj}ustad
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 603 60
LABOUR
10|REAR BEUMPER CLIFS WECESSARY 2200 22.00
1|REAR FENDER (RH) TO REPAIR SEE 202010 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER INNER LINING (RH] SERVICEABLE 164.40 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NOT MECESSARY &0.00
1|REAR DOOR (RH) BENT 1,351.10 1,351.10
1|REAR WHEEL HUP-CAP {RH) SCRATCHED 180.70 150.70
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -874.38 -304.76
3,497.52 1,218.04
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (SN) MECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) MOT NECESSARY 48.00 -
1|REAR DOOR ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (RH)SN) NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
1 RSENA}F'. DOOR COMFORTDELGRO & APPS STICKER (RH) |NECESSARY 80.00 80.00
[
276.00 230.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 750,00 450.00
BUMPER AND REAR FENDER (RH).
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE 750.00 540,00
WIRING CHARGE. NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
TUFF KOTE. 50.00 50.00
REMOVE/REFIX CUSHION & UPHOLSTERY REAR. 150.00 80.00
REMOVE/REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS. MOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSCR. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TRAMSFER OF DOOR. 120.00 60,00
REAR WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 120,00 60.00
2.230.00 1,240.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,003.52 2,689.04

Report Ref No. CC3/CTI18005278/R1hb3n2
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| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 2689.04]

Report Ref No. CC3/CTI18005278/R1hb3n2
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MOHAMMED RASLUL BIN MOHD YUNUS HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor Autemotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repert is made solely for the use and benafit of tha Client named o e front page of this Repon.

Mo llakility of responsibifite whatsceyer, in conkast of tert, is accepted to any third party who may realy on the Repor whells 6T 10 BArk, SN I
Eeport, in whole or in part, does S0 at his or her own dsk.




