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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya UIbi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 43158
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-95607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref : CS/GAINB005198/R1rd3
ITIRRTI
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date: 20-03-2018
SINGAPORE 039190
Code: GAI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GED 6498M Veh. Inspected SH 9254H
Paolicy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  RACHEL TAN Assign Date 20/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c a
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. | General Information
Accident Date  20/03/2018 Inspection Date 20/03/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
Sa. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




" Ul] Auta

- W Consuttants
Bl BA B Pie Lid

51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065} 62563561 FAX : (5] 61564315

Your Ref: TBA

Our Ref: CS/GAI18005198/R1rd3

The Motor Claims Department
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF _SH 9254H .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle

on 20/03/2018 at the premises of M/s COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 8% 1.080.00
Revised Estimate Amount : 8% 870.00
“Check” Items Amount : 88 <
Market Value : 8% -
.TA Reimbursement Value : 8% -
Nett Value : 8% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the o/s rear portion..

frong

Yours faithfully

RASUL
Automotive Assessor



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

rrom: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 March 2018 12:09 PM

To: Chiang Liat Choon

Cc: Ngian, Kelvyna; LKK Assignments

Subject: RE: Fw:5H9254H v GBD6498M (GA) on 200318
Attachments: img-320114727-0001.pdf

Without Prejudice

Hi Chiang

Qur insured has not reported. We will arrange for PRI on a without Prejudice Basis.

Hi LEK
Please accept assignment. TP PRI request attached.

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Chiang Liat Choon [mailto:chianglc@cdge.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, March 20, 2018 12:02 PM

To: General Claims <GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: Fw:SH9254H THIRD PARTY CLAIMS

Dear Sir,

Altached herewith repair estimate.

Best Regards
Chiang Liat Choon
Taxi Crash Repair ComfortDelGra Engineering Pte Ltd

Off. 62148314 Fax: 65468156
-—— Forwarded by Chiang Liat Choon/cdgeldelgronotes on 20/03/2018 11:51 AM -

From: "ApaosPort-I'V C5570 = =sbs-singnalling@sbstranait. cogm sg=

Ta chiangic@edge, com. sa,
Drate: 20M03/2018 11:48 AM
Subject Scan Data from CDG_LO_AW_AS5570

Number of Images: 10
Attachment File Type: PDF

Device Name: ApeosPort-IV C5570
Device Location:




This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary
information., If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this
message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying,
distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining
te any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro
Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for
discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall ceonstitute
a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to
any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly
authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council = is

committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to print this only if
necessary.

5BS Transit Ltd [Registration Mo. 193206653M]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential. privileged or proprietary information. If you
are not the intended recipient. kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and
please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed.
Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro
Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes
only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties.
Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement
signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment.
We encourage yvou to print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048 W]

The content of this c-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. 1T you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments,



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, March 23, 2018 11:56 AM

To: Tan, Rachel’

Cc 'Mgian, Kelvyna’; SUR

Subject: RE: Fw:SH9254H v GBDA498M (GA) on 200318
Attachments: SH 9254H .pdf

Dear Rachel,

Enclosed preliminary revised for 5H 9254H.
Kindly advice the claim reference.

Thank you.

Fest Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janiceles@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #¥02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, March 21, 2018 9:26 AM

To: 'Tan, Rachel' <Rachel. Tan@sg.gaig.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Ngian, Kelvyna' <Kelvyna Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Fw:5H9254H v GBDE&43EM (GA) on 200318

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkanto,com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Tan, Rachel [mailto:Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 20 March 2018 12:09 PM

To: Chiang Liat Choon <chianglc@cdge.com.sg=

Cc: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; LKK Assignments <assipnments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Fw:SH9254H v GBD6458M (GA) on 200318

Without Prejudice

Hi Chiang
Our insured has not reported. We will arrange for PRI on a without Prejudice Basis.
1



MCDE 15037545 AMominDedGra Engnesnng Ple Lid - Layang

ENTRY DATE & TIME: 200372018 10:18
SLBMITTED BY: Huang XiaoYan

IMPORTANT MOTICE

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

1. Pleass report comrecily the details of the accident o speed up the claims process.
2. This Farm must be completed by he Policyholdar andior the Authorised Driver,

4. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possibla, Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow nsurance compankes K

repudiate policy ability

4 The issue and accaptance of this Fonm by insurance companies is not an admission af policy Eabi

5. Any talse reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

£, This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GlA Records Managamant Ce

archiving and that copias of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parlies.

7. By the lodgemeant of this repon o the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centra and 1o copies o

aforesad.

Date Of Report

Date OFf Accident

Exacl Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

ehicle Registration Mumber
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner
Co Reg No

Emall Address

Mobile Phone Mo

Alternative Phone Mo
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
20/03/2018 10:18
20/03/2018 Q010
GUILLEMARD RD X MOUNTEATTEN RD
SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
SH9254H

COMFORT TRAMSPORTATION PTE LTD
199303821R
FLEETSAFETY@CDGTAXL.COM.SG

OFFICE-65508768

HYLUINDAI
140

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken

Yahicle Category
Insurance Company

MWame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleat Policy

Policy Mumber
Cover Mote Number
Driver

Mame of Driver
NRIC No

Date OF Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Maobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number
EMail Address

MO

THIRD PARTY
TAX]

INDIA INTERMATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

THIRD PARTY FIRE AND/OR THEFT
YES
MCOMOO1S

MOHD GAOUS MARICAN
50603825E

26/07/1946

OUTDOOR

18/11/1965

52 YEARS AND 4 MONTHS
MALE

MOEMAIL

lity on the part of the insurance companies

nitre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (1A for

f tha report being made available

Page 1of 24



Address BLK 270 TAMPINES STREET 21 #04-153
Postcode 520270

\Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OTHER - TAX| DRIVER

vehicle Registration Number of Drivers Own -
Vehicle .

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type OF Accident SIDE SWIPE
Wealher Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

\Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Nurmber of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by

NO
ambulanza?
\Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person{s}

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance. WL
Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reporied to the police? NO
If Yes Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

PLS REFER TO ATTACHED

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES
Ramarks/ Reasons: -

Was there any audio recorded? NO
Vehicle Registration Mumber GBDG498M

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category GOVERNMENT

Mame of Driver ONG MENG TIAM

MRIC/Passport Number FTo89799W

Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY
Nalure Of Damage LEFT FRT

No. Of Passenger {Including Driver)

Page 2 of 24



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Flease report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

7. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material
facts may aliow fnsurance companies to repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Farm by insurance companies ks not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
campanies,

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for nvestigstion.

E. The report will be forwarded by the Insurers of the GiA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapore (G14) for archiving and that coples of this report will for a fea be made avaitable upon applieation by
interested parties,

7. By the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report ot the centre and to copies af
the report, being made avallable aforesaid.

E. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act {PDPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

{a) My insurer, my workshep and the General Insurance Association of Singapore ["GIA"™) may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal Information setout In this (form] and 2ny ather personal Information
pravided by me or possassed by my insurer [collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) wha have insured vehiclels) invalved in this accident [all insurer(s} wha have insured
vehiclels) involved In this accident shall be collectively referred to as the "Insurers”), the Insurers' lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/autherity (such as the police), for the purpose(s}
of :

{l] processing, handling andfor dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

{ii} Investigating the accident and/or my claims;
{lil} carrying cut and/or dealing with my instructions or responding ta any enquiries by me;

{iv} administering my clalms (inchiding the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports of notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/for

{v) complying with applicable law In administering, processing, handling end/or dealing with my clalms. (collectively the
“Purposas”)

{b)  allinsurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

e} my Personal Infarmation may,/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agentsfincluding their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or mare of the above Purposes.

{d)  my Parsonal Infermation will zlso be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
Investlgation and management in present and il future daims.

{e) theinformation so collected under (d) abowe may be shared / disclosed:

(i) toallinswrers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purpesas stated, o7

[ii} fercomplying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD 3%/,5'3/"’3 ’
GO REG NO. 198303821R
Polleyholder's Signature. Driyef's fignature Reporting Centre Persfhpnel's Signature
Date & Tirme: {If driver i3 not the policyholder) Narme:
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN Ne.:
F )
‘_ B 4 &

Paga 3 of 24



Sketch Plan Pg. 2
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

s AON 71/l -

DECLARATION
|fwe declare the foregoing particulars are true in every respect.

COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
CO REG, NO. 189303821R

(DL A

Pq_liwhnldet's Signatura Erlver's Sigrature ) Reporting Cantre P!‘I’Wﬁﬁ! Signature
fate & TireE: {If driver |5 not the poficyhaider) Mame:
Date & Tirme:! WRIC/FIN No.:

Page 4 of 24



Sketch Plan Pg. 3

[

Erﬂ:rihe Circumstances of the Accident.

On 20 mar 2018 at about 00:10 hrs | stopped my taxi on the second lane from the left at the

traffic junction of Guillemard Rd(twds Nicoll Highway) and Mountbatten Rd waiting for the

traffic lights to turn green.

Shortly after the traffic lights turned to green hence | slowly proceeded to drive straight

i?xcruss the junction leading towards Nicoll Highway at the same time maintained my taxi
| e

lwithin my lane.

Sudd e_nlfl felt an impact coming from the ﬁg_ﬁ_:: hand sl-d_a‘rear_uf my taxi followed b a jerk.

’E‘ter the collision | slowed down and stopped my taxi and stepped out to check. Found that

5 Certls Clsco vehicle GBDE498M had come from my right cut into my lane and caused this

accident to happen. In the process, the left hand side front of the vehicle hit and grazed the

r_

right hand side rear door towards the right hand side rear of my taxi.

No passenger on board my taxi. No injury at the point of the accident.

Enclosed is a video footage to support my claims.

Declaration

I/We declare the foregoing particulars are true in every respect.

COMFDRT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTU 03 |%
CO REG. NO. 1992303821R

Policyholder's Signature/Date & _D.ri-f_gr"s Signahd&[lf‘ﬂ—met is not the policyholder|/Date witnessed by'Reporting
Tirme B Tine Centre Persannel

Paga 5 of 24
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:OMFOR]DELGRO ComfortDeiGro Engineering Pte Ltd
- ENGINEERING i

A mernoer of COMFORIDELGRO Date/Time: “20.03;201831:39 Page : 1
leam: ARC Repair TP(CLSO)1 JOB CARD sales Order: Jc no305126831
STOMER AEGH IE'I 9254}1 MILEAGE
i COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD : 572
Srowe 7010045 MAKE ‘HYUNDAT | 2 o ;
FESS  gingapore SINGAPORE 575717 MODELY_40 20.|037501% b8 45
65508755
Cm (o) YROFYENDE o016 TARGET DATE
Py
CHAS: | COMPLETION DATETIRAE:
COUNT GARD NO. fﬁﬁﬁfﬁ41nuﬂﬂﬂ89§?3 I -

JOB DESCRIPTION
becident Date: 20.03.2018
NATURE: 3P 20.03.2018

3/NO LABOR CODE DESCRIPTION

ECKED & PASSED OUT BY:

SERVICE ADVISOR CUSTOMER'S SIGNATURE

wwledgement Ship Exit Pass

et Wahicle No.:

o, SH 9254H CHIANG @ SH 9254H

3 of Service Advisor Signature/Date Mame of Servica Advisor Date

raturned to Service Reception upon collection To be kept by Security Guard




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

}\ '\.?“‘31 WA

REPAIR ESTIMATE =
VEHICLENO : SH 9254H DATE 20/3/2018 10:34
MAKE £ L ey v
MODEL : HYUNDALI i40 WMLV
Oty Parts Description/ Labour Tvpe Unit Price Amount
Rear Fender Advertisement Logo (RH) 5 100.00 |Nett Afr~
Rear Door Advertisement Logo (RH) ) 100,00 [Nett Ad—r
Rear Door Comfortdelgro & Apps Sticker (RH) b 80.00 |Nettgee
b 280.00
Labour Charge 20
Panel Beating-Repair Fender 5 M L
Spray Painting Charge - Door/Fender S SQe-eT 3€o
Tuff Kote S 500617 20
540\
TOTAL LABOUR 5 S00.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL 5 1,080.00

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will

be prepared afier the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS)
CUSTOMER: 7010045
ADDRESS : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD

PART

383 SIN MING DRIVE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717
H5508755

JIOB / PARTS DESCRIPTION

Date: 21.03.2018

Time: 14:48:11
Page: 1
JOB NO 305126831
REGN NG SH 9254H
MILEAGE 0000000000
MAKE HYUNDAI
MODEL 1-40
DATE OF REGN 19.05.2016
DATETIME IN 200032018 0%:45
ACCIDENT DATE 20.03.2018

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

REQUISITION

0001 28-01-0103-2013-A  140V3 APP LOGO REAR DOOR

JOB NATURE

OO0 20-05 REAR FENDER ADVERTISEMENT
0001 20-05 REAR FENDER ADVERTISEMENT
0002 L PANEL BEATING

0003 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA
0004 20-00 TUFF COAT ON AFFECTED PARTS.

MVANAME & SIGNATURE
DATE :

R0.00 0.00 8000

SUB-TOTAL :  BO.00

100,00

10:0.00

200.00

360,00

30,00

SUB-TOTAL 790.00

TOTAL 570.00

AUTHORISED : YES / NO

DATE :

SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE



Qur Job Ref Mo ; 305126831
Date : QG.I'DE‘.."_I_g

FINALIZATION FORM

COMFORIDELCRO

ENGINEERING

ComforDelGro Engineering Pie Lid
L9 Loyang Drive Singapore S0BDE3
Fax: 6546 8156

To LKK Fax:
Attn - RASUL
Vehicle RegNo. : SH9254H 20/03/2018
The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned vehicle are as follows:-
1; The repair job shall bill to: GREAT AMERICAN GBDE498M
2. The finalized amount shall be:
{a)  Spare Parts after List discount $80.00
(b} Labour Charges $790.00
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost $870.00

(e, Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)

Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less:

Final Lumpsum Repair cost

3. Estimated normal periad for repairs:

3

working days.

4, We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed if there is no reply from you within 7

working days

5 Thank you for your assistance,

We confirm the estimates and

finalized amount

Signature : [ = Signature :
Name : CHIANG Mame
Tel . 62148314 Date
Fax . B5468156
For Official Use Only
Document )
Item Amount Attached {CS?HQ;TUE% Remarks
Yes or No 9
1. Rental Rate P/Day YES
2. Loss of Income Paid N
3. Survey Fees
4. LTA Search Fee 749
5. Medical Fees (on behalf
of driver, if applicable)
& Overrun

Femarks




S

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408033
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607196R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref .

3 TEMASEK AVENUE

#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER

SINGAPORE 039180

CS/GAI1B005198/R 1rd3n2

AR

Date: 12-04-2018

Code: GAl

Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. GED 6498M Veh. Inspected 5H 9254H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GBDE498M Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From RACHEL TAN Assign Date 20/03/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMGUDBS693 Colour BLUE
Odometer 307072 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Madification NIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK, 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 5mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 5 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  20/03/2018 Inspection Date 20/03/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD
289 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS,
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




' V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

il BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B255 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SH 9254H
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($) )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR FENDER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (RH}(SN) NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
1|REAR DOOR ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (RH)SN) NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
1|REAR DOOR COMFORTDELGRO & APPS STICKER (RH) |MECESSARY 80.00 80.00
(SN)
280.00 280.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING-REPAIR FENDER, 250.00 200.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE-DCOR/FENDER. 500.00 360.00
TUFF KOTE. 50.00 30.00
800.00 500.00
GRAMND TOTAL 1,080.00 B70.00
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 870.00|
Report Ref No. CS/GAI18005198/R1rd3n2
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




