Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 June, 2018 1:41 PM

To: cheonganthony@yahoo.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLS7140R & SHD3005B on 17 Mar 2018 LKK REF
CC6/11118005169/Khb3

Attachments: DV ATA.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Anthony,
Received original signed docs.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EIES

SERER NWTT Suve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 21 June, 2018 10:37 AM

To: cheonganthony@yahoo.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLS7140R & SHD3005B on 17 Mar 2018 LKK REF CC6/11118005169/Khb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Anthony,

We refer to your below email.



Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured’s
part, we have our principal’s mandate confirm acceptance of your offer of $4,900.00 (all in) to settle your client’s
claim.

Kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward the original signed hard copy to us together with the
Authorization to Act Letter for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to MASSIVE TRADING & AUTO.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EIES

SERER NWTT Suve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 31 May, 2018 8:52 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Accident involving SLS7140R & SHD3005B on 17 Mar 2018

Hi Vic,

FYNA.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Anthony Cheong [mailto:cheonganthony@yahoo.com.sg]
Sent: Saturday, 26 May 2018 11:28 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident involving SLS7140R & SHD3005B on 17 Mar 2018




WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your ref : SHD3005B
Our ref :7140/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We are instructed that the above accident was caused solely by the negligence
of the driver of your insured's vehicle SHD3005B.

We hereby quantify our client's claim as follows in respect of property damage.

COR $ 4,650.00 as per your surveyor's recommendation
LOU @ $ 50/- perday $ 250.00 ( 5days)

Enclosed herewith copies of the following in support of our client's claim.

a Final repair bill
b GIA report of SLS7140R

We thank you for your kind attention and appreciate your early reply.
Best Regards

Anthony Cheong
Claims

Massive Trading & Auto
H/p 91082728



