Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 31 May, 2018 8:52 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Accident involving SLS7140R & SHD3005B on 17 Mar 2018
Attachments: 20180526112001.pdf

Hi Vic,

FYNA.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Anthony Cheong [mailto:cheonganthony@yahoo.com.sg]
Sent: Saturday, 26 May 2018 11:28 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident involving SLS7140R & SHD3005B on 17 Mar 2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your ref : SHD3005B
Our ref :7140/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We are instructed that the above accident was caused solely by the negligence
of the driver of your insured's vehicle SHD3005B.

We hereby quantify our client's claim as follows in respect of property damage.

COR $ 4,650.00 as per your surveyor's recommendation
LOU @ $ 50/- perday $ 250.00 ( 5days)

Total $ 4,900.00

Enclosed herewith copies of the following in support of our client's claim.

a Final repair bill
b GIA report of SLS7140R

We thank you for your kind attention and appreciate your early reply.
Best Regards

Anthony Cheong
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