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' ’d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- _ oW A simmtm-zwmmmmmmwmmm

e B
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: 8256 4315

Rog No: 169607198R GST fag No. 15-9607198-A

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTELTD el CC/AXA14010341/K1N2y3
& SHENTON WAY #27-01SINGAPORE 068811 Data:  0306:20 mmmmn
Code: AXAZ
1. Pollcy Particulars - THIRD PARTY CLAIM
insured Veh,  SFV 2018C Veh. Inspected SHC 44068
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Cialm No. Excass (3) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 02/06/2014
2. Vehicle Particulars & Candition
Make & Model c.e 0
Engine No. WIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer . Stearing
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditlons of Tyres
Size Make Balance
AM Front Tyre mm
L/ Front Tyre mm
A/M Rear Tyre mm
LM Rear Tyre i
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 3110572014 |inspection Date 02/06/2014
Survey held st SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
50 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 SINGAPORE 757705
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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Your ref: To Be Advised
Our ref; CC?:MXAllﬂIDSdI!KIthB Date:  28/08/2014

The Motor Claims Department

M/s AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD

Dear Richard,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHC 44068
We refer (o the above mitler.

th:htinj‘umedthuwchndwndumdth1nspc¢:ﬁunofd1nhnwmnﬁmndwhichnn
02/06/2014 ot the premises of MIs SMRT and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount S$ 1.503.00
Revised Estimate Amount S$ 920,00
“Check" liems Amount : S8 -
S3

S$

- S§

Maurkel Value
LTA Reimbursement Value
Nen Value

Description of Damage: —
The vehicle sustained damages al the L g
N/S Frt Portion J—

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3 days

Y ours faithfully,

Kalvin Ang
Licensed Appraiser



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & [A/Taxis/Claims)
<lLeeGek@smri.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 26 March, 2018 6:04 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: Returned DV Re: Accident on 31/5/2014 involving SHC 44068 & SFV 2918C (Our
Ref: TAX/05/14/2256/1g)

Attachments: img-326175148-0001.pdf

Dear Vic,

We attach the duly signed DV and our hirer’s letter of authorisation for your necessary action,

Please let us have AXA's cheque for $750.00 payable to SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Cloims Departmen?

SMET Automative Services Pte Ltd

-@m

AUTOMODTIVE

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: 26/03/2018 16:32

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & 1A/Taxis/Claims)

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD as requested Re: Accident on 31/5/2014 involving SHC 44068 & SFV 2918C (Our Ref:
TAX/05/14/2256/1g)

Without Prejudice
Dear Lee Gek,
We refer to your below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and in view of a 50/50 settlement, we propose a global sum of
$750.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the enclosed DV then forward back to us a copy together with the Authorization
to Act letter duly signed by the Hirer for payment processing.

Thank you.

“Plecse note thot our above offer ond any settlement arising from the above offer ore mode on o without prejudice basis, ond
should not be construed as on admission of lability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such seftlement
should also not be disclosed in any ather related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Dur offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be mode to this offer or any settiement arising from this offer
in any other reloted motters.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpehir lkkiuto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

¥y
LS REs = Snwe the Earth Frint only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use af the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law, If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do nof
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delste the e-mail and all attachments. including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail. all attachments and any copies thereof Thank you

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims) [mailto:LeeGek@smt.com s8]
Sent: Monday, 26 March, 2018 4:02 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: LOD as requested Re: Accident on 31/5/2014 involving SHC 44068 & SFV 2918C (Our Ref:
TAX/05/14/2256/Ig)

Dear Vic,
As requested.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 68566 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

& SIMRT

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Tan Lee Gek{Auto Svcs/Claims)

Sent: 02/07/2014 18:01

To: CS B Team; Team B

Subject: Re: Accident on 31/5/2014 involving SHC 4406B & SFV 2918C {Our Ref: TAX/05/14/2256/Ig)}

Dear All,

We quantify our claim as follows:-

Cost of repairs $ 920.00
Loss of rental 5 401.25 (5133.75 x 3 days)
Loss of income $ 180.00 (560.00 x 3 days)
LTA search fee S 500

$1506.25

—_————====

We attach the proof of rental, repair bill, laid-up report, GIA report of our taxi and LTA search for your
perusal.

Please let us hear from you soon.



Regards
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647T)

Claims Department
SMRT Autemotive Services Pte Ltd



CoTidvndhk

Vic {LKKAutn!

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & [A/Taxis/Claims)
<lLeeGek@smrt.com.sg»

Sent: Monday, 26 March, 2018 4:02 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: LOD as requested Re: Accident on 31/5/2014 involving SHC 44068 & SFV 2918C
(Our Ref: TAX/05/14/2256/1g)

Attachments: SHC44068.PDF

Dear Vic,

As requested.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6B66 264T)
Claims Department
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

& SmRT

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Tan Lee Gek({Auto Svcs/Claims)
Sent: 02/07/2014 18:01
To: CS B Team,; Team B

Subject: Re: Accident on 31/5/2014 involving SHC 4406B & SFV 2918C (Our Ref: TAX/05/14/2256/Ig)

Dear All,

We quantify our claim as follows:-

Cost of repairs S 920.00 -

Loss of rental S 401.25(5133.75 x 3 days) <

Loss of income $ 180,00 ($60.00 x 3 days) ~ %; :T:

LTA search fee $ 500~ _
$1506.25 G FEO0.09

We attach the proof of rental, repair bill, laid-up report, GIA report of our taxi and LTA search for your
perusal.

Please let us hear from you soon.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMET Automotive Services Pre Ltd
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Our Rel. No.:
Letter of Authorisation
, _Leo Pk Ak (NRIC No.: 364430957 ) e

registered hirer / relief ériver / contraet-hirér of SMRT taxi registration number
SHe Asol B hereby authorise SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
(“AutoSvs") to deal with all matters arising out of the accident between my taxi
and _S¥V 2q18¢c happened on 3! May Jol% 134 hrs:
along “Telolc Efnnq ah Reed %w«—eﬂ Vive Cidy - < "
(the "Accident”) on my behalf, Includlng but not limited to instituting and any
claims or proceedings against such party or parties (as AutoSvs deems fit in its
absolute discretion) in respect of any claim, demand, loss, cost, expense, liability,
damages or action made against us or incurred or suffered by us.

Without prejudice to the foregoing, | further authorise AutoSvs to negotiate,
resolve and settle any proceeding or claim arising out of the accidents, including
but not limited to doing any act or executing any document or signing the
Discharge Voucher on my behalf as may be required. .

i" i{
Name . koo .?"-! ""- b A\"‘- ................ Signature: .
NRIC No. :,...:"‘..fﬁ.ﬁ?r%?.‘@.‘jf? ,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,
Tel No. qml?'ml .....................
Address &% 59 M4 Mo b Ave § Apq-9498
BTG

FR-AS-CLM-03 REV 3



M redefining /insurance

CLAIM REF : CO314804
INSURED ¢ JAYASENA CHINTHANA DESHAPRIYA
DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We, SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD confirm that by letter of authorisation dated > 1 b [[4 we
are authorised to and da hereby give d:h:hlmfwmmdmmdunbdu]fulMTMWSHHm
Pte Ltd and the Hirer, of vehicle no, SHC 44068.

Now we SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD for ourselves and the smd Hirer and the driver jointly
and severnlly:-

a)

b)

cl

agree 10 accept the sum of Singapore Dollars Seven Hundred Fifiy Only (S$750.00) in the aggregute in full
and final settlement of all claims of whatever kind including damages for personal injuries and/or damage
to property that all and any of us may have against AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD and/or their Insured
and/or the driver of vehicle no SFV 2918C arising out of an accident with SHC 44068 on 31/05/2014,

declare that AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD andfor their Insured and/or the driver of the Insured vehicle
shall not be liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever or howsoever present or future that any of us may
have against AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD and/or their Insured and/or the driver of vehicle no. SFV
2918C urising directly/indirectly as a consequence of the accident and hereby give our full and final

discharge.

We hereby declure that L/we am/are the person(s) entitled 1o receive the above settlement and hereby
undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or 0 be made in respect
of this settlement.

It is undersiood and agreed that payment herein is made in favour of SMRT TAXIS FTE LTD is made without
any admission of liability whatsoever on the part of AXA INSURANCE FTE LTD and/or their Insured and/or
the driver of vehicle no. SFV 2918C.

Dated this }ta ll'\.f\jﬂ.l\. 2018

Signed by

Company Stamp £ 7 H“\_"ﬁ

Witness
Name

IAC No

Address 80 Woodlands Industtial Park E4

Singapore
— Tel GBS 6482 J0A8 Fay ESEORR 7@
WWW ST COm.E0

AXA ingurance e Ltd (Company Reg. No. 199903512M)

8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Towet. Singapore DSBE11

Customer Centre #8101

fel: +65 6880 4888 Fax +63 B338 2527 Websie: www.aus com ¢



-um--ﬁ_mw
2 = "J I/ AY] 351 North Sridge Roed ingapors 17910

Tals 65 E3311000 Pax: €3 3140347

Tax Invoice

Customer Code: 3000063 GST Reg No. : MR-8500001-7
=1 CRN : 1990042BDZ
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD Invoice No. IV140600796
Date : 19.06.2014
Block Unit Vehicle No. SHC4406R
Your Ref Ro. : TAX/05/14/2256
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARKE Ed Our Ref No. 24061038
SINGAPORE 757705 Terms ¢ 30 Days
Descriptieon Qty Unit  Add  / (Dimcount) Amount
Cost L Amcunt
Parts
BUMPER FRT 1.00 § 482.00 (100.00) S 482.00 5 0.00
FENDER FRT/LH 1.00 § 723.40 (100.00) $ 723.40 s 0.00
MOULDING BODY, LH 1.00 3 6731.50 P00, 00 5 bTi.60 5 0.00
. Sub-Total 3 o
Labour
TO REPAIR LH FRONT PORTION 1.00 § 250.00 0.00 S D0.00 5 250.00
Othexs
TC APPLY RUST-PROOFING (PER PORTION 1.00 $ 20.00 { 0.00 ) 0.00 L 20.00
540)
TO REPSRAY FRONT BUMPER 1.00 § 250.00 { 0.00) 5 0.00 s 250.00
TO RESPFRAY FRONT FENDER LH 1.00 5§ 250.00 [ 0.00 ) s 0.00 5 250.00
TC RESPRAY ROCKER PANEL MOULDING 1.00 $ 150.00 { 0.00 ) $ 0.00 s 150.00
GRAND Tal 3 320.00
Hemark
Make Mode] T TOYOTA PRIUS
Accident Dare : 1) 05,2014
N.B. Payment by chegus should be crossed and
mads payable to ‘SMRT Automot ive Sarvices Pre Led: . !
Ho receipt will be lesued unless Fegussted | L P

d '_""'\\\ -
Authorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 1/1 E. & 0.E



@smRr

Our Ref : TAX/05/14/2256/LG

Date ;010772014
To : Claims Department
From : SMRT Taxis

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC44068 AND SFV2918C ON 31/052014 ALONG TELOK
BLANGAN RD TOWARDS VIVO CITY

CONFIRMATION OF TAXI RENTAL

This is to confirm the daily taxi rental rate for taxi registration no. SHC4406B is $8133.75/day.

Kindly proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of this accident.

|II' 1".|
(5( A7)
For Manugisr
SMRT Tixis Pre Lud




YIODZ 90 6T ¢ uc paiutad

N¥NSHOd : Aq pajexausd

BEOT90PE
9GZT/PT/SO/XYL ©

T Ivwey

PESTE*OT PT0Z°90°S0 * pejatdwo) Itedsay awrl pue a3ed
00:00:TT PI0OZ'90°Z0 : ITedsy JUSPTOOY I0J PROI-JJO STOTUSA SWL] Pu® 33eBQ

"ON “3JoH SNI¥d ¥YLOAOL * TePON / ®Y®W

‘ON 28®) JUSpPTOOY €g90PPOHS : "ON uotaImialstboy

Jxodey AN-PFI STOTHRA JUEPTIOV

nnss




Page | of |

logoff
Singapore Government
. = irergrty - Seraie - Easfonie
g Ganeni info | Fesgosce | Coniect info
. “MOTORING
Your Feal! Treew T Complate Moinnmg

Balgish Binte Abdul Halil has successfully logged oul.
Your last login date and time was 02 Jun 2014, 14:33.09.
To return to ONE MOTORING, please click here
For security reasons, please CLEAR YOUR CACHE after sach session,

Session Transaction History

S/No. Asset Assetl D Asset Transaction Type Transaction Leg
Type Owner Amount{S§) Date/Time
o
02 Jun
. i 18.32 Insurance Enguiry
1 Vehice SFVZE1BC (GIRO Payment) 535 ?2.1;‘-:‘”!

| aind Ir.ll:u|mr!‘9‘-'nllh Tily

Flease read howgh the Privacy Statement Temms of Uise and Dascaimer
Pleasa do not use the Back or Forward buttons an your browser as this may alter the results of Ihe transactions
Bl varwed with |E 8.0 5P) and abows 1004 X TEA remalution
Copyright © 2014 LTA | Pravecy Statement | Terme of Use | Discleimer | R ihe Websas

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/actionhubCurrent TransactionLogs?FUNCTION ID=F1801... 67272014




Insurance Particulars Enquiry By Agents Detail

Enquire Vehicle Insurance Particulars

Vehicle Search Date/Time Search Insurance Company
No. Status Code

SFVZS18C ?.; rﬁ-&zmu Successful A2

[ Previous | |OK|

Page 1 of |

TExl sirm +

Insurance Company Mame

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE
LTD,

Pisase resd through Be Privecy Siastemant, Terms of Use and Disciaime:.
Please do not use the Bsck or Forwsrd butions on your trowser as his may sier e msults of fo rensactom.
Bast viewsd with IE 8.0 572 and above. 1024 X 780 resclulion
Copynight @ 2014 LTA | Privmcy Statemens | Torme of Lse | Disclaims | Fusls T Vistais

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/Mta/vri/action/insPartDetailByAA?FUNCTION ID=FI801043ET  6/2/2014



Auto
.' .{!{ C:niuf!.ml;
A KA R Pie Lid

Company Registration No. 196607 198R

SPUREAVE bos02-25 PAY A UHLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPMORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62561561 FAX : (065) 62564315

To : Mis AXA INSURANCE PTELTD

Date: 03/04/2018

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

R SFV 2918C (Insd Veh) [Your Ref. No : C0314804
ehicle No.
SHC 44068 (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No. - CC3/AXA14010341/K1ha3q2-1
Date of Accident 31/5/2014
Liability 50%
Final Repair Cost 5 920.00
Loss of Token Sum T ] 180.00 3 days
Rental (If any) '8 401.25 3 days
50% 750.63
Others: ] 5.00
4
4 ]
75563
Final Settlement Sum |: $ 750.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks
Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1)|SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD :$ 750.00
-

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




' V4 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

= 51 Ubd Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapote 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No' 199607188R GST Reg No. 19-9607108-R

Affiliated to Federation Intarnationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Ref . CC3/AXA14010341/K1h2y3q2
8 SHENTON WAY #27-01SINGAPORE 068811 ... 28.10.2014 I”ﬂ.lllllllm
ATTN.JAS TAN Code: AXAZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SFv 2018C Veh. Inspected SHC 44068
Policy No. P1417377 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CO314804 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 02/06/2014
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA PRIUS c.c 1798
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. JTDKN36UT05720923 Colour MAROON
Odometer 52307 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 FALKEN 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |19585R15 FALKEN 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |19585R15 FALKEN 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[18585R15 FALKEN T mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  31/05/2014 Inspection Date 02/06/2014
Survey held at SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
80 WODDLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 SINGAPORE 757705
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|[ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapare 408833
TEL 5258 3581 FAX G256 4315

Automolive Assessoar | Investigator

MBCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIND PARTIER. . This Repodn is mede selaly for (he use snd benalit of the Client namsed an tha ironk page of this Repor.
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Heg. Mo 199807188R GST Reg. No. 18-8807188-R Pape Mo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 44068
Qty Description of Parts Condition “m,”%ﬁ “‘"'ﬁ%‘"""
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER FRT (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 4B2 00
LABOUR
1|FENDER FRT /LH (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 723,40
LABOUR
1|MOULDING BODY LH (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE BT360
LABOUR
1,878.00
LABOUR
TO REPAIR LH FRONT PORTION INCLUSIVE OF THE 807.00 250,00
REPAIR OF BUMPER FRT FENDER FRT /LH AND
MOULDING BODY LH
TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER | 378.00 250.00
TO RESPRAY FRONT FENDER LH 378.00 250.00
TO RESPRAY ROCKER PANEL MOULDING 200.00 150.00
TO APPLY RUST-PROOFING (PER PORTION 540) 40.00 20.00
1,503.00 820 00
GRAND TOTAL 3, 382.00 820.00
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS ] [ | '920.00]
Report Ref No. CC3/AXA14010341/K1h2y3q2
KALVIN ANG WEI KUN



