Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svecs/Claims & 1A/Taxis/Claims)
<LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 26 March, 2018 4:02 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: LOD as requested Re: Accident on 31/5/2014 involving SHC 4406B & SFV 2918C
(Our Ref: TAX/05/14/2256/1g)

Attachments: SHC4406B.PDF

Dear Vic,

As requested.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@smnr

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Tan Lee Gek(Auto Svcs/Claims)

Sent: 02/07/2014 18:01

To: CS B Team; Team B

Subject: Re: Accident on 31/5/2014 involving SHC 4406B & SFV 2918C (Our Ref: TAX/05/14/2256/1g)

Dear All,

We quantify our claim as follows:-

Cost of repairs S 920.00
Loss of rental S 401.25 ($133.75 x 3 days)
Loss of income S 180.00 ($60.00 x 3 days)
LTA search fee S 5.00

$1506.25

We attach the proof of rental, repair bill, laid-up report, GIA report of our taxi and LTA search for your
perusal.

Please let us hear from you soon.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd



