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GIA/LTA Search T - | = Yev—

Medical s§ = 1} Coabtn stutese: [Frivate Settle
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Legal Cost 5§ ~ HSuvey e {5 2) A WID

Tiotal: o | . Global Sum 55:
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REF:

G

ASSIGNMENT
From Date e PA2Z2'EY.  yepeg 2000 L
Esfimated Cost Type: W.Car | M.Cycle | Bus | Van | Lorry | Taxi | Prime Mover |
OD/TPIWSITPRESIODRESIEVALNVINY Truck I Traleror  /Mend TS
To Inspact Vehicle No: Maxe 'TYM' ‘Rosc ::ﬁf}.lq'._
at Workshop s easr  Silees MG insured/SidINI/NA
of SpRasdng  SULINLD * TRadio Insured | Std 1 NI/ NA
Insured: EngNo:
Palicy No. CINo: BF L3 hBonST T
Ciaims No. Gmcmu@dlmwmunm
Sn.mlnaumd? . - Ex;nss: R Stesring: Ingrdér | Jammed | Leaked | Burnt of )
(Cllents Record) e / Jammed | Laaked | Burnt or .
Maka of Vih: Modi : S/Rim | STD A/Rim or .
. Tyre Size: F: J-"f/?s E!?’S’ -
(Policy Conditon) ' R AF[ERITS ]
Remark: The veh had commenced its NS | OS5 | | BS/DUNIEXNOVA I GY /FS/LIZA [ MIC | OHTSU | PIR | SUMI!
repair at the time of inspection. TOYO/YOKQ or auble Coy . -
Bal. or Market Value: Eront Rear
IDAC Accident Rport Consistent?  Yes or No. RH__S% il e () -
GlA /PR Seen  Consistent?:YesorNo LiBal i s © o
EstRepars DV days  Res: Yes or No DOA Dol I?Zuyi
Lum Samm: P2 S 3Val: Yes or No Surwriml_ut o T-mMeact
dik 1. REV 1 DL 1 SA s Des. of Damages  Frt | Rear [ OIS I(NS)/ UIC | Rooftop o
Vehicle: IN/OUT
Date: Person Contacted: The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affscted dus to collsion.
Dale | Time | Action | Insiruction B
ol | TP Aly i (:fﬁ - E?JM 3119'.’10 B
N _Us D6 Ry ol uw:uT m -
.r?m;_. el =
Aelf - S

DeatodTime. Fiie Pass 17 : Prell. Report

] . : Final Report
DuibeTima Flla Retiom o7

s |
Report Format
Lump Sum / LB.L: (5

Days Of Repair:
Resurvey No. of Trip: 'SurveyFee: | .
Tramaponmbon -
Add Fee: - Sits Insp 15_  Jsers_m | .
Interview 1§ | Pk B |
Tech Ivs 8 | com )
Weekend 1% |
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapone 408933

TEL 6258 3561 FAX. G256 43158

Aeg. No: 18060T198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Affillated (o Federatlon Intarnationale Dea Exparts En Automaoblle

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref CCaLCR18005108/Apa3
CHARTIS LM DIMGAS IOARORE 678130 o LR I||II|II|I|‘“II
Coda: LCR

1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SL0 4860X% Vah. Inspected PA2212Y
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 180372018

2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c D
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg.

Chassis No. Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm

4. Description of Damages.

5. General Information =
Accident Date 15032018 |In5pn:tinl1 Date 18/03/2018
Survey held at tART MOTOR PTELTD

X 5 DEFU LANE 10
iJEI'r':t_.I'IINDL}ST'HIAL PARKC
INGAPORE 5391868

Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSCECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

B)IN ACC (i PANCE T YOUT IMSTRUCTIONS WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




J-MART MOTOR PTE LTD

Block 5, Defu Lane 10, #01-578,
Defu Industrial Park C, Singapore 539186
Tel : 6343-0934 Fax: 6343-0921
Email : marauto@gmaill.com
Registration No: 2014002460
GST Reg, No: 201400246D

19-Mar-15
Our ref TP/AAT9/18 TP LU
Hock Beng Seng Coach Service o
E : est e cosl for vehicle no = 2212

rear bumper ?&-M

1pc

1pc rear |h fender leoded
1pc rear lhmudflap ¢,
1pe rear [h tyre

1pc rear Ih rim i’“ -
Panel beating.

Spray painting.

Alignment.

less 25%

Plus 7% GST

5D : Fifteen thousand & thirty-three & cents seventy-seven only.

KK Autp It N
iD LOnsulian f
!
DA a1 0 f i |
= DEIE
» =
Ry Y
B Fam - .
& Ther nash
T LAy sty ; o —
* N gl g }
* JUpjiaprreet 5 vort 3ng
3 Subesiio wall [rom Iyl g =y
AChnowimiged Ly Fpaeer
Bignatioe
Dalp




Hsiao Tnng SLKI{AutoJ -

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuta)

Sent: Friday, 23 March 2018 2:18 PM

To: ‘Yang, Ivy-AV

Subject: RE: <Request for QI Video> Your Ref: 32453985775G *Our Ref:

CCB/LCR18005108/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 4960X(AIG)/ PA 2212Y/
OTHERS ON 15/03/2018]

Hi vy,

Recealved wilth Ihanks.

SHD 1663P -> SLQ 4940X(01) -> PA 2212Y(1P)

We are of the opinion that BOLA 28{m| is cpplicable.

We will proceed to satlle the claim submitted by third party, PC 2212Y,

We will update if there is any issue.

Hest Regands,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultunts Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhi@kkauto.com | fax: prai-qn8
Bk 51, Pava Ui Industrial Park, Ubd Avenoe 1, so2-25 | S140804%)

From: Yong, lvy-AV [mailto:lvy-AV.Yong@aig.com]

Sent: Friday, 23 March 2018 2:12 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) schewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: <Request for Ol Video> Your Ref: 9245398577SG *Our Ref: CC6/LCR18005108/Apa3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLQ 4960X%(AIG)/ PA 2212Y/ OTHERS ON 15/03/2018]

HI Hsiao Tong,
Video uploaded in merimen

Thank you

Iim IG fa@m Pacilic Indiimncs Pla L

nion Way ANG Bulldihg #0B8-18 Singapore 079120

el +54TH1637 | Fax +88357416

lvy-AY Yong@@aig.com | www aig com.sg
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto. com]

Sent: Friday, March 23, 2018 12:52 PM

To: Yong, Ivy-AV

Subject: <Request for Ol Video> Your Ref: 92453985775G *Our Ref: CC6/LCR1B005108/Apa3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLQ 4960X({AIG)/ PA 2212Y/ OTHERS ON 15/03/2018]

Your Rel: 72453985775G
Our Ref: CC6/LCRI18005108/Apa3

[PDear Srs/Modam.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 4960X(AIG)/ PA 2212Y/ OTHERS ON 15/03/2018
We refer lo the above matter.

Kindly assist to upload Ol's video in Merimen for our viewing.

Thank you.

Best Hopards

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultamts Me Lid

Phone: d7azng7 | email: chgwht@ldautocom | foc 6741-4108

ik 51, Paya Ul Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408937)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this emall [and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and

any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is recelved and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient 1o ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either Jointly ar
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Maonday, 26 March 2018 B:47 AM

To: jmart jmart

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Yaur Ret: PA 2212Y *Our Ref: CC6/LCR1B005108,/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5L0Q

4060X(AIG)/ PA 2212Y/ OTHERS ON 15/03/2018]

Your Ref: PA 2212Y Without Prejudice
Our Ref; CCS&/LCR18005108/Apal

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 4740X(AIG)/ PA 2212Y/ OTHERS ON 15/03/2018
We refer to the obove matier,

Please be informed thatl basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear /
under BOLA [subjeci to BOLA guideline sefllement) and shaoll proceed with direct setflement for the above
mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mall is on without prejudice basis which does not amount fo aon authorisation of
repar fo your client's vehicle.

The final repair cos! s subjected to the consistency of the damaoges according to the nature of the
accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the nurnber of days of repair as recommended by our surveyar,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settiement.

In the svent of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

st Rogards;

Hsian Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants e Lid

Phone: brde-g07 | email: chewhta kkonto.com | e 6741-4108

Bk 51, Pava Ubi Industoial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, =02-25 | S{408933)



AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sir f Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO PA 2212V & 5LQ 4960X ALONG Lower Dalta Rd ON 15/3/2018
We understand that you are the insurer of 5L0 4960X vehicle.

I/We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle PA 2212Y have been completed repairs to my/our

satisfaction by M/s J-MART MOTOR FTE LTD. |/We therefore propose to claim from your as follows:
1. Cost of Repair Plus G5T 55 2835.50
2. Loss of Revenue(55200 x 7Days) 55 1400.00
3. LTA Search Fee/ GIA Reparts S5 0,00
TOTAL S5 4235.50

Please let us have your reply soonest possible.

Thank you.

Yours faithfully
A PTE N
A2 N

e ).

"y




Hsiao Tona !LKKAutnz

From: Hslao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 20 April 2018 4:50 PM

To: ‘imart jmart’

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: Your Ref: PA 2212Y "Qur Ref: CCo/LCR18005108/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SLQ 4960X(AIG)/ PA 2212Y/ OTHERS ON 15/03/2018]

Without Frejudice
Hi,
We refer fo the above matier.

We propose settlement as follows: -

|. Cost of Repair [w/GST) $ 2.835.50
2. Loss of Use [7days x $150.00) $ 1.050.00
Tofal | $ 3.885.50

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sale intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settiemeant.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regords,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultunts Pte Lud

Phone: f742-3107 | email: ¢hewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Parck, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4o08053)

From; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 26 March 2018 8:47 AM

To: jmart jmart <jmartauto@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref. PA 2212Y *Our Ref: CC6/LCR18005108/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 4960X(AIG)/ PA 2212Y/
OTHERS ON 15/03/2018]

Your Ref: PA 2212Y Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC&/LCRI1BDO5108/Apad

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LQ 4760X(AIG)/ PA 2212Y/ OTHERS ON 15/03/2018



Hsiao Tnna !LKKAutn!

From: jmart jmart <jmartauto@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 20 April 2018 4:59 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAUtD)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: PA 2212Y *Qur Ref: CC6/LCR1B005108/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SLO 4960X(AIG)/ PA 2212Y/ OTHERS ON 15/03/2018]

Accept offer

On Apr 20, 2018 4:49 PM, "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Hi,

We refer to the above matter

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair [w/fGS5T) $ 2.835.50
2. Loss of Use (7days x $150.00) $ 1.050.00
Total | $3,885.50

Please confirm acceplance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phone: 6742-1197 | email: chewhit@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bk s1. Pava Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080:313)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 26 March 2018 8:47 AM

To: jmart jmart <jmartauto@gmajl.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref: PA 2212Y *Our Ref: CC6/LCR18005108/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5LQ 4960X(AIG)/ PA 2212Y/
OTHERS ON 15/03/2018]

Your Ref: PA 2212Y Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC4/LCR18005108/Apa3

Diear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 4960X(AIG)/ PA 2212Y/ OTHERS ON 15/03/2018

We reler to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parfies, the liability is clear /
under BOLA [subject to BOLA guideline settlement] and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above
mentioned case.

Please note that this e-maill is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authonsation of
repair 1o your client’s vehicle,

The final repair cost Is subjected lo the consistency of the damages occording 1o the nature of the
accident.



And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our
sUrveyor

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially atfect/influence on the issues
of llabllity/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Hest Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Phone: 6742-3107 | email: chewht@ lkkauto.com | fix: 6741-4108

BIk 51, Pava Uhi Industrial Park, Uhl Avenie 1, #02-25 | S(40HG:379)
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Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 23 March 2018 12:57 PM

Te: Elleen, May Hwee Yap'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 4960X(AIG) & PA 2212Y ON 15/03/2018

Your Ref: SLQ 4940X
Our Ref: CC4/LCR 8005 108/Apa3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLQ 4950X(AIG) & PA 2212Y ON 15/03/2018

We reler 1o the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Lid to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance poicy faken up with them.

We have received a claim from PA 2212y agains! your insurance policy.

Pursuant lo the above said accident whersin you and/or your authorized driver had amongst oiher
information given us your version of how the occident hod occutred, we as the appointed agen! of your
insurers shall proceed to negatiate for an amicable setflemeant with third party claimant,

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negofiations ond setlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us il you have turther Quetles,

Best Rognrds,

Hsinn Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auta Consultants Pre Lid

"hone: 67429107 | email chewht&@lkkauto.com | fax: fmg1-4108
Ik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | Sl408a33)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

L_Mack Benn S Gowch Seryigg [?E third party claimant™)
of 4% R Hh’i’{ﬂ* l¢ fj Bd # g7 -22 SS9 2496 (address), owner

of f& 12 Y (vehicle no.) hereby authorize 3~ MAET Mol (T L TPthe workshop™

to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and or loss of use (“claim™) for

my vehicle no fA 23129 that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred
on 1513 ’ JUILL (date) along Lowrs  Delte Rl (location)
involving vehicle no/s Egg 45 (¢ X (“the accident™).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in & manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authonzed to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque's being made in favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf i1s on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

viehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this It (day) of "ﬂ:.- ¢ (W tmunth}lﬂi (year)
2 ‘@
... a W
) 0}
Signed h}- “the third party claimant™ Signed hy ‘ti‘_\ﬁjkshup

(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



RELEASE VOUCHER
(A1G Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l. J —Mor- Moo Pre bie\ (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we'l
have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed
for §§ 2835 .50 (Repair Cost), 88 1050-00 (Loss of Use/Rontal). 8§ — ( Disbursement)
for vehicle no. __PA 2212Y that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred
on V50208 (date) along Lyafy BAHD Rd Neor \'-'ﬂmtmq. Bawna Ro\ (location)

involving vehicle no/s Q440X This is pursuant to the ln'q:leclmn conducted on19.3. & (date)
at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner Hotk Benp S (vach S-wu(“lhl’.‘
third party claimant™) of vehicle no. PAI22Y make the claim gs set out in the above paragraph
and we'l have full authority to settle the matter on his'her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit.
We/l enclose herein the leter of authority given by “the third party claimant™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemmify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and'or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to __PK 22\2Y (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above 1s in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant”™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive junsdiction over any dispute anising out of the same.

Dated thus '}Lt (day) of [N: [nmnth}lﬂi{year]

WO T
AER2Ta
/3 Y 2
= 1=

Lwp U\ G

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)
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J - MART MOTOR PTELTD
Block 5 Defu Lane 10, #01-578

Defu Industrial Park C, (S)539188
Company Reg. No, 2014002460

GST Reg No. 2014002460 TAX INVOICE NO: TP1B-0061
Email: jmartmotorpl@gmail.com DATE: 19-Apr-2018
Tel: 6343-0934 Fax: 6343-0921
Hock Beng Seng Coach Service
PAYABLE BY AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
DESCRIPTION AMOUNTSS
VEHICLE No:PA 2212Y
To Supply:
Lump sum for repair cost= o 2,650.00
Plus 7% GST 185.50
2,835.50

J - MART MOTOR PTELTD

J
AUTHORISED SIGNATURE




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastinne
|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING S o —
Case | Noufied |Est Submitted | Aaj Assigned | Ao Rpt | Aa) Subwmtted  |InsAuth'ed  |Seatue |
19 Mar 2018 ' Pending for Survey
I o (s | stisseon e
= . Elit Ay st Cancel Case I

Claim Details

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
| Insured: 'LCRF PTE LTD, Co. Reg. Mo.: 201624587%

HOCK BENG SENG COACH SERVICE. Co. Reg. No.: 51853817

. |15/00/2018 14:00 - :59
e Date of Lass! | 1207 Months and @ Days From LTA Rieg Date [Man Yr)]

Claim Type: | TP / 92453985775G RONCYICTVET | 0999994783
s e foc S ot Wo.: |
No. SLQ4960X :&lﬁﬂl, 5062410141-04

L S R — — =
| | Encees:

3-mart Motor Pre Ltd (HQ) Bik 5 Defu Lane 10, #01-575, 539186 Defu Lane - Tel: 63430034 -
| AIG Asis Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) - Tel 85-6415-3000 . [Handled by Yong, Ivy-AV] lvy-VA Yang@alg.com
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
I’b'lhlch No: SLO4960X (Insd veh) Model: ITSUBISHI ROSA 42D
PA2212Y (TP veh) E63T (M)

| Date of Accident: |15/03/2018

Global Sum Settiement |:| [ ] ves [ [X] No

Repair Estimate S 15,033.77]

Final Repair Cost $ 2,835 50

Loss of Use H - 1.050.00 7.00 days at 5150.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 0.00 days

LTA / GIA Search Fee 5 0.00

Others $ 0.00

s

Final Settlement Sum 5 3,885,560

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability ____ 100 (%)

B) For GIA Regis Workshop: BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

BOLA Liability (%) Assessed Liability (*): C

(%)
* Assessed Liability to be filed only for chain collisions and for cases where EQLA does not apply.
Remarks
Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) | J-Mar Motor Ple Lid 3 3.885.50
2) -
02 May
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act: Survey Report: Medical
Report/ Bill (i any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd cc reg to 10ss071s8m)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax' 6844-8805 Email: sur@ikkauts. com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCB/LCR1B005108/APA3C2
Date: 021052018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd.  Policy No: DO8Ga04TR]
T VRS pagtzy Insured Vehicle No :  SLO4960X
Date of Loss: 15/032018 Nature of Claim; TP Claim No: 924539857756
PTION & IDENTIFICATI F |
Reg No: PA2212Y
Make & Model: MITSUBISHI ROSA, 4.2 D BEB3T (M) Engine No: 4033448266
Reg. Date: 11/12/2000 (Man. Year 2000) Chassis No: BEB37GBO0OSTT
Colour. Silver Odometer: 558965 km
Engine Capacity: 4214 cc
Market Value/New Car Price.  N/A
Sum Insured (S8): Market Value/New Car Price
Tl I T F SUR
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabla), Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-acodant Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 21575R175 Rear Tyre Size: 21575 R17.5
Front Left Side: Double Cain & mm Rear Left Side Double Coin 6 mm
Front Right Side: Double Coin 6 mm Rear Right Side: Double Coin 8 mm
Tha above valves represant the mmaining fyre reads deplh
COSTOFCLAMS (Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Parts 10.470.25 2,133.00 8.337.25 7983
Miscallaneous Items D.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,580.00 1,200.00 2,380.00 66.48
Paintwork Labour 0.00 c.o0 0.00
Towing 0.00 C.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 14,050.25 3,332.00 10,717.25  76.28
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 2,650.00
(55) 14,050.25 2.650.00 11.400.25 B1.14
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S5) 883,52 185.50 7968.02 B1.14
Natt Amount (S5) 15,033.77 2,835.50 12,198.27 B1.14
+ Loss of Use (7.0 x $5150.00/day) (S5) 1,050.00
Nett Liability (SS) 3,885.50
INSPECTION
Dale of Assignment. 18/03/2018
Date Inspected: 18/03/2018 Inspecied At J-marn Motor Pte Lid (HQ)
Blk 5 Defu Lane 10, #01-578
Singapore 538186
Estimated Period of Repair 6.0 days
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Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE: Thus report represents our findings af the ime and place of inspochion sinled heremn. Such inspection has been carried oul B the beal of aur
knowledge and abilly but any athar fabilly undér any ather crourmstances (v hersby srpressly exciuded
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty Pari No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 4 981.00 FL *1.682.00 FL
2 1 *REAR LH FENDER Dented 5 783.00FS *600.00 FS

(LOCAL REPAIR)
a *REAR LH MUDFLAP Tom 362.00 FL *362.00FL
4 1 ‘REAR LH TYRE Not Necessary 400.00FS "F§
5 1 *REAR LH RIM Nol Necessary 300.00Fs "FS§
FeFranchiss part. S=SpeMetl L=ListitsmDisc

Sub Total (5§) 11,806.00 2,644.00

- List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (5%5) 1.335.75 511.00

Total Parts (5%) 10,470.25 2,133.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul.
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous [tems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

| PANEL BEATING New 2,000.00 500.00

2 SPRAY PAINTING New 1,500.00 600.00

3 ALIGNMENT New 80.00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (5§) 3,580.00 1,200.00

[ Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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