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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 March 2018 5:48 PM
To: SUR; 'celyn_lim@Aviva-asia.com'
Subject: RE: SKW6629X // Market value

Dear Celyn,

The market value for SKW 6629X is $75K-$79K (EST) as at March 2018.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933) .

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 March 2018 11:39 AM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SKW6629X // Market value

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Celyn Lim [mailto:celyn lim@Aviva-asia.com]
Sent: Thursday, 15 March 2018 4:52 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SKW6629X // Market value

Hi Shiau Chan
Need your assistance to advice on the market value for this case, a copy SKW6629X log card is enclosed above.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Celyn Lim

Claims Executive

General Insurance

Phone : (65) 6827 7495 Fax : (65) 6829 1871
Email Address : celyn_lim@aviva-asia.com




Aviva Ltd

4 Shenton Way

#01-01 SGX Centre 2
Singapore 068807

Co. Reg. No. 196900499K

“In line with MAS Fair Dealing Outcomes, we at Aviva are committed to Treating Customers Fairly”
You can protect our environment. Think before you print.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential.

The sending of this e-mail to any person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it.

If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.



Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration Date:

Vehirc|e Make:

Vehicle Médél: |

Primary Colour:
M;kanufua\cturrin’srg Yéar:

Engine Nb.:

Chassi§ No.r:r

Maximum Pov;/;ar 6utput: H
| Or‘igirrial Régrisv;cra;";ionrD;t;:w |
First Registration Date:

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

s

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

Pviva

Singapore NRIC

07 Mar 2018

1284F YV\ \[ \ " S’\ S\QQQ -*$"’LQQQ

SKW6629X

No

Bl s Tlyes BoRs

TOYOTA

COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT

90.0 kW (120 bhp)

Grey

2015

1ZRX529668

MRO53REH104538264

$17,804.00

11 Nov 2015

11 Nov 2015

0

$17,804.00

Yes

10 Nov 50%/ ‘ . '
$13,353.00 4 QX7

10 Nov 2025

A -Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)

10

$57,498.00
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Sketch Plan Pg.1

SKETCH PLAN
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

is Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.
3. Infoqmation provided must be as fruthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of materlal facts may
allow indurance companies to repudiate policy liabllity.
4. The issuéand acceptance of this Form by insurance companies Is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
companies. ’
5. Any false repoling may be ref o the Pollce for Invastigation.
8. The report will be arded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Assoclation
of Singapore (GIA) for algilving and that coples of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by interested parties.
7. By the lodgement of this ¥qport to the insurers, you hereby consent te the archiving of this report at the centre and to copias of the
report being made avallable a¥fgresaid.
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Describe Circumstances of the Accident
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Coy SGYV 81¥2Y suddenly S‘f,&hne,ol S W Trattyee
poliee egcovtihg for Dr Toh " Reneril coms wto fsm #\bsfob—’“%

Lic A bralte “Ado d L

SV Sty SGV &(¥o>y sppaqsd To be s qk:Hq a(mqu(
on 'HLLWPWJ L pmv\;@' ob@pm ofe. N\

Declaration

I/iWe daclare the foregoing particulars are true in every respect.

:}{3«[ 5% }Mir,\;:

Policyholder’s Signature / Date & Driver's Signature (If driver is not the policyholder) / Date Witnessed by Reporting Centre
Time & Time Personnel

Page 1 of 2

Page 3 of 7



COE Rebate Amount: $44,129.00

Total Rebate Amount: $57,482.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Mar 2018
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