Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 August 2018 4:12 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Ce: Chong Boon Sen; Alfred Toh: Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLay; Olivia Lau
(LKKAuto); Jess Kong; Janice Yeoh ; Angie Foo

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC9715 (Ot SNM18D01391C02/1) and
SHC1167K (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18005021/K1ub3 ) on 14.03.2018

Attachments: Letter to Ol and LOD . pdf

LKK REF - CC3/CTI18005021/K1ub3
CTl REF = 5NM1EDD1391CUZ;’1 {PCQ?‘I.S}

Dear Thin Thin

we refer to the above matter.

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $10,969.65.
We await your payment advice to enable Boon Sen to act accordingly.
Aside to Angie, please follow up on the Section Il Excess recovery.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 63896183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSAR Y
In Singapere since 1938

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute @ commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid, except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ld Any wnauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message. please notify the
sender immediately,



From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailm:thinthin@lkkauto.com]

sent: Tuesday, August 21, 2018 3:55 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT! <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <hoonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=; Alfred
Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct settlement - Accident Involving PCS715 (O : CTI- SNM18D01391/C02/7) and SHC1167K (TP : LKK REF
. CC3/CTI18005021/K1ub3 ) on 14.03.2018

Dear Alfred,

Enclosed herewith Letter to Ol for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
L KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkaute.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, 1'bi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 August 2018 11:18 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@&s cntaiping.com>; 'Chong Boon Sen' <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=; ‘Alfred
Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC9715S (01 : CTI - SNM18D01391/€02/7) and SHC1167K (TP : LKK REF
- CC3/CTI18005021/K1ub3 } on 14.03.2018

importance: High

URGENT
Dear Sir / Madam,

we refer to the below matter.

Kindly let us have your approval as TP is chasing for settlement.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 August 2018 3:12 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'Chong Boon Sen’ <hoonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=; ‘Alfred
Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com:=

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC3715 (O1: CT1 - SNM18D01391/C02/7) and SHC1167K (TP : LKK REF
- CC3/CTI18005021/K1ub3 ) on 14.03.2018

Importance: High




URGENT

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the below matter.

Kindly let us have your approval as TP is chasing for settlement.

Thanks.

Best Repards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Lud
Phone; 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 July 2018 4:14 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=; 'Chong Boon Sen' <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=; 'aAlfred
Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC9715 (01 : CTI - SNM18D01391/C02/7) and SHC1167K (TP : LKK REF
- CE3,|"CTI180(}5921,."K1ub3 ) on 14.03.2018

Importance: High

URGENT
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the below matter.

Kindly let us have your approval as TP is chasing for settlement.

Thanks.
Hest Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4080933)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 July 2018 2:05 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com:=; 'Chong Boon Sen’ <hoonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping. com=; ‘Alfred
Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving pC971s (Ol . CTI - SNM18D01391/C02/7) and SHC1167K (TP : LKK REF
- €C3/CTI18005021/K1ub3 ) on 14.03.2018

Dear 5ir / Madam,



Wwe refer to the below matter.
Kindly let us have your approval as TP is chasing for settlement.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thi hin@lkkauto,com | fax: f741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408033)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 June 2018 2:46 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=; '‘Chong Boon Sen’ <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=; 'Alfred
Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC9715 (01 : CTI - SNM18D01391/C02/7) and SHC1167K (TP : LKK REF
- CC?.,J"CT'IIBEJDEDZI;‘ K1lub3 ) on 14.03.2018

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the below matter.
Kindly let us have your approval as TP is chasing for settlement.

Thanks.
Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 June 2018 4:41 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=; 'Alfred
Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com-=; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: Direct settlement - Accident Involving PC9715S (01 : CTI - SNM18D01391/C02/7) and SHC1167K (TP : LKK REF
- CCE!CTIlSDﬂSDElI K1ub3 ) on 14.03.2018

Your Ref: SNM18D01391/C02/7 "Without Prejudice”
Our Ref: CC3/CT 118005021/Kub3

Dear Sir / Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 9715 AND SHC 1167K ON 14/03/2018

We refer to the above accident.



0l collided to rear portion of TP vehicle.

Wwe did clarify with Ol the nature of accident. We had informed O about TP claim.

We have surveyed the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.
summary of offer made to workshop Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd is as follows:

amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs $12,893.87 ¢ 10,085.16
2. Loss of Rental | $125.40x 5 days) ¢ 68970 5  627.00
3. Loss of Income ($ 50 x 5 days) § 440.00 $  250.00
4. LTA Search Fee 5 7.49 5 7.49

§ 14,031.06 $ 10,969.65

Enclosed herewith the relevant supporting documents for your kind perusal.

For your approval please.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | Bi40809:33)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

sent: Friday, 16 March 2018 5:36 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Chong Boon 5en <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin@lkkauto.com=

subject: Direct settlement - Accident Involving PC9715 (o1 CTl- TBA) and SHC1167K (TP : LKK REF -
CCE}'CﬂlBﬂGEﬂZHKlubE‘ )on 14.03.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Boon Sen,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHC 1167K at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte

Ltd (Loyang).
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report
Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice



Our case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.

Thanlk You.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6266-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Wbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5[408933)



COMFORIDELGRO

R

Qur Ref . T 0318/ SHC1187K MNT(st) ENGIN EE ING
Your Ref :
Date : 18-Apr-18 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept

58 Loyang Drive 4th Fir
CHINA INSURANCE CO LTD Singapore 508969
3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079909
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHC1167K YOUR INSURED PC 971S
AND OTHER ON 14.03.18
We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor
Vehicle Mo : SHC1167K which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured

vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to
assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving PC 9715
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 1008516

2 55 days Loss of Rental @ S 12540 per day 5 688.70

3 Survey Report Fees  (Surveyed by Mis LKK) 5 -

4 LTA Search Fees $ 7.49

5y GIA / Police Report Fees 3 -

) Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees 3 -
Sub Total: $ 10,782.35

HIRER'S CLAIM
7 55 days Loss of Income @ 3 80.00 per days 5 440.00

Total Claims : & 11,222.36

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a)  Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs : 8 pcs.
b)  LTA search slip/s of : PC 971S
¢)  GlIA/ Police report/s of : SHC1167K

d)  Letter of authority from owner { hirer / operator
{ ) Traffic Compound { ) Towing/Medical billireceipts ( ) Certificate of Insurance
{ ) Photographis of Accident Scene ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record { x ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settliement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice
ta any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully
‘allam ‘lan

Deputy Manager
CDGE Claims Department
Tel: 6214 8737 Fax: 6214 1843 Email ; williamtan@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

COMFORIDELGRO
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51 UKL AYE 1, #01-13 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 4ie3d TEL: (65) H2563501 FAX : (065) 62564313

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18005021/K1ub3
28 MARCH 2018

CLARITY CAR GROOMING SERVICE
111 NORTH BRIDGE ROAD

#97-01 PENINSULA PLAZA
SINGAPORE 179098

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 971S & SHC 1167K ON 14/03/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matler prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contacl us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
ik

THIN THIN HLAING

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360

Fax: 6741 4108
Fmail: thinthin@lkkauto.com

cc.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)




CDG.VARS.V LettofAuthorisation Page 1 of 1

»

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

{NAF f PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING TOYOTA PRIUS SHC1 167K , PCO71S ON 14-Mar-18 14:50
ALONG TPE TWDS AIRPORT AFTER LORONG HALUS
1/ We TAN POH TEE (Hirer) NRIC No.. 501415191
andfor {Relief) NRIC Na.:

Taxi Number SHC1167K
hereby authorise ComtartDelGro Engineering Pte Lrdi CDGE )

1. To submit myfour claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs.

7. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amaunt in respect of myfour claim
against third party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/our behalf.
4. To accept any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by chegue

shall be forward directly to CDGE In accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
“comfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 15-Mar-2018
Marma of Hirer TAMN POH TEE
Hirer NRIC S0141519] Signature :
__.—'_'
Addrass 23 JALAN MEMBINA #15-82
163023
Contact MNo. 81381709

bt edirak '-’qn*'R.".-"RumtimchumimefRuntimchunlime.-'Vicwa DG.VARS.V.Lettof... 1 5/03/2018



Policy MWo Claim No @ SNMISDUI391CD2I1
Claimant = COMFORT TEHNSPGRTHT:GN PTE LTD
Amount .. 8% 10,900.00

Singapore Dollars Ten Thousand and Hine Hundred Only

I/We agree Lo accedt the sbove mentioned amount to be paid to mefus in full &
fipal settlement of aill -plaims, costs & disburgements for injuries [ damages
sustained by mefas threugh an acclidsnt inwolving

claimant Vehicle NWo. @ SHC 11&7R
Insured Vehicle No. ! PC 9718

Date of Loss 1 14/03/2018
pPlace of Accident = TEE TOWARDS AIRFORT

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the sforementioned sum bBY
CHINE TAIPING IMSURANCE {SINGAEORE) PTE. LTD., T/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TATPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/fer

Ingured Nams : CLARITY CAR GROOMING SERVICES
priver Hame : LOO WAL HOWG

from all claims, present O future in respect of all less, injury or damadye
sugtained by mefus arising out of the =zaid accident.

T acknowledge that this payment is made witkout admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TATFPING INSURANCE {STHEAPDRE) PTE. LTD:

Global Sum : 35 lOIBDU.DG
Total S 55 10,900.00

claimant Name i COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD HRIE Moo

N7 8 F

Zignature Date H

/
4,

COMFORTDELGRD £X

CYANG DRIVE

SIHGAPONE 508360

ing {,[uf‘ﬁEl‘.[E i this (ONUMmSER '.'F:'-..I.'Il 10 VECE Lal 'A?-‘.'ﬁ le.’-':l
t"'".ll DEFSDFE! i'TI'I'J“EE ’d:l!'j Uaﬁ'@:% a;l‘sm‘g t"”ﬂqé[ﬂm ae EIdUd‘E—‘E Please: forwaid YU yheque madle :'“ilhlc l%r]
o the amoi and apoicalion of 1S docoment COMPORTDELGROU ENGINEERING PTE LU



COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

IMFORIDELGRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

ComforiDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
& member of COMPORIDELCRD

Head Office:
205 Braddell Road

Singapore 379701

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requested.

CUSTOMER'S COPY

TAX INVOICE

ACCOUNT No.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte

INVOICE No.

AMOUNT

BANK/CHQ No.




Ccom rrwz :DELGRO
ENGINEERINC

IMFORIDELGRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
5 membar of COMPORIDELLRL

Head Oifice
205 Braddel! Road
Singapore 379701

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requested.

CUSTOMER'S COPY

TAX INVOICE

ACCOUNT No.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pl

INVOICE No.

Enal

AMOUNT

BANK/CHQ No.




COMFORIDELGRO ComtortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
ENGINEERING

OMFORIDELCGRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE

ComfortiDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
el S ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.
Head Office;

205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issusd unless requested. N l g A

CUSTOMER'S COPY



COMFORIDELGRO ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lt
ENGINEERING

f COMFORDELGRD

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
migrmizes o COMPORIDELCRD

ACCOUNT Na. INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.

Head Ciffice

205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701

Kirdly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requested
CUSTOMER'S COPY



Qur Ref:  CT18030454 ﬁ
Date: 17 April 2018 - ‘ ;

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/fMadam

ACCIDENT ON 14/03/2018 @ 14:50 hrs

ALONG TPE TWDS AIRPORT AFTER LORONG HALUS
INVOLVING PC971S

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHC1167K (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to TAN POH TEE IC NO
S0141519J a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $125.40 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE {SINGAPORE) PTELTD

pCaedis 14 Mar 2018/ 14:50:00 Successful col

Previous OK

hittos: vl Iqa_gnu.sg.-'.la.'vrh'a-:tinn.flnsPartDela|IE-_.-.|'b.-"J.'? FUNCTION_ID=F1801043ET

101



