Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 March, 2018 1:36 PM

To: Cesc Wang jiaxiang

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your reference: CC3/A1G18004985/hs3

Attachments: thumbnail (1).jpg; thumbnail (2).jpg; thumbnail (3).jpg; thumbnail.jpg
Dear Sir,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

SERER WWT Swve the Larthe Print only whern necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Cesc Wang jiaxiang [mailto:cescwjx@yahoo.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 27 March, 2018 8:36 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your reference: CC3/AIG18004985/hs3

Dear Mr Vic Alpeh Sanghilan,
referring to our conversation this afternoon, with regard that the accident involving GBF
5133 L and SKT 8676L on 14/03/2018 along/at lentor ave before ramp to SLE(CTE/TPE).

Both the parties had agreed to a private settlement. We had made the full payment to the workshop. Please refer to
the attachment for the proof of private settlement agreement lease between both parties. Thank you.

Warmest Regard,
Wang Jia Xiang



