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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 24 August 2018 9:11 AM

To: 'MG Solution'

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKZ 1581R AND FZ 6348A ON 12.03.2018 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/ASM18004949/Aea3

Attachments: OI SKETCH PLAN.pdf; FZ 6348A - SKZ 1581R.mp4

Without Prejudice 

 

Hi Su Wong, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We attached here with a copy of our insured’s accident statement and video for your easy reference. 

 

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client make a right turn 

without green arrow and collided into our insured vehicle. 

 

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor. 

 

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable 

to look into your client’s claim. 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, 18 June 2018 9:50 AM 

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKZ 1581R AND FZ 6348A ON 12.03.2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18004949/Aea3 

 

Your Ref: CC4/ASM18004949/Aea3 (FZ6348A) 

Our Ref: SKZ1581R 

  

Dear Asher, 
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Please find attached our LOD for your onward action. Original Copy will send to you by POST.    

Please feel free to contact the under mentioned should you require any further information.  

Your prompt action will be greatly appreciated.  

Best Regards, 

  

Su Wong 

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD 

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre 

#02-03B Singapore 415933 

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376 

 

 

 

 

On Thu, Mar 15, 2018 at 4:08 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that we are currently pending verification for direct settlement. 

  

Fyi, OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 
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The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

  

Kindly provide us : - 
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• evidence to support your claim if any. 

  

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher at 6841 6051. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Sharon [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 14 March, 2018 3:59 PM 

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>; SG AXA Insurance SM Claims Service 

Team <cst@axa.com.sg> 

Subject:  

  

Dear person in charge, 

  

Please refer to attach file and arrange for pre-inspection. 

  

we prefer our single joint expert as below: 
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ADRIAN LING WAI PING LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Sharon Chia 

MG Solution Pte Ltd 

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 

Singapore 415933 

Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376 

  

  

  

  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that  
the link points to the correct file and location.

 

This email has been checked for viruses by Avast antivirus software. 

www.avast.com  

  


