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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

BlE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607 198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile
ECICS LTD Ref : CS/ICS18004896/Avb

7 TEMASEK BOULEVARD
#10-01 SUNTEC TOWER ONE
SINGAPORE 038987

Date: 14-03-2018

IO

Code: ICS
1; Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GEF 4279G Veh. Inspected SLG 6235x
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JANICE GOH Assign Date 09/0372018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/03/2018 Inspection Date 12/03/2018
Survey held at KAl MOTOR TRADING
BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1
#01-434
SINGAPORE 408701
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims) <Janice_Goh@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 April 2018 11:10 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018
Dear Veron

Our claim no DMCV1800016H.
Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: +85 8303 0182
FAX: +65 6338 9267

ECICS Limited

7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg
directly.

**Please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of
claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding. **

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 April, 2018 10:35 AM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims)

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018

Dear Janice,

Please provides us the claim number.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Kai Motor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 14 March 2018 5:26 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @|kkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018

=wemeemeee Forwarded message ---—--—---
From: motorsurvey <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>




Date: 8 March 2018 at 09:02

Suh'jer.t: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018

To: kaimotor <kaimotor@gmail.com>, "assignments@lkkauto.com" <assignments lkkauto.com>
Cc: motorsurvey <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>

Without Prejudice

Dear Kym

Thank you for your email.

We will appoint LKK for the sruvey.

Aside to LKK

Please assist to arrange for TP PRI

Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: +65 6303 0182
FAX: +656338 9267

ECICS Limited

7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motarsuryey@ecics.com.sq

directly.



**please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of
claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding. o

From: kaimotor [mailto: kaimotor@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 8 March, 2018 6:04 PM
To: motorsurvey

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018

sent fram my Samsung Galaxy smartphone,

From: kaimotor <kaimotor@gmail.com>

Date: 8/3/18 6:02 PM (GMT+08:00)

To: motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO 5LG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018

sent from my Samsung Galaxy smartphone

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>

Date: 8/3/18 4:18 PM (GMT+08:00)



To: Imutorggwey@ecics.mm,sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018

KAl MOTOR TRADING

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1
#01-440, SINGAPORE 408701
TEL: 67474006 FAX:67437591

E-mail : kaimotor@gmail.com
REG NO: 44223100L

Date : 08/03,/2018

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
ECICS Limited

Attn: Motor Claim Dep (By Email Only)

7 Temasek Boulevard,

#10-01 Phoebe Phone: 6337 4779
suntec Tower One motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg
Singapore 038587

Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018

We are writing on behalf of Mr Tee Chee Siong the registered owner of SLG 6235 X which was
involved on the above mentioned accident between GBF 4279 G.

Investigation reveals that the motor vehicle number GBF 4279 G was insured with you at the
material time of the said accident.

As a result of the accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence of your insured
vehicle number GBF 4279 G. Therefore, our client is holding you liable for the repair costs and other
consequential loss which was sustained by him/her/them.

Kindly arrange your representative to survey our client’s vehicle at KAl MOTOR TRADING Blk 3007,
Ubi Road 1, #01-440, Singapore 408701 within two (2) days from the date hereof as to avoid further
losses incur.

We enclosed hereby the GIA report ofSLG 6235 X for your kind attention.

Failing which, our client have no alternative but to proceed with the necessary repairs and the bill
will be forward to you for reimbursement.

Yours faithfully,



Thank you.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440
Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

follow us onfi 4] follow us an visit our website H
facebook 2 o twitte rE ecics.com.sg ECI§§

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee, No representation, warranty, guarantee
or undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinlons
contained in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee
indicated in his message [or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case,
you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do
not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.

Thank you.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006



Catherine Chonﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com=>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 March, 2018 5:26 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4275 G on 07/03/2018

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: motorsurvey <motorsurvev(@ecics.com.sg=

Date: 9 March 2018 at 09:02

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018
To: kaimotor <kaimotor@gmail.com>, "assignments@lkkauto.com" <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: motorsurvey <motorsurvey(@ecics.com.sg=

Without Prejudice

Dear Kym

Thank you for your email.

We will appoint LKK for the sruvey

Aside to LKK

Please assist to arrange for TP PRI

Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division

DID: +65 6303 0182

FAX: +65 6338 9267



ECICS Limited

7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg

directly.

**Please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of
claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding. **

From: kaimotor [mailto:kaimotor@amail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 8 March, 2018 6:04 PM

To: motorsurvey

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018

Sent from my Samsung Galaxy smartphone.

-------- Original message --------

From: kaimotor <kaimotor(@gmail.com>

Date: 8/3/18 6:02 PM (GMT+08:00)

To: motorsurvev(iiecics.com.sg

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018



Sent from my Samsung Galaxy smartphone,

-------- Original message --—-----
From: Kai Motor <kaimotor{@gmail.com>
Date: 8/3/18 4:18 PM (GMT+08:00)

To: motorsurveyi@ecics.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018

KAl MOTOR TRADING

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1
#01-440, SINGAPORE 408701
TEL: 67474006 FAX:67437591
E-mail : kaimotor@gmail.com
REG NO: 44223100L

Date : 08/03/2018

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
ECICS Limited

Attn: Motor Claim Dep (By Email Only)

7 Temasek Boulevard,

#10-01 Phoebe Phone: 6337 4779
Suntec Tower One motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg

Singapore 038987
Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018

We are writing on behalf of Mr Tee Chee Siong the registered owner of 5LG 6235 X which was
involved on the above mentioned accident between GBF 4279 G.

Investigation reveals that the motor vehicle number GBF 4279 G was insured with you at the

material time of the said accident.

As a result of the accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence of your insured
vehicle number GBF 4279 G. Therefore, our client is holding you liable for the repair costs and other
consequential loss which was sustained by him/her/them.

3



Kindly arrange your representative to survey our client’s vehicle at KAl MOTOR TRADING Blk 3007,
Ubi Road 1, #01-440, Singapore 408701 within two (2) days from the date hereof as to avoid further
losses incur.

We enclosed hereby the GIA report ofSLG 6235 X for your kind attention.

Failing which, our client have no alternative but to proceed with the necessary repairs and the bill
will be forward to you for reimbursement.

Yours faithfully,

Thank you.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

£ ™ - i o

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee
or undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited: as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions
contained in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee
indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case,
you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do
not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.

Thank you.



Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006
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KAI MOTOR TRADING

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-440, SINGAPORE 408701,

TEL: 6747 4006 FAX: 6743 7591

EMAIL: kaimotor@gmail.com

BUS. REG. NO: 44223100L  GST NO: Mg0371531Y
SERH AL ESMREBEM LR A FHEALS RS BT R

Specialist in: Accidents Insurance Claim, Towing Service, Motor Vehicle Repairing, Panel Beating, Spray Painting.

Date : 08/03/2018

Attn: The Motor Claims Department

ECICS Limited Vacof
Attn: Motor Claim Dep

7 Temasek Boulevard,

#10-01

Suntec Tower One
Singapore 038987

Dear Sir / Madam

LKK o
Aian 96873735

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

(By Email Only]

Phoebe  Phone: 6337 4779
motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg

Estimate Cost repair Bill To Toyota Harrier No 5LG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018

To Supply :-
7.5 ¢
lpc Front bumper ’“\Jz‘Ee_a‘J' S50 T $1,475.00 =
1pc Front head lamp unit.RH Led Wt 0 GO AL $3,450.30 ’J 252 LO
1pc Front fender RH @4.11{ ' 51.1_2,15;31} f=s it
1pc Front fender inner liner RH ML #/e¢ $7 43650 .
56,577.10
less 25% $1,644.28
$4,932.83
To dismanlte & replace damage parts,panel beat where necessary. 5 @ﬂﬁ' /o3
To putty,apply primer & spray paint on the affecte portion. Q30 S 7 #¢02
To check wiring functions. 5 Etﬁ] 30 |
é[-}g:l -"Tﬁ $E,35233 _:;u }Iql"" B
[l 3 1‘. e UL
+otp L8 T
LKK Auto Consultants hence nolify ﬂuﬂ.&ﬂ L_*- [ IR
the Repairer of the M\ . T '\\
= To resurvey belore AaInting h| |'r II : |r’ ,-‘I i
» To display damaged 8 during rasursey I l!ﬁ}% II' 3‘ : Yo
» Parts prices are subjet! o confirmation
» Third party survey s on a "Without Prejudice” base
» Mo illegal modification(s) is aflowed |» A P&j&

+ Bupplamentary demis] musl De resurveyed and
s subgect to final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowiadged by Repaser
Signature:
Diate:




nOE % IR F
KAI MOTOR TRADING

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-440, SINGAFORE 408701.
TEL: 6747 4006 FAX: 6743 7581 EMAIL: kaimotor@gmail.com
BUS. REG. NO: 44223100L GST NO: M30371531Y

SERS: ALENGREF - BEL AR EEARE RS ATHT RS

Specialist in: Accidents Insurance Claim, Towing Service, Motor Vehicle Repairing, Panel Beating, Spray Painting.

Date : 13/03/2018

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
ECICS Limited

Attn: Motar Claim Dep [By Email Only]

7 Temasek Boulevard,

#10-01 Phoebe Phone: 6337 4779
Suntec Tower One motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg
Singapore 038987

Dear Sir / Madam

Supplementary Cost repair Bill To Toyota Harrier No SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018

To Supply :-

1pc Front bumper side retainer RH .r_;mf'--d- S 12010

A (- 2010

S Jo3fis 9001

K



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co reg No 155607 158R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@|kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CS/ICS518004886/AVBNZ

Date: 16/04/2018 o
REFERENCE
Handiing ECICS Limited Policy No:
Insurer:
Claimant ; .
Vehicle No : SLGE235X Insured Vehicle No : GBF42736G
Date of Loss:  07/03/2018 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: MiA
CRI ENTI ION OF ICLE
Reg No: SLGE235X
Make & Model: TOYOTA HARRIER, 2.0 (A) Engine No: 3ZRBT16508
Reg. Date: 06102016 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No: Z5UB00070699
Colour: Black Odometer: 44988 km
Engine Capacity: 1986 cc
Mi!rket Value/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S%): Market Value/New Car Price
c FV EATT F
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes

Handbrake (Serviceable):
CONDITION OF TYRES

Yes Engine Modification:

Mo Pre-accident Condition:

Front Tyre Size: 235/55R18 Rear Tyre Size: 235/55R18
Front Left Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone & mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
The above values represent the remaining fyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’s Difference Diff %
Farts 5,052.92 4 498.49 554,43 10.97
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,430.00 B30.00 600.00 41.96
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 6,482.92 5,328.49 1,154.43 17.81
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 453.80 372.95 80.81 17.81
Nett Amount (S5) 6,936.72 5,701.48 1,235.24 17.81
INSPE N
Date of Assignment: 08/03/2018
Date Inspected: 12/03/2018 Inspected At: KAl MOTOR TRADING (HQ)

Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1, #01-440
Singapore 408701

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING

Manager: WVERON CHEN

NOTE: This repart represents our findings at the time and place of ingpection stated herein. Such inspection has baen carmad out to the best of our
knawledge and abiity but any ather kabilify under any ather circumstances is heraby expressly excluded

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/ index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 16/4/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 16 Apr 2018)

Parts: M1-SUV TOYOTA HARRIER 2.0 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

ILabnur: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List) l
|Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLG6235X)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk °.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 “*FRONT BUMPER Deformed 1,475.00FL *1475.00FL
2 1 “FRONT HEAD LAMP UNIT,RH LED Cut 3,450.30 FL *3,450.30FL
3 1 *FRONT FENDER RH Dented 1,215.30FL  *852.60FL
4 1 *FRONT FENDER INNER LINER RH Mot Necessary 436 50FL *-FL
5 1 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH Cracked 120.10FS *80.07 FS
F=Franchise part. 5=Spchett L=ListlemDisc. —eee

Sub Total (S$%)  6,687.20 5,967.97
- List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S$) 1,644 28 1,469.48

Total Parts (S§) 5,052.92 4,498.49

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/ index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 16/4/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 3

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO DISMANTLE & REPLACE DAMAGE PARTS,PANEL Mew 600.00 400,00
BEAT WHERE NECESSARY

2 TO PUTTY,APPLY PRIMER & SPRAY PAINT ON THE Mew 750.00 400.00
AFFECTED PORTION

3 TO CHECK WIRING FUNCTIONS New 80.00 30.00

Gross Labour Cost (S%) 1,430.00 830.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES =

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/ index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 16/4/2018



