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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: motorsurvey <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 July 2018 3:37 PM

To: Crystabelle Tan Gek Peng (ECICS, Claims)

Cc: assignments; Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto); motorsurvey; SUR

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018

Our claim no DMCV1800016H/CT 

 

Hi Crystabelle 

 

Please take note. 

Thank you. 
 
 
Regards, 
Janice Goh 
Claims Division 

DID: +65  6303 0182 
FAX: +65 6338 9267 
 
ECICS Limited 

7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987 

 
WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg 

directly.   

 

**Please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of 

claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding.** 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July, 2018 11:42 AM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); motorsurvey; SUR 
Cc: assignments 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018 

 

Dear Janice, 

 

Survey report submitted in merimen. 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July 2018 11:35 AM 

To: 'motorsurvey' <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018 
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Dear Janice, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Dear Veron, 

 

FYNA. Our Ref: CS/ICS18004896/Avbn2 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: motorsurvey [mailto:motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July, 2018 11:06 AM 

To: assignments@lkkauto.com 

Cc: motorsurvey <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018 

 
Hi LKK 

 

Please advise on the status. 

Thank you. 
 
 
Regards, 
Janice Goh 
Claims Division 

DID: +65  6303 0182 
FAX: +65 6338 9267 
 
ECICS Limited 

7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987 

 
WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg 

directly.   

 

**Please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of 

claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding.** 

 

From: Kai Motor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]  
Sent: Friday, 25 May, 2018 3:08 PM 

To: motorsurvey; Hsiao Tong; Zaini (LKK Auto) 
Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com 

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018 

 

Hi Sir, 

 

 

Kindly forward your offer to us, as soon as possible.   

If never hear you within 3days ,I will pass to lawyer .
 

 

On 10 April 2018 at 16:35, Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com> wrote: 
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Hi Sir, 

 

 

Attached LOD. 

 

 

         

Date : 10/04/2018   
 

    

         

Attn: The Motor Claims Department   WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
ECICS Limited        

Attn: Motor Claim Dep    (By Email Only)  
7 Temasek Boulevard,       

 #10-01     Phoebe Phone: 6337 4779  
 Suntec Tower One    motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg  
Singapore 038987        

         

Dear Sir / Madam        

         

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018   

         

         

We have been authorised by Mr Tee Chee Siong, the owner of vehicle number SLG 6235 X, to claim 

 against the party /parties responsible for the damages arising from the above mentioned accident. 

         

         

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number (GBF 4279 G) at the material time of the  

accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, ( Mr Tee Chee Siong).    

         

         

As a result of the accident caused by your insured driver’s negligent driving and/or management of 

your insured’s vehicle number (GBF 4279 G), our client’s vehicle was damaged and we have been put  

to loss and damage as follows:       

         

         

 (1) Cost of repair              $5,701.50  

 (2) Loss of use 4days X 120      $   480.00  

 (3) PIR 2days       $   240.00  

 (4) LTA Search Fee       $        7.45  

         

         

 A cope of each of the following supporting  documents is enclosed:   

         

 (a) Final repair bill       

 (b) GIA report with sketch plan of (our client’s veh number)   

 (c) LTA Search       
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Thanks you. 

 

Ms Kym  

 

On 4 April 2018 at 17:36, Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Sir, 

 

  

URGENT    

Kindly let us know is the  liability clear  to  Direct Settlement 

. 

 

 

Thanks you. 

 

Ms Kym 

 

On 9 March 2018 at 09:02, motorsurvey <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Kym 

  

Thank you for your email. 

We will appoint LKK for the sruvey. 

  

  

Aside to LKK 

  

Please assist to arrange for TP PRI. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Regards, 

Janice Goh 

Claims Division 

DID: +65  6303 0182 
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FAX: +65 6338 9267 

  

ECICS Limited 

7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987 

  

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg 

directly.   

  

**Please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of 

claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding.** 

  

From: kaimotor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 8 March, 2018 6:04 PM 
To: motorsurvey 

 

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018 

  

  

  

  

  

Sent from my Samsung Galaxy smartphone. 

  

-------- Original message -------- 

From: kaimotor <kaimotor@gmail.com>  

Date: 8/3/18 6:02 PM (GMT+08:00)  

To: motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg  

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018  
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Sent from my Samsung Galaxy smartphone. 

  

-------- Original message -------- 

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>  

Date: 8/3/18 4:18 PM (GMT+08:00)  

To: motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg  

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018  

  

    
KAI  MOTOR  TRADING 

     

    BLK 3007  UBI  ROAD 1      

    #01-440, SINGAPORE 408701      

    TEL: 67474006   FAX:67437591      

    E-mail : kaimotor@gmail.com      

    REG NO: 44223100L      

    
 

     

Date : 08/03/2018   
 

     

          

Attn: The Motor Claims Department   WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
ECICS Limited         

Attn: Motor Claim Dep    (By Email Only)   

7 Temasek Boulevard,        

 #10-01     Phoebe Phone: 6337 4779   

 Suntec Tower One    motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg   

Singapore 038987         

          

Dear Sir / Madam         

          

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLG 6235 X & GBF 4279 G on 07/03/2018   

          

We are writing on behalf of Mr Tee Chee Siong the registered owner of SLG 6235 X  which was  
 involved on the above mentioned accident between  GBF 4279 G.    

          

Investigation reveals that the motor vehicle number GBF 4279 G was insured with you at the   
material time of the said accident.       
 

         

As a result of the accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence of your insured   
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vehicle number GBF 4279 G. Therefore, our client is holding you liable for the repair costs and other 

 consequential loss which was sustained by him/her/them.     

          

Kindly arrange your representative to survey our client’s vehicle at KAI MOTOR TRADING Blk 3007,  

Ubi Road 1, #01-440, Singapore 408701 within two (2) days from the date hereof as to avoid further  

losses incur.          

          

We enclosed hereby the GIA report ofSLG 6235 X for your kind attention.    

          

Failing which, our client have no alternative but to proceed with the necessary repairs and the bill   
will be forward to you for reimbursement.       

          

Yours faithfully,         

          

          

          

 

 

  

--  

Thank you. 

  

  

Ms Kym 

 

Kai Motor Trading 

 

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440  

Singapore 408701  

Telephone: 6747 4006 

 

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee 

or undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions 

contained in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee 

indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, 

you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do 

not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited. 

 

 

 

 

--  

Thank you. 



8

 

 

Ms Kym 

 

Kai Motor Trading 

 

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440  

Singapore 408701  

Telephone: 6747 4006 

 

 

 

 

--  

Thank you. 

 

 

Ms Kym 

 

Kai Motor Trading 

 

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440  

Singapore 408701  

Telephone: 6747 4006 

 

 

 

 

--  

Thank you. 

 

 

Ms Kym 

 

Kai Motor Trading 

 

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440  

Singapore 408701  

Telephone: 6747 4006 


