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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

A ]
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 14 March 2018 3:49 PM
To: 'Ler, Bernard-JQ'; SUR
Subject: RE: SGT8808X/ 8432099181SG | Date of Accident: 27/2/2018

Dear Bernard,

The market value for SGT 8808X is $114K-5119K (EST) as at Feb 2018.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
}

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ [mailto:Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 14 March 2018 10:57 AM '

To: Claims <claims@fta.com.sg>; Rogass mail <rogassociates@gmail.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: SGT8808X/ 8432099181SG | Date of Accident: 27/2/2018

Hi All,
Appreciate if you all could assist to compute market value of the vehicle above please.
Thank you very much.

Best’ Regards,

Bernard Ler

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific insurance Pte. Ltd
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6419 1946 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416 (

Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
o0h: >:§MIS(

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:

© Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Inf;anded De-registration Daté:
" Vehicle Make:
Veixiéie Mo‘delrz
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
| Engiﬁe N(;.:’k o
| éhéﬁéis ﬁo.:
Meximum Power Output:
Open Marke; 7\}aluerz
| O£iginai Reglstratlon Daté:

First Registration Date:

Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

CAED

Singapore NRIC

,@4&3

2197C

Fyws |- Eils

SGT8808X

No

01 Mar 2018

SUBARU

FORESTER 2.0XT CVT AWD SR

2017

FA20B962523

White

JF1SJGK85HG087296

$17,931.00

177.0kW (237 bhp)

21 Apr 2017
0

$17,931.00

21 Apr 2017

Yes

UM

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

| Intended COE Rebate Details

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/ Ita/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTIO...

$13,448.00

20 Apr 2027,/

3/1/2018
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YMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING \

1ember of COMFORDELGRO.

- . S .

-~

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
205 Braddell Road Singapore 573701

Mainline + 65 6383 6280 Facsimile + 85 6280 9755
Workshops ’
59 Loyang Drive Singapore 508968
383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717
45 Pandan Road Singapore 809286

320 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408649
7 Sunge! Kadut Way Singapore 728791
& Defu Avenue 1 Singapore 539537

Date/Time: 23.02.2012 09:47 Page : 1

JOB CARD ;10 order: JC NO.3040 70901

MER REGN NO MILEAGE
SHC14738

COMFORY MAKE : FUEL J
VIER NO 70 HYUNDAL E A2
35§ 383 BIN MODEL DATE/TIMEIN

Singapo SONATA AL UA AULE 16102
) 65350875 YR OF MANU TARGET DATE
P) 3¢.11, 2010

COMPLETION DATE/TIME:
JNT CARD NO.
ED & PASSED OUT BY:
SERVICE ADVISOR CUSTOMER'S SIGNATURE
dgement Slip Exit Pass .
t
Vehicle No.:

, SHCT14738 JJ AXA LK SHC14738
service Advisor Signature/Date Name of Service Advisor ~ Date -

med to Service Reception upon collection

. To be kept by Security Guard




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page2of2 |

COE Expiry Date: 20 Apr 2027
COE C;fégow: | B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Periodé[ ears): o - 10
QP Paid: R | §54,405.00
COE Rebate Améunf: ‘~7 - $49,705.00
| "l‘VotrawlﬂRébate;smo;f’l’t':’ o | $63,153.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 01 Mar 2018

- OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDere glnput?FUNCTIO... 3/1/2018



