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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 12-96071588-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

36 ROBINSON ROAD

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref : CES/FCI18004887/Ugb

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Dete:  TDE0I8 ” ”mmmm”m mm
Code: FCI2
1% Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 772U Veh. Inspected SJH 9353L
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D18002117MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From CWS (SITHARA) Assign Date 14/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c a
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  12/03/2018 Inspection Date 14/03/2018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
Sa. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}jIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




\ i i M35 First Capital Insurance Limited (oreg bo. 1950001060 057 Mg ba, M2-0001576-9
MS ‘ Flmtca pltal 6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580

Tel: (b5} 6222 2311 Fax (55) 6222 3547

Claims & Mater Underwriting Cepx: 36 Robinsen Aoad #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) 6507 3849
wiww,msfirstcapital.com,sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 14-03-2018 Qur Ref No. D18002117MFSH
Accident Date 12-03-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHCO772U Third Party Vehicle. SJH3353L
Survey Location 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-46/48/50AUTOBAY
Contact Person. NANCY LAM
Contact No. B7465405/ 0 Fax No. 67458520
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNMCLEAR:

ointed
App LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop FASTECH AUTO PTELTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. MA
Officer Incharge SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,

A Mempies of [EEEETE] ok umasce GrouR




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) :

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent; Wednesday, 21 March 2018 1:56 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’; assignments

Cc: SITHARA@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002117MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI18004887Uqb.pdf

Dear Sithara,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of 5JH 9353L.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-9561 | email: siewsc@lkkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

sent: Monday, 19 March 2018 5:11 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SITHARA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002117MFSH/1

Dear Sithara,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJH 9353L on 14/03/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ld

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6a56-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 14 March 2018 5:38 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@ msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assighments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SITHARA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SUR <su ri@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002117MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6741-84734 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

1
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51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARE, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) A2363561 FANX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18002117MFSH Date: 21 March 2018

Our Ref: CS/FC118004887/Ugh

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance L.td

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SJH 9353L. .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 14/03/2018 at the premises of M/s FASTECH AUTO. and have the following to

report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;8% 3.180.30
Revised Estimate Amount ok 900.00
“Check™ Items Amount : S$ -
Market Value :S$ -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -
Nett Value :S% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the o/s rear portion.

Yours faithfully

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

—#

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 19 March 2018 5:11 PM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’; assignments

Cc: SITHARA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002117MFSH/1
Dear Sithara,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJH 9353L on 14/03/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, 14 March 2018 5:39 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SITHARA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002117MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-B434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4515
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstca pital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 14 March, 2018 5:24 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SITHARA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002117MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System
Motor Claims Department



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page 1 of 2
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type: Business
Owner 1D 4408L
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: SIH?353L
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo
Intended De-registration 14 Mar 2018
Date:
Vehicle Make: HOMNDA
Vehicle Model: AIRWAVE 1.5M A
Primary Colour: Black
Manufacturing Year: 2008
Engine MNo.: L15A5161914
Chassis Mo.: 5111210054
Maximum Power Output: 81.0kW (108 bhp)
Open Market Value: $15,199.00
Criginal Registration Date; 28 Aug 2008
First Registration Date: 28 Aug 2008
Transfer Count: 2
Actual ARF Paid: $7.937.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry 27 Aug 2018
Date:
PARF Rebate Amount: $3,968.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 27 Aug 2018
COE Category: A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $3,276.00
COE Rebate Amount: $663.00
Total Rebate Amount: $4,631.00
The informatien contained herein is correct as at 14 Mar 2018
OK
https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate ByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTI... 14-Mar-18



1 Kaki BukiT Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay
Singapore 417883

VEH: SJH 9353L

QTY PARTICULAR
1PCS REAR FENDER 0O/S
TO CHECK WIRING

TO DISMENTLE & REFIX REVERSE SENSOR
TO CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT

LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING REAR FENDER,
REAR DOOR & REAR BUMPER ECTS

TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING

TOTAL

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD ol MérJ

f&‘/S/rf”

Tel No:67452063/67467158 Fax No:67458520 .- /—; /"_., @ ? 00

3

reevid and

AMOUNT
$1,120.30 X

A 1 $50.00

A1 $50.00

AN $80.00 X
$800.00 SO

$1,080.00 52O
$3,180.30



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607196-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCIHB004B887/Ugbn2
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date: 26:03-2018 ”m“m“l””mmu
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 772UV Veh. Inspected SJH 9353L
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18002117MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SITHARA Assign Date 14/03/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA AIRWAVE (A) c.C 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. GJ11210056 Colour BLACK
Odometer 231706 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/65R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre 195/85 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/65R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 YOROHAMA & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  12/03/2018 |inspection Date 14/03/2018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAFORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANGE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repalr

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL; 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Feg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJH 9353L
Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | -8 rk-hup?;}i ﬁ%"
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR FENDER Q/S TO REPAIR SEE 1,120.30 -
LABOUR
1,120.30 =
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIIRNG. MNOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
TO DISMENTLE & REFIX REVERSE SENSOR NOT NECESSARY 50.00 &
TO CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT MOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
LABOUR FOR PAMEL BEATING REAR FENDER,REAR 800.00 300.00
DOOR & REAR BUMPER CLIPS
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING 1,080.00 G00.00
2,060.00 900.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,180.30 900.00
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 900.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18004887/Ugbn2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made sobely for the use and benefit of tha Client named on the frant page of this Report.




