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From: Ma C.F (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 4 May, 2018 6:05 PM
To: ‘Kristy Tay Siew Hwa'
Subject: RE: FW: SDQ 2219L FINALIZATION
Dear Kristy,

Finalize Without Prejudice
Revised P/P$4293.48 and 5 w/days
Kindly confirm and revert.

Warmest Regards,

Ma Chin Fook

LKK Auto Consultants Pte 1.td
OFF :67418434

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: macf@lkkauto.com

From: Kristy Tay Siew Hwa [mailto:kristytay@sparkcarcare.com]

Sent: Thursday, 3 May, 2018 11:58 AM

To: Ma C.F (LKKAuto) :
Cc: Denis Teo Chin Chye; CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Operation
Subject: Re: FW: SDQ 2219L FINALIZATION .

Hi Ma

Thanks for your reply. As we are not aware of the amended finalized amount, kindly let me have the breakdown of
what item is not payable, thanks.

Best regards,

Kristy Tay

Crash Repair | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

DID 6383 7049 | FAX:6281 5767

kristytay@sparkcarcare.com

From:  "Ma C.F (LKKAuto)" <MaCF@lkkaufo.com> .
To: Kristy Tay Siew Hwa <kristytay@sparkcarcare.com>

Date: 02/05/2018 11:32 AM :
Subject: FW: SDQ 2219L FINALIZATION N




