Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 April, 2018 4:21 PM

To: Mohamed Shabir Abdul Hamid; Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Wong Guo Xiang; Natarajan Kavidha Rajan; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; CS A Team;
Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SGC408J - FINALISE

Attachments: DSCN3242.jpg; DSCN3243.jpg; DSCN3244.jpg; DSCN3245.jpg; DSCN3246.jpg;

DSCN3247.jpg; DSCN3248.jpg; DSCN3250.jpg; IMG_8123.jpg; IMG_8124 jpg; IMG_
8125.,jpg; IMG_8126.jpg; srvinvgen.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Shabir,

We confirm COR @ $6,775.80 with 4 Days.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

" Save the Larth Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 April, 2018 3:45 PM

To: Mohamed Shabir Abdul Hamid; Taufikh (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Wong Guo Xiang; Natarajan Kavidha Rajan; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: RE: SGC408) - FINALISE

Dear Shabir,

For future on direct settlement Third party cases, you may email to cs-a@lkkauto.com & admin-
a@lkkauto.com.

Dear Vic,

FYNA- CC3/A1G18004827/T1hb3



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mohamed Shabir Abdul Hamid [mailto:shabir.abdul.hamid@simedarby.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 17 April 2018 2:18 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Wong Guo Xiang <wong.guo.xiang@simedarby.com.sg>; Natarajan Kavidha Rajan
<natarajan.k.rajan@simedarby.com.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: SGC408) - FINALISE

Dear taufikh,
Attached pre invoice, before and after paint photos
Cor $ 6,775.80 before GST

Repair days 04

Please confirm

Regards,

Mohamed Shabir

Operations Executive

AutoFrance (PEUGEOT) /  Regent Motors (FORD)
C/0 Vantage Automotive Limited

DID: 6477 7375 HP: 9278 2711

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby
disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or
other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and
do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”



