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I V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

." /. A = . - 51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
"f—_. TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (8) PTELTD Ref : CC3/CTI18004747/K1ea3
L PRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079903 UL IO Mmlmmmnn |||I
Code: CTI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBG 3784R Veh. Inspected SHA 8275P
Policy No. DMCVSN1751861700 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D01519C02 Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 13/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5, General Information
Accident Date  10/03/2018 llnapectlon Date 12/03/2018

Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969

5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

—— == e == e
From: Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 3 April, 2018 9:48 AM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG3784R (Ol : CTI - SNM18D01519C02)
and SHA9275P (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18004747/K1ea3) on 10.03.2018
Attachments: MSAT18039840-GBG3784R pdf
Categories: HMEK
Dear Sirs,

Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Regards,

Lucas Lee

Claims Depariment {Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.
3, Anzon Road, #16-00

Springleat Tower,

Singapore 079809

Co. Reg. Mo, 200208384E

DID: 6389 6181

Fax: 6224 7175

Email: claimsdept ntaiping.com

Ermail: lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 2 April, 2018 12:10 PM

To: Lucas Lee

Ce: Chong Boon Sen; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG3784R (Ol : CTI - SNM18D01519C02) and SHAS275P (TP : LEK
REF - CC3/CTI18004747/K1ea3) on 10.03.2013

Dear 5ir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | Si408933)

From: Lucas Lee [mailto:lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com]
Sent: Thursday, 22 March, 2018 4:48 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com=>



Cc: Chong Boon Sen <bognsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG3784R (Ol : CTI - SNM18D01519C02) and SHA9275P (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/CTI118004747/K1ea3) on 10.03.2018

Dear 5irs,
Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Chong Boon Sen

Regards,

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Mator)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3, Anson Road, #16-00

Springleal Tower,

Singapore 079908

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6181

Fax: 6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Email: lucas.lee iping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 16 March, 2018 5:29 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG3784R (01 : CAl - TBA) and SHAS275P (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18004747/K1ea3) on 10.03.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir /Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case.
We had inspected TP vehicle SHA 9275P at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang).
Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

- TP GIA report
Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 o055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com
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CHINA TAIPING CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD

3 Ansan Rcad #148-00 Springlenl Tower Singapore OTRRN
Tal: 6380 6111 Few: B227 1033

Wiehnte, v ng Crlngeig. GO

Co. Hog. Mo 200208384E

Cur Reference: SNM18D01519/C02/5

Date . 22 MARCH 2018 via Ordinary & Registered Mail

ESHAN LOGISTICS SERVICES
10 ANSON ROAD

#26-04 INTERNATIONAL PLAZA
SINGAPORE 079903

Dear Sir/ Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG3784R AND SHA9275P ON 10 MARCH 2018
ALONG JURONG EAST AVE 1 ES50 STATION INSIDE

We refer to the abovementioned accident,

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, SHA9275P | is filing a third party property claim
against your vehicle.

\We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf and
they will soon contact you for more information about the accident, Kindly render your assistance
and co-operation accordingly.

We understand that you or your driver has not filed an accident report within 24 hours as per Motor Claims
Framework. We would urge you to comply with the condition to file your accident report with your vehicle
{whether damaged or not) to us IMMEDIATELY through LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd or any of our

authorized workshops. You may log onto our website www.sg.cntaiping.com for location of the respective

workshops.

We regret to advice that we and/or LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd will not be handiing the third party claim
and your NO CLAIM DISCOUNT will be penalized upon renewal of your policy if you fail to comply
with the condition of reporting.

Yours truly,
Claims Department

{This is a computer generated letter and no signafure is required.)

CC : LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Aftn i ASHER
Ref : CCI/CTIMB004T4TIK1EAS
Contact No . 68416051
via Email : ASHER@ELKKAUTO.COM

CC : Agent - (ANOB33A) - SKYLINK INSURANCE AGENCY PTELTD

FOZ/LKKDSANR-2013



“OMFOR1

—

_EN'GINEERENC:
marmbar of COMFORIDELGRO Date/Time: 1203 - 2018:12:42 page : 1
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CITY CAB PTE LTD

[y "

T |
VT T T

REPAIR ESTIMATE*
VEHICLE'NO : SHA 9275P DATE 12/3/2018 11:32
MAKE . e B

".'-._:" [:._'l

MODEL - HYUNDAI i40

| Quy Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price Amount I

Front Bumper Cover P 56230 |50
22.40

$
S
Front Bumper Retainer Mounting b 9.20
Headlamp (RH) - sl & 1.388.00
S
S
$

%
Front Bumper Bracket Top (RH) °

Front Fender (RH) f19.00

Front Fender Shield (RH) 169,80
Fronmt Fender Retainer x 9.20
SUB TOTAL § 277990
LESS 20%: 5 55508
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 2,223.92
Front Fender Advertisement Logo (RH) / 8 100.00 |Nett
% 100.00
Labour Charge Jon
Panel Beating 5 j@ﬁ'ﬁ,{; P
Spray Painting Charge S 566010 6
Wiring Charge $ sgn | 2
Tuff Kote § 5000 | 2e
TOTAL LABOUR S L100.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL $ 342392
_

Ka K*‘ (ﬁ?‘/
/7 1AM /500 |
2 Hr et
74
feb

poit plet

ad and

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the-abeve-vehtele—Fhefmatrepatir quantim w1l

be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company,




CITY CAB PTE LTD

: Canstix »
REPAIR ESTIMATE* cio ;
VEHICLENO : SHA 9275P DATE 12/3/2018 11:32
MAKE ; L =
. + . t}uﬁ I: O o .j_JI L.HQD
MODEL : HYUNDAI i40 =
Qty Parts Description/ Labour Tvpe Unit Price Amount
Front Bumper Cover -~ G g Jos L=
(.
Front Bumper Bracket Top (RH) N 22.40
Front Bumper Retainer Mounting X 5 9.20
Headlamp (RH) ~ b $ 1,388.00
Front Fender (EH) ﬁ" 5 619.00
Front Fender Shield (RH) <7 §  169.80
Front Fender Retainer g 3 9.20
SUB TOTAL § 2,779
LESS 20% § 555.98
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 2223.92
Front Fender Advertisement Logo (RH) / e 5 100,00 |Neti
8 100.00
Labour Charge Son
Panel Beating 5 }D@"ﬁl R
Spray Painting Charge b M
Wiring Charge 5 e[ 2
Tuff Kote $ 5600 | 2
TOTAL LABOUR 5 L100.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL $ 342392
Vols (Ul
/7 2 15
2 M7
LKK Adlte Consullants hence natify
e / the Repairer of a: ‘
ot f’/ ﬂ”;f /‘4 O L Us ot
J&Fﬂ / o H egurvey
s Part
*Ti Prigiudice” basts
» 5L deved and
& o [ '.""}anj'
This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of thg .-,111:‘-‘1“-:‘ -fi"tfﬁi'i'!f. Thefftal repair quantum will
he prepared afier the vehicle 1s surveyed by a motor Survevir ;@i;u_r.';n;'-.-.i by the insurunce company. n




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS)

CUSTOMER: 7010070

ADDRESS : CITYCAB PTELTD
183 SIN MING DRIVE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717
63351188

JOB / PARTS DESCRIPTION

JOB NO

REGN NO
MILEAGE
MAKE

MODEL

DATE OF REGN
DATE/TIME IN

ACCIDENT DATE

Date: 13.03.2018
Time; 12:43:35
Page: 1

305124072
SHAS275F
DOO00OC
HYUNDAI

1-40

07.04.2016
10.03.2018 23:30
10.032018

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

PART REQUISITION

0001 04-01-0103-2322-A  140V3 BUMPER W LIF & FOG

0002 04-01-0103-0782-A  140V2 LAMP ASSY-HEAD RH#

0003 04-01-0103-0573-G  140VC PANEL-FENDER RH#

JOB NATURE

0000 L Advetisement - RHF Fender

0001 L PANEL BEATING

0002 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA
0003 17-01 WIRING CHARGE

0004 20-00 TUFF COAT ON AFFECTED PARTS.

1.052.20 20.00 841.76
1, 388.00 20,00 1.110.40
6£19.00 20.00 49520

SUB-TOTAL

100.00

300,00

360,00

20.00

20.00

SUB-TOTAL

;244736

800.00



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD Date: 13.03.2018

Time; 12:43:35
REPAIR ESTIMATE Page: 2
COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) JOB NO 305124072
CUSTOMER: 7010070 REGN NO SHA9275P
ADDRESS : CITYCAB PTELTD MILEAGE OO00000000
383 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE HYUNDAI
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 375717 MODEL [-40
65551188 DATE OF REGN 07.04.2016
DATETIME IN 10.03.2018 23:30
ACCIDENT DATE 10.03.2018

JORB / PARTS DESCRIPTION

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

MVA NAME & SIGNATURE
DATE :

TOTAL : 3247306

——— . AUTHORISED : YES / NO
SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE

DATE :



COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

Our Job Ref No 305124072

Date : 13. Mar. 2018 gamgﬂﬂs'ggﬁ Erg'nﬂ:_f;ﬂrg Plei
Fax: 6546 8156

FINALIZATION FORM

To LKK Fax:

Attn - KALVIN

Vehicle Reg No. SHAS275P Date of Accident: 10/03N1E8

The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned venhicle are as follows:-

1 The repair job shall bill to: CHINA GBG3ITE4R
2. The finalized amount shall be:
ja)  Spare Pars after List discount _ §2,547.38
{b)  Labour Charges £700.00
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost $3,247.36
ic.) Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less: - -
Final Lumpsum Repair cost -
3 Estimated normal pericd for repairs: 2 working days
4, We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed if there is no reply from you
within 7 working days
5 Thank you for your assistance. We confirm the estimates and
finalized amount
Z 4
Signature Signature :
Name Mame f(a..'"-—-'\
Tel . 6214 8316 Date - 1@ f2 )P
Fax ;G546 8156
For Dfficial Use Only
Document
Item Amount Altached | Corfirm By Remarks
(Signature)
Yes or No

sk

. Rental Rate P/Day

YES

Loss of Income Paid

Survey Fees

LTA Search Fee

S B [ I

Medical Fees (on behalf
of driver, if applicable)

Cwermun

o

Remarks:




' 7 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

.H'; :; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Faderation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Ref .  CC3/CTI1B004747/K1eadn
2 PRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 Daln: mgowale ” mmmmwwm
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBG 3784R Veh. Inspected SHA 9275P
Policy No. DMCVSN1751861700 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D01519/C02 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 12/03/2018
p Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMGUD85714 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 208737 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 TRIANGLE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 TRIANGLE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[205/60 R16 TRIANGLE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 TRIANGLE 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  10/03/2018 |inspection Date 12/03/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD
58 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




' V4 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

.'_,; BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX  B256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R. GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHA 9275P

: Estimate usted
aty Description of Parts Condition mm:np?{n ouL "‘{‘;1]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER COVER DEFORMED 1,062.20 1.052.20
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET TOP (RH) SERVICEABLE 22.40 -
1|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER MOUNTING SERVICEABLE 9.20 .
1|HEADLAMP (RH) GRAZED 1,388.00 1,388.00
1|FRONT FEMDER (RH) DENTED 619.00 619.00
1|FRONT FENDER SHIELD (RH) SERVICEABLE 169.80 -
1|FRONT FENDER RETAINER SERVICEABLE 9.20 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -653.96 -511.84
2,615.84 2,447 36
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT FENDER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (RH) (SN} MECESSARY 100.00 100.00
100.00 100.00
LABOUR
PAMEL BEATING . 500.00 300.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE . 500.00 360.00
WIRING CHARGE. 50.00 20.00
TUFF KOTE. 50.00 20.00
1,100.00 700.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,815.84 3,247.36
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 3,247.36|

Report Ref No. CC3/CTI18004747/K1ea3n2

KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor | Investigator Automotive ASsessor




