Asher Sna (LKKAuto)

From: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 13 April 2018 2:22 PM

To: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto); Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS, Claims): ECICS Claims

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Policy no : MPC16A00228600 SIVI354K DOA 25/10/16

(O/ref;: DMPC1600409H}

Hi Asher

Please proceed as recommendation to reject TP claim.
Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: +65 6303 0182
FAX: +65 6338 9267

ECICS Limited
7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsurvey@ecics.com.sq
directly.

**please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of claims.
Thank you for your kind patience and understanding.**

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 12 April, 2018 10:24 AM

To: Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS, Claims); Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims); ECICS Claims

Cc: Admin A

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Policy no : MPC16A00228600 SIVS354K DOA 25/10/16 (O/ref: DMPC1600409H)
Importance: High

Hi Phoebe /[ Janice,

We refer to the above matter.

TP reported that OID collided into his vehicle while overtaking OID stationary vehicle.
Ol reported that TP overtake his vehicle while he making a right turn.

Enclosed a copy of insured document of successful claim against third party.

In view of the above, we are intending to reject TP claim.

For your approval/ comments/ instruction.

Thank You.



Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Cose Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

phone: 841-4051 | ernail: gshersng@lkkouto.com | fax. 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Indushial Park, Ukl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS, Claims) [mailto:Phoebelay Xie@ecics.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 8 March 2018 5:34 PM

To: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Policy no : MPC16A00228600 SJV9354K DOA 25/10/16 (O/ref. DM PC1600409H)

Dear Asher,
As requested.
Thank you.
Best Regards,

Phoebe Jay Xie

ECICS Limited
DID: +65 6303 D180
FAX: +65 6338 9267

Email: phoebejay xie@ecics.com.sg
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 8 March, 2018 5:19 PM

To: Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS, Claims)

Cc: Admin A; SUR

Subject: RE: Policy no : MPC16A00228600 SJV9354K DOA 25/10/16 (O/ref: DMPC160040SH)

Hi Phoebe,
Please kindly let us have insured GIA report.

Thank You.

Best Regords,

Asher Sng | Case Handier

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

phone; 6841-6051 | email: gshersng@lkkguto.com | foax: 4741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | §{408933)



From: Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS, Claims) [mailto:Phoebelay Hie@ecics.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, & March 2018 5:00 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Policy no : MPC16A00228600 SJV9354K DOA 25/10/16 (O/ref: DMPC1600409H)

Dear Asher,

Please reopen file and proceed with direct settlement.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Phoebe Jay Xie

ECICS Limited
DID: +65 63032 0180
FAX: +65 6338 9267

Email: phoebejay xie@ecics.com.sq
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 8 March, 2018 10:00 AM

To: Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS, Claims)

Cc: Admin A; SUR

Subject: RE: Policy no : MPC16A00228600 51V9354K DOA 25/10/16 (O/ref: DMPC1600409H)

Hi Phoebe,

We refer to the email below.

Our survey report was submitted to your good office on 30/11/2016.

We will inform workshop to expedite on the LOD to be send to your good office.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

phone: §841-64051 | emall: gshesna@lkkauto.com | foan; 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ui Indusirial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS, Claims) [mailto:Phoebela

Sent: Thursday, 8 March 2018 9:55 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Policy no : MPC16A00228600 SJVS354K DOA 25/10/16 (O/ref: DMPC1600409H)
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Dear Asher,

Please advise on this survey as we have not receive the letter of demand.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Phoebe Jay Xie

ECICS Limited

DID: 465 6303 0180
FAX: +65 b338 9267

Email: phoebejay xie@ecics.com.sqg

From: Ashley Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 24 November, 2016 2:48 PM

To: Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS, Operations / Claims); ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO,COM
Cc: sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: Policy no : MPC16A00228600 SIVO354K DOA 25/10/16
Dear Phoebe,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Ashley Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Phoebe Jay Xie (ECICS, Operations / Claims) [mailto:Phoebelay Xie@ecics.com.sgl
Sent: Thursday, 24 November, 2016 2:49 PM

To: Ashley Chong (LKK Auto); SUR

Subject: Policy no : MPC16A00228600 SJV9354K DOA 25/10/16

Dear Ashley,
Please survey SHD54915 and submit your report to us, thank you

Best Regards,

Phoebe Jay Xie



ECICS Limited
DID: +65 6303 0180
EaX: +65 6338 9267

Email: ph jay_xig@eci

follow us on T follow us nnE visit our website
facebook twitter &3 ecics.com.sg

B} BT

S BRI

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee or
undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opiniens
contained in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee indicated in
his message [or responsible for delivery of the message Lo such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy
this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Dpinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do not necessarily represent
the views of ECICS Limited.



Asher SnE (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 13 April 2018 2:31 PM

To: 'yuging.teo’; 'Ng Wai Yin'; 'Jasmine Tan’

Cc ‘claims@transcab.com.sg’

Subject: RE: Your Ref: AAD1610-306--SJV9354K & SHD54915S on 25.10.16
Attachments: Ol SKETCH PLAN.pdf; Ol COUNTER CLAIM SETTLEMENT.pdf

Without Prejudice
Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We attached here with a copy of our insured's accident statement and insured document of successful claim against
your client for your easy reference.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client’s claim,

Thank You.
Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler

LEK Aulo Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fox: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Indusiral Park, Ubi Averue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 6 April 2018 10:18 AM

To: 'yuging.teo' <yuging.teo@transcab.com.sg>; 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>
Ce: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: RE: Your Ref: AAD1610-306--5JV9354K & SHD54915 on 25.10.16

Without Prejudice

Hi Yu Qing,

We refer to the email below.

We are still pending instruction from our principal.

Shall revert to you in due course.

Thank You.

Best Regards,



Asher Sng | Cose Handier
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: gshersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industial Park, Ubi Averiue |, #02-25 | §{408933)

From: yuging.teo [mailto:yuging.teo@transcab.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 6 April 2018 10:04 AM

To: 'Ng Wai Yin' <walyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) <Ashersn lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg
Subject: RE: Your Ref: AAD1610-306--5)V9354K & SHD54915 on 25.10.16

Dear Asher,
Are there any updates?
Thank you.
Best Regards,
Teo Yu Qing
Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.306
++* plegse be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
ﬁ TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111
— : Main Line: (65) 287 &666 Fax Line: [65) 6287 7764
a 1! Website: www . franscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. 1t may alsoe be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you
fave received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete It from your system,; you may not copy this messags ar
disclase its contents to anyone. Pleass send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-malls are not screened TFor

response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.n
Sent: Friday, 9 March, 2018 12:43 PM

To: 'Asher Sng (LKKAuto)' <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; ‘claims@transcab.com.sg' <claims@transcab.com.sg>
Subject: FW: Your Ref: AAD1610-306--5]V5354K & SHD54915 on 25.10.16

transcab.com.sg]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Asher

Enclosed is the GIA report and LOD for your perusal and action.
Original hard copy will pass to Kenneth's to bring back to your office.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Mg Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308



«** plegse be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

ﬁ TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
N Nea. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 369111
/--.C“ Main Line; (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www . franscab.com.sg

This message |5 confidential, It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. 1f you
have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; yau may not copy this massade o
disclose |ts contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for
esponse deadlings. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 8 March, 2018 10:05 AM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref: AAD1610-206

Hi Wai Yin,

We refer to our tele-conversation.

Please kindly expedite the LOD and send it to our principal ECICS soon.
Please kindly attn the LOD to Phoebe Jay Xie.

ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>

Thank You,

Best Reqards.

Asher Sng | Cose Handler

LKK Aute Consultants Ple Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: gshersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
8lk 51, Paya Ubi Indusiral Pork, Ubi Averue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



Ta .-'F;rl

Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

Qur Ref - AAD1610-306
Your Ref ¢+ SJV9354K
Date : 08 March 2018

ECICS LIMITED
Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD5491S AND SJV9354K ON 25/10/16 09:00 PM ALONG BLK
472 SEGAR ROAD

It appears that the above accident was caused by your insured's negligence. We, therefore
seeking compensation from you for our financial loss as itemized below :-

1, Cost of Repair (inclusive of 7% G5T) % 246100

2 Loss of Rental for ' days @ 963  per day £ 674.10

3; Loss of Income for 1 days @ $_=° _ per day $ 350.00

4, LTA Search Fee % 6.00

5. Survey Fee $ 0.00
Total $ 3,491.10

We enclose a copy of the following documents for your consideration :-

GIA report lodged by our driver Rental rate and mileage records

Certificate of Insurance Authorization To Act

Original final repair bill LTA Search Fee

Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 14 days, failing which we shall
proceed to hand over the conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further
ref_gﬁfnce to you.

N
Yours Faithfully
ans -%::Sewices Pte Ltd

General Manager
Tel No. : 6603 1250 (DID)
Note : Please email any further correspondence to claims@transcab.com.sg (6603 125%)



Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd
Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel: 6287 6666

Fax: 6287 7764

Co. Reg. No.. 201013626G

GST Reg. No.: 201019626G Tax Invoice / Debit Note
TO:
ECICS LIMITED INVOICE NO.  : INV1B02-191
6337 4779 DATE : 28. February 2018
7 TEMASEK BOULEVARD REFERENCE NO : AAD1610-306
#10-01 SUNTEC TOWER OME TERMS :
038987 Singapore DUE DATE : 28, February 2078
ATTEMTIOMN: 6337 4779 PAGE i1
i_hlﬂ. CODE DESCRIPTION aTy UNIT PRICE AMDUNT!
1. BOS010T REPAIR-SHDG54915;D0A 25.10.16(LUMP SUM-18) i 246100 246100
Total SGD Excl. G5T: 2,300.00
7% GST: 161.00
++++ TWO THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED SIXTY ONE SGD ONLY **** Total SGD Incl. GST : 2,461.00

1) All cheques should be crossed and made payable ta™Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Lid"

2) Please gquote our Invaice Number during payment

3) We reserve the right to charge mterest @ 1.5% per manth on averdue invoice

4) Any dispute as 1o the accuracy, charges etc of this invoice must be eommunicated within 10 days from the date hereof tailing which it shall be
deemed to have been unconditionally accepted.

E.& 0.E
THIS IS A COMPUTER GENERATED INVOICE WHICH REQUIRES NO SIGNATURE




Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

08 March, 2018

To Whom It May Concern

Dear Sir / Madam,
Accident on 25/10/16 09:00 PM at BLK 472 SEGAR ROAD

1. We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd is the
registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle reg@:ra‘tmn no. SHD5491S. The taxi was hired to LEE KONG
WAH a registered hirer-operator of Trans-Ca | gﬁge Ltd at the time of occurrence of the
aforementioned accident at a rental rate $EE#S" «)c1uswe of GST).

o

URANCE PTE LTD on a third party basis at the

2

2, Please be advised that the Taxi is insured with AX
material time of the accident.

-

3 Please liaise with us directly for any settlement of claims in respect of the said accident.

Yours faithfully,

Jasmine Tan

General Manager

This is @ computer generated print-out. No signature is required.



Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

Authorization To Act

We, Trans-cab Services Pte Ltd of Company Registration No. 200303878K hereby authorize
Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd to act on behalf to claim for all losses incurred for the
accident involving SHD5491S and SJV9354K along BLK 472 SEGAR ROAD on 25/10/16 09:00
PM.

In addition, we also hereby authorize the above payment to be made in favour of Trans-cab
Auto Services Pte Ltd upon settlement.

Dated this 8 (day) of March 2018

Yours Faithfully
Trans; ﬁﬁg:vices Pte Ltd

d
7

]~
Jasmine Tan
General Manager




Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

25-10-2016

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that the taxi was undergo accident repair in the workshop as follow:

Date In Date Out Vehicle No.
Accident No. AAD1610-306 Accident Date 25-10-2016
26/10/2016 1/11/2016 SHDZ4915

Yours Faithfully,
nﬁ@ Services Pte Ltd

Jasmine Tan

General Manager
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Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No. SJV9354K As At 25 Oct 2016 /

21:00:00 )

Law Firm Search Details

Search Reason: Insurance claim in relation to traffic accident
Law Firm Case No.. TCS(CANDY)SHDE481S

Current Owner Details

Owner 10 Type: Singapore NRIC

Owner 1D: SB307057I

Owner Name; RASHIDAH BINTE RAHMAD

Registered Address Type: HDB/ HUCC
Regisiered BlackHouse

3 472
Mo.:
Registered Street Name:  SEGAR ROAD
Regsisred Unt No.. # 15 - 254

Registered Building Name:

Registered Postal Code; 670472

Current Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo SJVE354K

Make Description/Model: CITROEN / C4 VTR 1.6 THP BuA AT DVAB 2WD SDR PSR
Insurance Company Name: ECICS LIMITED
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