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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX 5256 4315
Reg. Mo 189507198R GST Reg No, 19-9507128-R

t.
E

Affiliated 1o Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref | CC4/ASM18004638/Ukb3
o eRSespome ossar i | | |11
Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
insured Vah. SKB T1T0E Vah. Inspected SJA 65768
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 12/03/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine Nao, HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometar - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
1. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
RiH Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mim
4, Description of Damages
5. ] General Information
Accident Date  07/03/2018 |Inspection Date 09/03/2018

Survey held at FASTECHAUTO PTELTD

1 KAK| BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-48/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
BiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Business

Owner ID: 6832)

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No. SIAL576S
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended De-registration 09 Mar 2018
Date:

Viehicle Make: TOYOTA

Vehicle Model: COROLLA AXIO 1.5X A
Primary Calour; Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2007

Engine No.: 1NZC758628
Chassis No.: NZE1416052446
Maximum Power Qutput: 81.0kW (108 bhp)
Open Market Value: $11.790.00
Original Registration Date: 17 Dec 2007

First Registration Date: 17 Dec 2007
Transter Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: £12.949.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Forfeited

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 16 Dec 2022
COE Category: A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 5

PQP Paid $21.34%9.00

COE Rebate Amount: $20.34100

Total Rebate Amount: $20,3561.00

Message

Page | of 2

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when

the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier

The information contained herein is correct as at 0% Mar 2018

hitps://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By Public BeforeDeregInput 7FUNCTION _1D=F030400...

09-Mar-18
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Vic (LKKAuto)

e —

From: Nancy Lam <nancy lam@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 4 October, 2018 10:59 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Jjason@fastechauto.com.sg; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJAB5765 AND SKB7170E ON D7.02.2018 *LKK

REF: CC4/ASM18004638/Uhb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Vic,

We do accept your offer as below.

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pte Lid
Tel: 6746 5403

Fax: 6745 8520

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpehi@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, October 1, 2018 3:37 PM

To: Nancy Lam <nancy lam@fastechauto.com.sg>

Ce: jason(@ fastechauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-af@lkkauto.com>; Vie (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@]lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJA65765 AND SKB7170E ON 07.02.2018 *LKK
REF: CC4/ASMI18004638/UIhb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Nancy,
We refer further to our below email.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we offer settlement of global sum of $5,800.00 (all in) to settle
your client's claim.

If agreeable, kindly let the owner chop and sign the attached DV and forward to us a copy for our principal to
process the payment.

The above amount is to be made payable to KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD.

Thank you,

“Please nate thar our above offer and any settlement arising from the above affer are made on a without prejudice basis, and showld
not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of aur Insured Driver, Terms of such settlement should also
not be disclosed in any other relared matrer(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made
sulely to resolve this maiter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other
redated matiers,



Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: fi7gi-4108
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenoe 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

LK = o the farth Primt anly when necessary-

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged materal. and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a vialation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mall or any attached itams. Please delste the e-mail and all attachments, including any coples thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any coples theraof. Thank you.

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy.lam(@ fastechauto.com.sg|
Sent: Monday, 24 September, 2018 12:12 PM

To: Vie (LKKAuto)

Ce: jasona fastechauto.com.sg

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJA6576S AND SKB7170E ON 07.02.2018 *LKK
REF: CC4/ASMI18004638/Uhb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Vi,

Any update from AXA?

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pie Lid
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, August 15, 2018 11:49 AM

To: Nancy Lam <pancv.lam/af: 10.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-af@lkkauto.com>; Vie (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJIA65765 AND SKB7170E ON 07.02.2018 *LKK
REF: CC4/ASMI1B004638/Uhb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Nancy,

We refer to yvour below email,

Please be informed that we are still pending for mandate approval from our principal.

We will continue to follow up and will get back to you for an update/offer.



Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-3108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ui Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

F AL, i
SeIRER == Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the inlended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. I you belleve that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Plaase delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy lam(@fastechauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 15 August, 2018 10:16 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJA65765 AND SKB7170E ON 07.02.2018 *LKK REF:
CC4/ASM I B004638/Uhb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic.
Any update from AXA?

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pre Lid
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, May 24, 2018 10:20 AM

To: Nancy Lam <pancy.lam(@fastechauto.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vie (LKKAuto) <vicalpehi@lkkauto.com>; Bevan Lim (LKK
Auto) <bevanlim(@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJA6576S AND SKB7170E ON 07.02.2018 *LKK
REF: CC4/ASM1B004638/Uhb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Nancy,
Please be informed that we are in the midst of secking mandate approval to our principal.

We will follow up and will get back to you for an update/offer.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pova Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

LKK ST Sove the Earth- FPrint onfy when necessary’

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intanded recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe thai you received this e-mail in eror, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachmenis and any coples thereof. Thank you.

From: Nancy Lam [mailio:nancy. lam(@ fastechauto.com.sg|
Sent: Thursday, 24 May, 2018 10:12 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJA6576S AND SKB7170E ON 07.02.2018 *LKK REF:
CC4/ASMI8004638/Uhb3

Without Prejudice

Hi Vic.

Regard for the above vehicle.
Any update from AXA?

Please revert.

Regards,

Nancy Lam

IFastech Auto Pre Lid
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8320

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@ Ikkauto.com
Sent: Tuesday, May 15, 2018 4:57 PM
To: Nancy Lam <pancy.lam(@ fastechauto.com.sg>

Ce: jason(@fastechauto.com.sg; Vie (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@ lkkauto.com>; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

<bevanlim/@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-af@/|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJA65768 AND SKB7170E ON 07.02.2018 *LKK

REF: CC4/ASMI18004638/Uhb3
Without Prejudice
Hi Nancy.

Thank you lor your email.

The case is handled by Vic,



By copy to Vic.
FYNA, CC4/ASM180044638/Uhb3

Best Regirds,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy lam/@ fastechauto.com.sg|
Sent: Tuesday, 15 May 2018 3:50 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewhi(@lkkauto.com>

Ce: jasonfaifastechauto.com.sg
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJA65765 AND SKB7170E ON 07.02.2018

Without prejudice.

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Please refer to our LOD dated 22.03.2018.

We have yet to receive any reply pertaining to the claim settlement.
Please revert,

Regards,

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd

Tel: 6746 5405
Fax: 6745 8520



for172018 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP} =

<« Re:RE: Seek Mandate

Type
@ Question

Message
Hi LKK. please propose global sum at $5800. Thank you.

oply
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1332018

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner I1D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value;
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

PARFICOE Rebate Enquiry

Business

6832)

SJA65765

No

13 Mar 2018
TOYOTA
COROLLA AXIO 1.5X A
Grey

2007
INZC758628
NZE1416052444
81.0 kW (108 bhp)
$11,790.00

17 Dec 2007

17 Dec 2007

1

$12.969.00

Forfeited

$0.00

16 Dec 2022

A - Car (1600cc & below)

https:iivrl. te gov sg/itasrifacion/enguireRebateByPublicBeformDereginpul PTFUNCTION _ID=FO304008TT

12



Jd3mparpis PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

COE Period(Yearsk: 5

PQP Paid: $21.349.00
COE Rebate Amount: $20,315.00
Total Rebate Amount: $20,315.00
Message

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-

registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is
earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 13 Mar 2018

OK

hittps: /vl e gov sg/itavrlaction/enquinsRebateByPublicBaforeDereginput ?FUNCTION _ID=FO304008TT
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made difessnt
Certificate of Insurance

MOTOR VEHICLES [THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) ACT (CHAFTER 189]
MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISES AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1960

ROAD TRANSPORT ACT, 1987 (MALAYSIA)

MOTOR VEHICLES [THIRD PARTY RISKS) RLILES, 1953 [MALAYSIA)

Cartificate Numbaer: SOES0S8523 Cover : drivo CLASSIC
1. Indes mark and Registration Number of Vehicke : SIASS7ES
Charssis Number ] rqzmzﬁuﬁm
2. Name of Palicyholder _ 3 KYRO AUTOMOBILE
3. Effective Date of Insurance : 13 Nov 2017 '
4, Expiry Date of Insurance : 12 Nowv 2018
5. Persons or Olasses of Parsons entited to drives
{a] The Policyholdsr,

{bl Any ather person wha Is driving an the Policyholder’s order or with hisfher permssion.
Provided that the persan driving is permitted In accordance with the licensing or other laws or regulations to drive
the Motor Vehicle or has been so permitted and Is not disqualified by ordar of & Court of Law ar by raston of any
enactment or regulation In that behalf from driving the Mator Vehicle.
& Lmitations as to Used
{a] Wse for social domestic and pleasure purposes and In connection with the Polleyholder's or Hirer's business.
This Policy does not cover
{a) Use for racing, pace-making, reilability trial or speed-testing.
(b} Use for the carriage of goods (other than samples) In connection with any trada or husinese
(el Use for any purpose in connection with the Motor Trade.
# Uimitations rendered inoperative by Section B of the Motor Vehicke [Third Party Risks and Compensation)
Act {Chapter 189) and Section 95 of the Aoad Transport Act, 1987 (Mataysia), are rat to be included under these

headings
EXCESS (SECTION 1) - 852,000
EMCESS (SECTION 2) : 581,500
WINDSCREEN EXCESS : 55100
ADDITIONAL EXCESS | : N/A
UNNAMED DRIVER EXCESS : PLEASE REFER OVERLEAF
REPAIR AT OWNER'S PREFERRED WORKSHOP 1 NOD
IMSURE WITH CDE YES
MNCD PROTECTION : NO
TRANSPORT ALLOWANCE : ND
EXCESS WAIVER : MO
PRIMARY DRIVER . NJA
KAMED CHRIVER (1) s WA
RAMED DRIVER (2) D NJfA =
HIRE PURCHASE COMPANY : Ni& -
SUM INSURED ; MARKET VALUE OF INSURED VEHITLE AT TIME OF LOSS

o'W heraby Certify that the Policy to which this Certifica.e relates |s issued in accordance with the provisians of the Motor
‘vehicles (Third Party Risks and Compensation] Act (Chapter 188) and Part |V of the Road Transport Act, 1887 |Mataysia)

Agency : S& M ALLIANCE PTE LTD (D0000514373)
Oate of lxsue i 24 Mar 2017 17:03 hrs

For NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LUMITED

-
~




KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-50 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 199802379R

Date : 22.032018
AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
8 Shenton Way

#27-01 AXA Tower
Singapore 06881 |

Attn: Motor Claim Department

Deur Sir'Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES : SJA 65765 / SKB 717T0E ON 07.03.2018

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no; SJIA 653765 . which was imvolved in
in the captioned accident with vour insured vehicle no: SKBTIT0E . The vehicle owner has requested and

authorized us to assist him in presenting his/her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

1) Cost of Repair {inclusive of GST) 5 5,564.00

2) LessofUse (7days+ | Sunday X S860) 5 480,00

3} GIA Search Fee § 2.00
s 6.046.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair lnvoice b) GlA Search Resuli

¢) Letter of Authorisation, etc... d) GIA Repont

) Police Report f1 VC & Driving Licence

g) Insurance Certificate h) Vehicle Registration Log Card

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from vou on the settlement of our customer's claims
s soon as possible,

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you.
Yours faithfully,
¥

Jason Tang (jasondafastechauja.com.sg)
For KIM CHWEE AUTO PTELTD
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18 MARCH 2018

ONG REN KAI BENJAMIN
BLOCK 412 YISHUN RING ROAD
#0B-1893

SINGAPORE 760412

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF  CCHASMISOH6IS/UKLD

YOUR REF :SKB 7170E

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKB 7170E AND SJA 65765 ALONG ALEXANDRA ROAD
ON 07.03.2018

We refer to the above subject matter We write to Iinform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim
against your policy.

We have received a claim from FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD, acting on behalf of the owner
of SJA 65765 against your motor insurance policy

Based on the accident report, accident scenario. it was reported that your vehicle had
rear-ended the Third Party vehicle SJA 65765, As such, liability is down against us.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the
claim agains! your policy.

VWe shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek o take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defence, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the
following to Zaini a/lkkauto com within 10 days from the date of this letter_if not provided
al AXA's reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may
be required:

« Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)

Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles invelved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)



r Wry r
¥y L7V/

a - - - m

S BE =

LB AVE A28 PAYA UBEINIUSTHIAL PAKK, SINUATVIRE disui i Ik DS LI VER] AN E) 2 Ead VDS

« If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim againsl any of the involved Third
Party(s)., you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AXA's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us
at Solmio Ikt eoin)

Please guole the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

Zaini- -~

Case Handler

BID 8841 2132

FAX 6741 4108

Email: Zuinewe Ikksuto, com

cc.  AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (AXA)
(Motor Claims Dept)



DATE : |5 02 2018

0 fho INwlane Yepore Mo Wd

RE . ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLENO.  oiP 65368 | Sy A\3A0F

aong 0 Rd o Jlon et fleah > Meandia Rd
on_01.03.701%

I'We. K‘{m I\Uﬁmabﬂ{?

I —
of (NRIC No/ROC Noy ___ S0156832.J
of | Rubt Ptk Gesent ¥ 0y-25 WCRAA T (3) 6SB06Y
owner of vehicle no, P (3169 in consideration of M/s KIM CHWEE AUTO
PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle ﬂﬁ 654“‘-6 S at my/our instruction and hereby
authorise M/s KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD 1o demand claim settlement whatever
amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal
proceedings. if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs. car rental and/or loss of use.

ete, and to their appointing solicitor 1o act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I/'We further agree and undertake to indemnily them against the above-mentioned claim cost
which may arisen therewith.

Signature of Owner :

Name of Owner




M redefining /insurance

CLAIM REF : S58MDOACY
INSURED : ONG REN KAl BENJAMIN

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We/l, KYRO AUTOMOBILE, CO. REG. NO.53156832] hereby agree to accept the sum of dollars FIVE
THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED ONLY (5$5.800.00) paid to us/me by AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD as full

and final settlement of all claims of whatever kind including damages for personal injuries and
damages to property that we/l may have against the said AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD or their Insured
or the driver of motor vehicle no. SKB 7170E as a result of an accident along ALEXANDRA ROAD on
07.03.2018 of which we/l were/was the driver/ owner/ hirer/ passenger/rider/pillion/ insurer of
maotor vehicle no. SJA 65765.

We/l hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/or driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SKB 7170E in connection directly or
indirectly with the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/| hereby declare that we/l are/am the person(s) entitled to receive the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in
respect of this settlement.

It is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of liability whatsoever
on the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SKB 7170E.

Datedthis __ °5 . day of vl 2018
Claimant’s Signature : "f, ]
NRIC no./ Company Stamp : Szttt
Occupation/ Business . Durac b
Address
Telephone No. .
Witness's Name . M TANG JUN ZHONG
4 oo/ U4986H
Witness's Signature
Witness's NRIC No.
AXA Insurance Pta Ltd (Company Reg. No. 10900351 2M)
8 Shanton Way. #2401 AXA Towes, Singapore 088811
Customer Centre #81-01

Tel: +55 6880 4888 Fax: +65 6338 2522 Website: www.axa.com.sg



TAX INVOICE

KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD
I Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-50 Autobay

Singapore 417883
Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520

Tax Reg No: 199802379R

Tax Invoice : 20183
AXA Insurance Singapore Pre Lid

8 Shenton Way Date 22.03.2018
#27-01 AXA Tower Viehicle No SIA 65768
Singapore 06881 | Make'Model  TOYOTA AXIO
Chossis/Eng#
Atin : Motor Claim Department Accident Daie  107.03.2018
Claim Mo
Reference 0318 -20183
Policy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair 55 5200.00
E.&O.E l'otal : S$ 200,00
GST (@ 7% : S8 364.00
Amount Due - S8 5564.00

for KIM CHWEE AUT® PTE LTD

All Invoices are subjected to GST



Invoice Page | of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
I"M Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am 1o S5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No GR-18-036815
Dale of Request: 05/032018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Aulo Ple Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Avenus G #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 08/0372018

Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

TP Vehicle No SKBT170E

Accident Date 070372018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SKBT1T0E Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid 24/06/2017-23/06/2018 |6461 6555
SKB7170E AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 06/11/2017-08/11/2018 |5338 7288
Thank You,

The images provided 1o you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no lability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising out af or in connection with the reports or thelr images

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ... 09-Mar-18



Invoice

Gl

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 D030
Operaling Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE C°7 Registration No: M400017733

Our Ref No: GR-18-036815
Date of Request 09/03/2018

Kim Chwee Aulo Pte Lid
1 Kaki Bukil Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kak Bukit

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No Online Purchase

Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 09/03/2018

Enguiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

TP Vehicle No. SKBT1TOE

Accident Date 071032018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S§)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amouni D13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use:

Date

[X] GIRG [ ] Cash[] Cheque

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ... (9-Mar-18



THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
['d‘ehinli No: PKB TiT0E (Insd veh)| Modael: TPVD TOYOTA COROLLA
FJA'EFFES (TP veh) 1.5 X AXIO (A)
Data of Accident: P‘munmn

Global Sum Settlement || [X] Yes l [ 1 No
Repair Estimate '8 13,889,
Final Repair Cost -1 5,564.00
Loss of Use £ 480,004 Bdays al $60 .00 per day
Rental {if any) 5 days
LTA [ GIA Search Fea 5 2.00
[Umms: E 0.00
Final Setflement Sum (Global Sum) -] 5.800.00

1s Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [X ] NO  (Kindlyindicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability __ 100___ (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenano No.

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (") %)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain colfisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.

Remarks

ﬁaymmt Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) KIM CHWEE AUTO PFTELTD - 5,800.
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 311272018
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting decuments to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Involce; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill (if any)
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