Vic (LKKAuto)

m

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent; Thursday, 31 January, 2019 11:41 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: <5EEK MANDATE> RE: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020459 SJN4143C. Our ref

28.4/3.18/SHD3496 HO TL LKK REF CC4/LPC18004633/K1hb3

Dear Vic,

We proposed the following quantum:-

Cost of repair $10,410.69

Loss of rental (hirer) $ 1,638.00 (14 days x $117)
Loss of Income(hirer) $  700.00 (14 days x $50)
Loss of Income (relief) $ 700.00 (14 days x $50)
Total $13,448.69

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tgi_i (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

| Y=
o

— T

F._ The all mew . Jonpac.com.sg
3

#
F
dhkE

I

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 28 January, 2019 3:36 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); MT_Claim_SG

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Your ref: 18/18/18/VP05/020459 5IN4143C, Our ref; 28.4/3.18/SHD3496 HO TL
LKK REF CC4/LPC18004633/K1hb3

10,410.69Your Ref: 18/18/18/VvP05/020459
Our Ref: CC4/LPC18004632/K1hb3

Dear Gerald,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SIN 4143C (O1) AND SHD 34965 (TP) ON 06/03/2018 ALONG SYED ALWI ROAD

We refer to the above matter,

We refer to the assignment dated 12 March 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.
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Our Ref : 28.4/3.18/SHD34968 HO TL HECFIVFH L/
-5 OCT 2018
k- Transporta
1 October 2018 iéDF{.q CT é‘ é‘ azsacs‘i?.:uunng megnr;:am E]l%;. :?
Mamine +85 G555 1188
Facsimia +65 6453 3163
Lonpac Insurance Bhd 5
300, Beach Road hsRRetomag
#17-04/07 The Concourse Camgny P shon . 16330821

Singapore 199555

Dear Sirs

ACCIDENT ON 6.3.2018

ALONG JALAN BESAR / SYED ALWI ROAD
INVOLVING SHD34965 AND SJN4143C

We refer to the above matter in which you were the insurer of motor vehicle
Registration No: SJN4143C.

From the circumstances of the accident, we are of the opinion that the accident
arose as a result of your insured's negligent driving.

Qur loss in this connection comprises the following:

1 Total Loss Value 5%510,410.69
2 30 days' loss of rental @ $117.00 per day 3,510.00
3 30 days' loss of earnings for hirer @ $80.00 per day 2,400.00
4 30 days’ loss of earnings for relief driver @ $80.00 per day 2,400.00

Total: S5318,720.69

Enclosed are all the relevant documents for your attention.

We would also like to inform you that Miss Teo Ban Eng Mary was the registered
hirer and Mr Leong Yeow Choe was the registered relief driver of motor vehicle
SHD34968 at the material time of the above accident. As such, we are assisting
them to claim against you for their losses arising from the accident.

Kindly let us have your settlement of our claim within the next two weeks from the
date of this letter.

Yours faithfully

RY

Christine Tay
Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

A maember of u?s
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COMFORIDELGRO
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LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLATM NO  : 18/18/18/VP05/020459
DATE : 31 JANUARY 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SJN 4143C the sum of
Singapore Dollars Thirteen Thousand Four Hundred Forty Eight and Cents Sixty Nine
Only ($13,448.69) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property
claim competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in
respect of property claim sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become
manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident 1o my vehicle, SHD
3469S on 06 MARCH 2018 along SYED ALWI ROAD.

I /We herecby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (HO KEE CHONG /
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made
by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S
COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD

[/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Name of vehicle owner/Date



SALES CONTRACT L/

CONTRACT NO,: C4714

MESSRS ComfortDelGro Englneering Pte Ltd
205 Braddell Road
EINGAPORE 508959

Lemlfort

L 2

Mainling +65 G555 1188
Focsimile <85 6453 1183

Compary Angizimiion Mo 1901008R
Company Regaalion Mo 1D0S00RYSG

e CiiyCab

Comfert Transportotion Pte Lid
CltyCabs Pte Ltd

303 5in Ming Drive Singapore 575717

wirw,coglonl.com,sg

Wy hereby confirm having seld o you the lallowing Goods on the date menlioned below under the lerms and conditions staled hereundar,
Allached vehicle number listing are incorporaled hiereln and make a parl of this conlracl, You are requesied |o sign and relain the original
and relurn the duplicale provided herewlin. If any discrepancy is lound, please Inform us immedialely,

ICONDITION ;

1, All Logo/Letlering Must be Scrapped OFf In Any Way.

2, Vehicls |s Mol Allewed On The Road When |t Has Been De-Registered,

3. Vehicle As Per lis Fresent Condilion,

4. Shipping Document/Bill Of Lading Must Be lssuadiGiven Ta Us Within 14
Days From The Day OF Sales Contract,

Il This Term is Unfulfiled, A Penalty Of $200.00 Per Day Per Taxi And Other
LTA Charges Will Be Borne By The Buyer

Article & Description Quantity | Unit Price Amount
{Units)
HY LINDAL 140 (EURD §) 2 $1,100.00 $2,200.00
$2,200.00
GST T PERCENT $154.00
Tolal Singapere Dellar:  Tweo Thousand Thrae Hundred And Fifty-Four $2,354.00

Contracl Dale 04042018

Tender Closed Date 3

Relerenca Date » RAN204T

Referance Mumber : GP-TQ17185

SnipmenyDelivery Payment  © Full Payment Upen Signing This Conlract
Defivery Allowance ¢ Actual Quantity

Confirmed

S

s ROYMANL EONg, i
(BUYER) SIGNED ON:

Membears of

COMFORIDELGRO

Comfort Transp




VM_SalesContract Fleet Management System 2002

ESales Contract Vehicles Listing

Contract Ref ; (04744

Contract Date ! D4104/2018
Tender Ref; GP-TQ17195

Tender Dalg : o2M10r2m7
Buyer ! CDGE
S/No, [Vehicle Number [Model Scrap Date Amount
1 |SHD34963 140 (EURD §) 2032018 $1,100,00
2 |sHA4DS3E 140 (EURO 5) 18/03/2018 $1,100.00
$2,200.00

*** End of Raport ***

printed by, simcs ComforiDelGro Taxi Business 0210472018 04:18 PM
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Date: 31 January 2019

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 06/03/2018 @ 05:45 hrs

ALONG JLN BESAR X SYED ALWI RD (FRM KING GEORGES)
INVOLVING SJN4143C

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHD3496S (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to TEO BAN ENG MARY (MS) IC
NO S1191664C a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the
time of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $117.00 per day
(inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +85 6453 3183
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Land Transport §Q Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive Singapore §75701
Tel: 1800-CALL LTA (1800-2255 542) Fax: (65) 6553 5329

Owr rel 2603 180601 NOS300831 |
26 Mar 2018

COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
383 SIN MING DRIVE

GAS BUILDING
SINGAPORE 575717

I

Dear MR YEE HON WAI
DE-REGISTRATION STATUS OF VEHICLE SHD34965

The above-mentioned vehicle was de-registered on 26 Mar 2018, If the vehicle has yet 10 be
disposed of, you should by no later than 26 Apr 2018, serap it (including the engine and chassis) at an
Appointed Scrapyord or submit o LTA, vaolid documentury proof that the wvehicle has been
permanently exporied out of Singapore. Otherwise, it constitutes an offence under the Road Traffic
Act and you may be prosecuted in Court.

2. We have granled the following rebate(s), where applicable, to you. You may use the rebate(s)
if there are no outstanding matters with the vehiele, e.g. no road tax arreqrs, submitted valid
documentary proof that the vehicle has been permanently exported out of Singapore to LTA ete,

PARF Rebate Amount : $14,039.00
PARF Rebale Relerence Mo, 1 1863333GP0000
Expiry Datc of PARF Rebate  ; 25 Mar 2019
COE Rebate Amount : £34.401.00
COL Rebate Relerence Nao, 1 1863333GC0000

Expiry Date of COE Rebate  : 25 Mar 2019

3. The PARF rebate may only be used to offset the Addilional Registration Fee (ARF),
Registration Fes (RF), Quota Premivm (QP) and Uscd Car Surcharge, where applicable, of a motor
car 1o be registered in your name. The COE rebate may be used to offset the ARF, RF, QP and Used
Car Surcharge, where applicable, of any moetor vehicle 1o be registered in your name. The COE rebate
can also be used Lo offset the Prevailing Quota Premium (PQP) payable lor revalidating the COE of a
vehicle that is currently registered in your name. You may also transfer the PARF/COE rebate(s)
together or separately to a third parly. A fee of $15.00 is payable [or each transfer.

4, Alternatively, you may apply to encash the PARF/COE rebate(s) before the expiry of the
rebate(s), You can download the spplication form {Form FRO2) for encashment of the rebate(s) from
hitp://www.onemotoring.com.sg and mail the completcd Form FROZ to LTA, 10 Sin Ming Drive,
Singapore 575701, Attn: VRL Service Operations Division, at least 2 weeks belore Lhe expiry date of
your PARF/COE rebate(s). For your convenience, you muy also login o e
Services @ ONE.MOTORING (Vehicle Hub = Update Owner Particulars) using your SingPass 2FA ar
CorpPass 2ZFA to register your Refund Bank Account for GIRO refund BEFORE applying online for
the encashment (Ownership > PARF/COE Rebate > Apply 1o encash rebate),

5. Any unused portion of the road tax will be relunded to you automatically.
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