Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 March 2018 3:49 PM

To: ‘Sharon'

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Accident involving SLG2132K & SLM5419H on 07/03/18 - AIG *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG18004608/ka3

Attachments: SLM5419H.AVI

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC6/A1G18004608/ka3
Your Ref: SLG 2132K

Dear Sharon,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLM 5419H AND SLG 2132K ON 07.03.2018
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the available information and
evidence at hand, our principal is in the view that our Insured is not liable of the accident.

Based on the enclosed copy of our Insured’s CCTV footage, it was observed that your client’s vehicle suddenly
swerve lane and collided onto our insured's vehicle. Our principal is in view that your client's vehicle should keep in
the proper lane and change lane only when it is safe.

Under such circumstances, we have our principal’s instruction to reject your client’s claim.
As such, we will close the matter at our end.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

----- Original Message-----

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 12 March 2018 11:50 AM

To: Sharon <sharon@ow.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Check Liability - Accident involving SLG2132K & SLM5419H on 07/03/18 - AIG *** LKK REF:
CC6/A1G18004608/ka3

Dear Sharon,
Thank you for your email.
Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Zaini at 6841 2132.
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