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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref CC4/LPC1B004566/R 1uad
3170407 THE EONCOURSESINGAPORE fopsss Dete: 08032018 H mmmllll“""“
Code: LPC2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh,  SJH 382U Veh. Inspected 5LT 7318
Policy No. Z17VPD5014475 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 17THBMBNVPOS020457 Excess () 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 09/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Maodification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/03/2018 inspection Date 09/03/2018
Survey held at WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS
BLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
#01-32
SINGAPORE 575644,
5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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e Consultanis
-y W Pte Lid Company Registration No. 199607 138R

51 UBIAVE 1. #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408033 TEL : (65) 62563361 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your ref: 17/18/18/VPO5020457 Date: 14.03.2018
Owur ref: CCAT.PC1R004566/R 1ua3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear SirYMadam,.

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. s LT 731B
We refer to the above matter.,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 09.03.2018
at the premises of M/s Wei Lee Motor Works - Sin Ming have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 4,758.58
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 4,037.13
"Check" Items Amount : 8% 471.45
Market Value . S$ -
LTA Reimbursement Value : §$ -
Nett Value : 5% -

Drescription of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Rear O/S Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 6.0 day

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. RASUL
Licensed Appraiser



Catherine Chuna (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIMN =geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Thursday, 8 March, 2018 5:33 PM
To: assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc: MT_Claim_5G
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5JH362U & SLT731B ALONG BUANGKOK GREEN ON
7.3.2018
Attachments: 08032018172637 pdf
M
ARG e \p 0
n .
OurRef  : 17/18/18/VP05020457 i NN
PN

Dear Catherine,

We attached a copy of the estimate from Wei Lee Motor Works
for your attention.

Kindly proceed to conduct a survey accordingly.

At the same time, kindly inform them that we are no longer at
Shaw Towers.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 14 March, 2018 2:18 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc MT_Claim_SG; "ERIC WOO JUN KIAT'; ONG LI LT, Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Jas Khine
(LKKAute); Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJH362U 8 SLT731B ALONG BUANGKOK GREEN ON
7.3.2018 *** LKK REf CC4/LPC18004566/R1ua3

Attachments: Preliminary Advice.pdf; TP ESTIMATE - MARKED pdf

Categories: HMEK

EQI ref: 17/18/18/VP05020457
LKK REF: CC4/LPC18004566/R1ua3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SLT 731B
Date of survey: 09.03.2018

We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Thank you

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 13 March, 2018 2:36 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJH362U & SLT731B ALONG BUANGKOK GREEN ON 7.3.2018 *** LKK REf:
Ccca/LPC18004566/R1ual

Dear Mei Kwan,

We attached a copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
1



Qur Ref : 17/18/18/VvP05020457
Dear Catherine,

We attached a copy of the estimate from Wei Lee Motor Works
for your attention.

Kindly proceed to conduct a survey accordingly.

At the same time,kindly inform them that we are no longer at
Shaw Towers.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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WEI LEE MOTOR WORKS

BLOCK 9 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-32,

SINGAPORE 575644,

TEL: 456 9830 = FAX: 455-3985 |

08 Mar 2018

Lonpac Insurance Bhd
100 Beach Road #19-00
Shaw Tower

5189702

Attn: Motor claim dept-3™ party claim
Claiming against your insured vehicle No: SIH362U
Accident involving vehicle No: SLT731B/SJH362U

DOA: 07/03/2018 AT Buangkok Dr Dlip Rd to Buangkok Green

Dear officer incharge

Re: Estimate cost of repair of repair for vehicle No: SLT7318

Business Regn Mo : 269436/00.

**PLEASE an

.| )|
s 1
}L L = -r

range to survey the vehicle-ASAP

STy b

Straighten rear chassis where necessary.
Replace/align all parts into position.

To spray paint.

n‘ilnﬁ!l?P

4.

by

To supply—
Description Oty Amount
| Lid 1 556.20 ff ~
Lid lock 1 102.00 ™~
Lid-TOYOTA logo 1 50.20 poee
Rear bumper 1 43190 0¢ —
Bumper retainer,Rh-near fender 1, 17.00 M= |
Bumper retainer,Rh-near taillamp 1 6640 Ad
 Bumper foglamp 1 82.70 <A~
Taillamp,Rh 1 G56.00 JEL4 -
" End panel 1 673.60 Bf ~
End panel top garnish 1 21350 pF -~
Boot weatherstrip 1 176.00 Aae -
Bumper clip 3800 pa -
Taillamp gasket 1 26.00 Pae—
_Exhaust tailpipe 1 628.60 TR
Parts 3,718.10
- Parts less 25% 929,52
2,788.58
|
Reverse sensor rfqguj_p 220.00 A~
To remove damaged parts and attachments.
Cut n weld damaged panels. Hf Qm::waéfb’

{'f'Sﬂ 4,758.58

for et




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

Company

1813C

SLT731B

No

12 Mar 2018
TOYOTA
VIOSEAUTO
Beige

2008

INZX788606

MRO53HY 9305077290
80.0 kW (107 bhp)
$11,834.00

11 Sep 2008

11 Sep 2008

1

$11,834.00

Yes
10 Sep 2018

$5,917.00

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput ?FUNCTIL...

Page | of 2

12/3/2018



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page 2 of 2

COE Expiry Date: 10 Sep 2018

COE Category: A -Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $14,101.00

COE Rebate Amount: $698.00

Total Rebate Amount: $6,615.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 12 Mar 2018

OK
12 sV
C6LS

<

/

https:ffvrl,Ita.guv.sgﬂL:u’vrla’actiﬂnfenquireRchateB}rPublicBefurcDereg!nput?FLNCTI... 12/3/2018



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref - CC4/LPC180045686/R1ualn2
i?%&ﬁ%??ﬁé’ CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555 D3te: 19-10:2018 Nlmmmmmm
Code: LPC2
13 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SJH 362U Veh. Inspected SLT 731B
Policy No. Z1TVPO5014475 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 17/18/18/VPD5020457 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GERALD Assign Date 08/03F2018
- Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAVIOSEA c.c 1497
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. MROS3HYS305077290 Colour GOLD
Odometer 24771 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN DRDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/60 R15 BRIDGESTONE 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre 185/60 R15 BRIDGESTOMNE 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R15 BRIDGESTONE 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/80R15 BRIDGESTOMNE 5mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR /S PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/03/2018 [Inspection Date 09/03/2018
Survey held at WEILEE MOTOR WORKS
BLOCK 8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
#01-32
SINGAPORE 575644,
5a, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REFAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

]EST!MATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 6 Working Days




¥ b A LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
i‘, ot ; " ; 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo. 15560719BR GST Req. No 19-9607 198-R Page Mo..1of2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLT 731B
aty Description of Parts Condition | ereeinon (6) Oge “f’jﬂ“m"
REP EM EP
1|uD BENT £56.20 556 20
1|LID LOCK BENT 102.00 102.00
1|LID -TOYOTA LOGO NECESSARY 50.20 50.20
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 431.90 431.90
1|BUMPER RETAINER ,RH -NEAR FENDER NECESSARY 17.00 17.00
1|BUMPER RETAINER ,RH-NEAR TAILLAMP NECESSARY 66.40 £6.40
1|BUMPER FOGLAMP CRACKED 82.70 82.70
1| TAILLAMP, RH CRACKED £56.00 656.00
1|END PANEL BENT 673.60 673.60
1|END PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 213.50 213.50
1|BOOT WEATHERSTRIP NECESSARY 176.00 176.00
1|BUMPER CLIP NECESSARY 38.00 38.00
1| TAILLAMP GASKET NECESSARY 26.00 26.00
1|EXHAUST TAILPIPE TO REPAIR SEE 62860 :
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -929.52 -772.37
2,788 58 2,317.13
P L ITE
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT WORKING 220.00 220.00
220.00 220.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE DAMAGED PARTS AND 850.00 700.00
ATTACHMENTS CUT N WELD DAMAGED
PANELS.STRAIGHTEN REAR CHASSIS WHERE
NECESSARY.REPLACE/ALIGN ALL PARTS INTO
POSITION.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF EXHAUST
TAILPIPE
TO SPRAY PAINT. 500.00 800.00
1,750.00 1,500.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,758.58 4,037.13

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18004566/R1 ua3in2
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Page Mo, 2 of 2

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,200.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC1 B004566/R1ua3nz

IR8 5

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor Automotive Assessor




