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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 January, 2019 3:08 PM

To: Janet Tan

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our ref: GBF7255E- SURVEY VEHICLE NO : SLH1690S ***LKK 

REF:CC4/EQI18004556/R1hb3 

Attachments: 20180912_102140.jpg; 20180912_102158.jpg; RE: Reminder 2: Your ref: 

CC4/EQI18004556/hb3- Our ref: SLH1690S

Dear Janet, 

 

We refer to the subject matter. 

 

Please be informed that TP vehicle is under ETHOZCAB PTE LTD. 

 

The claimant (hirer) is making a Loss of Income Claim (we put in under Loss of Use instead). We had offered a $60/day 

but our offer was rejected and TP proposed for $219.00 per day as per the daily rental/ITR (please refer to the attached 

email). 

 

Kindly advise if we can increase LOI/U and/or for your further instructions please. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 12 April, 2018 5:17 PM 

To: 'Janet Tan' 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: Our ref: GBF7255E- SURVEY VEHICLE NO : SLH1690S ***LKK REF:CC4/EQI18004556/R1hb3  

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Janet, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SLH 1690S at M/s ETHOZ GROUP LTD. 
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Enclosed for your perusal is:  

- Estimated cost of repair  

- Preliminary advice 

 

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096. 

 

Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 8 March 2018 5:14 PM 

To: 'Janet Tan' <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Our ref: GBF7255E- SURVEY VEHICLE NO : SLH1690S 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange. 

 
BEST REGARDS, 

G.Nivitha | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Janet Tan [mailto:janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 8 March 2018 4:31 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Our ref: GBF7255E- SURVEY VEHICLE NO : SLH1690S 

 

Dear all, 

 

Please attend to the PRS. Liability is clear, proceed to direct settle if possible. 

 

DOA is 8/1/18, CDGE will amend DOA. 

 

Regards,  

Janet Tan  

Senior Executive | Claims  

  

  

EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 



3

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190  

www.eqinsurance.com.sg         

  

 

  

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.
 

 

 

From: Lee Chen Sin [mailto:ChenSin.Lee@ethozgroup.com]  

Sent: Thursday, March 8, 2018 4:15 PM 

To: Tan Wei Yin <weiyin.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>; Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>; Elaine Cheong 

<elaine.cheong@eqinsurance.com.sg> 

Cc: Toh Khar Kian <KharKian.Toh@ethozgroup.com> 

Subject: SURVEY VEHICLE NO : SLH1690S 

 

Hi, 

 

Appreciate if you could survey for the above vehicle.  

 

Your insured : GBF7255E 

 

Accident Date : 04/01/2018 

 

Please conduct survey at Ethoz Bukit Batok (30 Bukit Batok Crescent 658075 Singapore).  

 

Thanks you. 

 

Warmest Regards, 

Lee Chen Sin  

  

ETHOZ GROUP LTD 

30 Bukit Batok Crescent Singapore 658075 

Mobile: (65) 8822 8339/ DID: 6654 7520 / Fax: 6654 7542   

Website: www.ethozgroup.com  

            
 

Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee 

named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use, 

dissemination, distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by 

mistake, please notify the sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before 

opening any attachment as ETHOZ Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has 

been maintained nor this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views 

expressed in this message are those of the individual sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of 

ETHOZ Group. ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable for the improper and incomplete 

transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt or damage 

to your system.  


