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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Ashley Nguyen <Ashley.Nguyen@ethozgroup.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September, 2018 11:33 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Jackson Teo Ban Chye

Subject: RE: Reminder 2: Your ref: CC4/EQI18004556/hb3- Our ref: SLH1690S

Attachments: Income Statement.pdf; SLH1690S - GBF7255E.PDF

Importance: High

Dear Vic, 

 

Accident Involving SLH1690S & GBF7255E on 04/01/2018. 

 

We refer to your below email, our Client doesn’t accept your offer for his LOI. 

 

1- Based on our client income statement record from 04th December 2017 to 01st January 2018, his average 

income is $219.00 / day. 

 

2- Our Client still had to pay for rental fee for SLH1690S during 3 days accident repair period. 

 

Kindly refer to the attached income statement, we hope you would look into the matter, taking into consideration 

and revert back to us as soon as possible. 

 

We await for your favorite reply. 

 

Warmest Regards, 

Ashley Nguyen 

Claims Settlement 

 

ETHOZ GROUP LTDETHOZ GROUP LTDETHOZ GROUP LTDETHOZ GROUP LTD  

22 Tampines St 92  S(528876) 
DID: 6654 7920 | Fax: 6654 7699 

Website:Website:Website:Website: www.ethozgroup.com  

            

 

 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, September 11, 2018 10:57 AM 

To: Ashley Nguyen <Ashley.Nguyen@ethozgroup.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jackson Teo Ban Chye <jackson.teo@ethozgroup.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) 

<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Reminder 2: Your ref: CC4/EQI18004556/hb3- Our ref: SLH1690S 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Ashley, 

 

We refer to your below email. 
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On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our 

Insured’s part, we offer settlement as below: 

 

Cost of Repair (w/gst) $ 1,391.00  

Loss of Income ($60 x 3 days)  $     180.00  

GIA Search Fee $       17.00  

  TOTAL $ 1,588.00   

    

 

If agreeable, kindly forward to us a copy of the Authorization to Act Letter for payment processing. Please note that 

no DV is required. 

 

The above amount is to be made payable to ETHOZ GROUP LTD. 

 

Thank you. 

 
"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and 

should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement 

should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present 

matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer 

in any other related matters.  

 

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge 

Voucher (for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant.  Further all original documents shall be retained by us 

after we have made payment on the settlement sum. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Ashley Nguyen [mailto:Ashley.Nguyen@ethozgroup.com]  

Sent: Monday, 10 September, 2018 1:40 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A; Rasul (LKKAuto); Jackson Teo Ban Chye 

Subject: Reminder 2: Your ref: CC4/EQI18004556/hb3- Our ref: SLH1690S 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Accident Involving SLH1690S & GBF7255E on 04/01/2018. 

 

Please refer to the above matter, is there any outcome for this case? 
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Kindly revert back to us as soon as possible. 

 

We await for your favorable reply. 

 

Warmest Regards, 

Ashley Nguyen 

Claims Settlement 

 

ETHOZ GROUP LTDETHOZ GROUP LTDETHOZ GROUP LTDETHOZ GROUP LTD  

22 Tampines St 92  S(528876) 
DID: 6654 7920 | Fax: 6654 7699 

Website:Website:Website:Website: www.ethozgroup.com  

            

 

 

 

From: Ashley Nguyen  

Sent: Tuesday, August 07, 2018 9:11 AM 

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Jackson Teo Ban Chye 

<jackson.teo@ethozgroup.com> 

Subject: RE: Your ref: CC4/EQI18004556/hb3- Our ref: SLH1690S 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Accident Involving SLH1690S & GBF7255E on 04/01/2018. 

 

Please refer to the above matter, is there any outcome for this case? 

 

Kindly revert back to us as soon as possible. 

 

We await for your favorable reply. 

 

Thanks and Best Regards 

Ashley NguyenAshley NguyenAshley NguyenAshley Nguyen    
 

 

ETHOZ Group Ltd 

22 Tampines St 92  S(528876) 

DID: 6654 7920 | Fax: 6654 7699 

Website: www.ethozgroup.com 

 

            
 

 

From: Ashley Nguyen  

Sent: Monday, July 02, 2018 11:50 AM 

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Jackson Teo Ban Chye 
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<jackson.teo@ethozgroup.com> 

Subject: RE: Your ref: CC4/EQI18004556/hb3- Our ref: SLH1690S 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Accident Involving SLH1690S & GBF7255E on 04/01/2018. 

 

Please refer to the above matter, is there any outcome for this case? 

 

Kindly revert back to us as soon as possible. 

 

We await for your favorable reply. 

 

Thanks and Best Regards 

Ashley NguyenAshley NguyenAshley NguyenAshley Nguyen    
 

 

ETHOZ Group Ltd 

22 Tampines St 92  S(528876) 

DID: 6654 7920 | Fax: 6654 7699 

Website: www.ethozgroup.com 

 

            
 

 

From: Ashley Nguyen  

Sent: Thursday, May 31, 2018 4:38 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Your ref: CC4/EQI18004556/hb3- Our ref: SLH1690S 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Accident Involving SLH1690S & GBF7255E on 04/01/2018. 

 

We attach Letter of Demand for your necessary action.  

 

Kindly let us hear from you as soon as possible. 

 

Thanks and Best Regards 

Ashley NguyenAshley NguyenAshley NguyenAshley Nguyen    
 

 

ETHOZ Group Ltd 

22 Tampines St 92  S(528876) 

DID: 6654 7920 | Fax: 6654 7699 

Website: www.ethozgroup.com 
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Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee 

named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use, 

dissemination, distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by 

mistake, please notify the sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before 

opening any attachment as ETHOZ Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has 

been maintained nor this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views 

expressed in this message are those of the individual sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of 

ETHOZ Group. ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable for the improper and incomplete 

transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt or damage 

to your system.  

Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee 

named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use, 

dissemination, distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by 

mistake, please notify the sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before 

opening any attachment as ETHOZ Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has 

been maintained nor this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views 

expressed in this message are those of the individual sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of 

ETHOZ Group. ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable for the improper and incomplete 

transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt or damage 

to your system.  


