Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 May, 2018 5:57 PM

To: Lee Chen Sin

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION REPORT OF SLH-1690-S TOYOTA ALTIS (TP)(EQ)

Without Prejudice

Dear Chen Sin,

We refer to your below email.

Our surveyor confirmed finalized COR @ L/S $1,300.00 with 3 Days.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 May, 2018 8:06 AM

To: Lee Chen Sin; Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION REPORT OF SLH-1690-S TOYOTA ALTIS (TP)(EQ)
Dear Chen Sin,

Thank you for email.

Dear Vic,

CC4/EQI18004556/R1hb3

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lee Chen Sin [mailto:ChenSin.Lee@ethozgroup.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 22 May 2018 4:16 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@I|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: FINALIZATION REPORT OF SLH-1690-S TOYOTA ALTIS (TP)(EQ)
Importance: High

Hi,
Kindly confirm finalize amount.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Chen Sin

From: Lee Chen Sin

Sent: Friday, April 13, 2018 2:46 PM

To: 'Rasul (LKK Auto)' <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FINALIZATION REPORT OF SLH-1690-S TOYOTA ALTIS (TP)(EQ)

Hi Rasul,
Attached are the finalization report, check item photo and photo after paint of above mention vehicle.
Please send acceptance once the COR is confirm.

COR :$1,300.00 (Part By Part)
Repair days : 3

Kindly revert.
Thanks you.

Warmest Regards,
Lee Chen Sin

ETHCZ

ETHOZ GROUP LTD
30 Bukit Batok Crescent Singapore 658075
Mobile: (65) 8822 8339/ DID: 6654 7520 / Fax: 6654 7542

Website: www.ethozgroup.com
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Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee named
above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination,
distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by mistake, please notify the
sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before opening any attachment as ETHOZ
Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has been maintained nor this communication
is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual
sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group. ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable
for the improper and incomplete transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay
in its receipt or damage to your system.




