Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 3:15 PM

To: ANG Richard

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Please advise status of claim.

Attachments: RE: Direct Settlement(SAM) - Accident Involving SLS7204R and SHD9207X DOA

04.03.2018 *** LKK REF - CC4/AXA18004501/ws3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please refer to the attached email — last correspondence with TP.
Please note that TP didn’t arrange for survey till date.

Kindly advise whether we can proceed to close the case.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 26 November, 2018 2:44 PM

To: ANG Richard <richard.angbs@axa.com.sg>

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Please advise status of claim.

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Please refer to the attached email - last correspondane with TP.

Please note that TP didn’t arrange for survey till date.



Kindly advise whether we can proceed to close the case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Do-Not-Reply [mailto:do-not-reply@merimen.com]
Sent: Sunday, 25 November 2018 10:00 AM

To: sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com
Subject: Please advise status of claim.

This mail is associated with :
*SLS7204R (C0471955)
[SHD9207X]
TP
WENG SENG HENG CHINESE MEDICAL HILL PTE LTD
Mar 4 2018 7:00AM
[TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD]
Borneo Motors (S) Pte Ltd

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTC

8 Shenton Way, #24-01 A
Singapore 068811
Customer Centre #B1-01

% (65) 6880 4888
& (65) 6338 2522
E www.axa.com.sg

GST Reg No.: 199903512
Co. Reg No.: 199903512

edefining / insurance
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