%

Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 19 November, 2018 9:57 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Ong Chin Kiat; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau;
kinhoe.ng@ktcgroup.com.sg; daniel@ocwinsurance.com

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: QUR REF: SNM18D01205C02/0/LKKDS & YR REF: SJZ1177L
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18004484/Ahb3) on 03/03/2018

Attachments: LETTER TO OLPDF

Importance: High

LKK REF - CC6/CTI18004484/Ahb3
CTI REF — SNM18D01205C02/0 (XD4420P)

Dear Vic

We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 50% basis, quantum at $5,040.00.
We await your payment advice to enable Chin Kiat to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sdg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVFERSARY
In Singapore since 1938

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, November 16, 2018 5:13 PM
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>



Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: OUR REF: SNM18D01205C02/0/LKKDS & YR REF: SJZ1177L (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18004484/Ahb3) on 03/03/2018

Importance: High

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to our below email.

Please be informed that TP claimant is chasing fo-r settlement.
For your approval and /or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

RLERIR N Spve the Larthe Print only whel? recessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 October, 2018 10:52 AM

To: Jowyn Tay

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI; Admin A; Alfred Toh; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: OUR REF: SNM18D01205C02/0/LKKDS & YR REF: SJZ1177L (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CT118004484/Ahb3) on 03/03/2018

CTI REF - SNM18D01205C02/0/LKKDS
LKK REF — CC6/CT118004484/Ahb3

Dear Jowyn,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES XD 4420P (Ol) AND SJZ 1177L (TP) ON 03/03/2018
We refer to the above matter.

This is a conflicting version. It was reported by both drivers that the other vehicle had encroached into their lane that
resulted in the accident.

We had spoken to the Insured PIC Mr Ng and he was informed of the TP claim and liability issues on 21/05/2018 and
agreed to settle the matter. A letter was sent out to the Insured to informed about the TP claim and liability. No
feedback from Insured till date.



Both parties have no further available evidence to support their claim and TP repairer is prepared to accept a 50/50
settlement.

In view of the above, we are of the view that liability should be equally shared by both parties involved.

Summary to offer to repairer HO BENG TRADING is as follows:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair S 19,852.00 S 9,600.00
Loss of Use ($150 x 8 days) $ 1,200.00 S 480.00 (S60 x 8 days)
Subtotal S 10,080.00
@ S 5,040.00
50% ;
TOTAL $ 21,052.00 S 5,040.00
TP VEHICLE

Market Value : $63,000.00 (est)
Paper Value :537,000.00 (est)
Nett Value  :$26,000.00 (est)

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Recommended Days 6 days
Weekends / Downtime 2 days
TOTAL 8 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

¥ IR s
S mm = e Save the Earthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 2:25 PM

To: Jowyn Tay

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM18D01205C02/0/LKKDS & YR REF: SJZ1177L (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18004484/Amb3) on
03/03/2018



Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

———
From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 9 May 2018 12:55 PM
To: chan pick yuen
Cc: Admin A; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)
Subject: - FW: SJZ1177L & XD4420P DOA 03.03.2018
Attachments: DOCUMENT.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that; -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC6/CT118004484/Amb3 Bevan

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe @hotmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 9 May 2018 11:14 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SJZ1177L & XD4420P DOA 03.03.2018

Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Enclosed is our documents .
Please advise your OIC & claim no .

As request following :

1. RC$9600 ( AS AGREED )



2. 1200 { $150 X 8 Days - 6 days recommend + 1 day waiting PRS + 1 day weekend )

@100%

Total $10800/-.

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
HO BENG TRADING
HP: 92712214

From: chan pick yuen <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, March 14, 2018 10:22 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Subject: SJZ1177L ESTIMATE

Dear Catharine ,

Claim CHINA TAIPING

Please print estimate & pass to Adrian . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen
HO BENG TRADING



874 7a
oo e N o Consultants
Sl B A B Pte Lid

51 UBTAVE [, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18004484/Amb3
21 MAY 2018

KOK TONG TRANSPORT & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD
27 PANDAN CRESCENT
SINGAPORE 128476

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 4420P AND SJZ1177L ON 03/03/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 31/05/2018, after we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

p

]
Bevan Lim
Case Handler
DID: 6749 4274
FAX: 6741 4108
Email: bevanlim@]lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

By
B

HO BENG TRADING
Blk 3020A #01-3.3
Ubi Read |

Singapors 408714

Dear Sar,

2/2/ /3¢ /zm:fWS

Accident on _ |
Involving Vehicle Nos, Sj .2 / ( %L 2’- y (D) LTLL#’ 2 OP

" et E Pt #d & T WD

| /We the registered owner rdriver of vehicle registration no: C 3 Tz ( 137:?' =

have nvolved in the above accident.

['We hereby authorize M/S HO BENG TRADING  to commence repairs of the said vehicle
forthwith

I/We coree to assign the whole proceeds of my/our comprehensive/third party claim to you and our
4 — - -

soliciors R to act on my/our behalf in respect of the above

matter. And it apolicable,my/our solicitors shall accept this as my/our irrevocable authority to pay

the amount as deemed compensated direct to you after deduction of their costs on a Solicitor and

clien: basis

I'We nndertake 1o co-operate fully with you and our solicitors to ensure that claimn ts successful.

[/We 150 authorize you to sign all discharge vouchers/indemnity forms and all necessary papers in
relation with the above claim in my/our absence.

Vour kind co-operation in this matter will be much appreciated.
Thank vou

5

fours iruly

ol

‘s Signature
{Company's stamp if applicable)

P oy D O

Name:

NRIC Mo

[Date



Policy No : DMCVSN1801791800 Claim No : SNMI8DO1205C02/0(XD4420P)

Claimant H ANG LAY BEE VICTCORIA
Amount ] §%5,040.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS FIVE THOUSAND FORTY ONLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to me/us in
final settlement of all c¢laims, costs & disbursements feor injuries /
sustained by me/us through an accident invelving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SJZ 1177L

Insured Vehicle No. : XD 4420P

Date of Loss : 03.03.2018

Place of Accident : ALONG FORT RCAD TOWARDS MOUNTBATTEN ROAD

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementicned

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely

discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Name : M/s KOK TONG TRANSPORT & ENGINEERING WORKS
Driver Name : SUI NAN

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or
sustained by me/us arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

full &
damages

on the

(1) Global Sum (all in) 8% 5, 040.00

TOTAL + + + & « « « « « v « . . . . 88 5,040.00

. = _ =
Claimant Name : ﬂn}f [fwj éﬁc L‘ .N;i{_: e s ‘5 ’S\)’))é‘ZE

v

Signature

. /7////?
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HO BENG TRADING

Block 3020A Ubi Road 1 #01-33 Singapore 408714
Tel : { 65) 69664526 HP: 92712214 Fax: (65) 69664526
Email :chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com

INVOICE

ANG LAY BEE VICTORIA Date: 09" MAY 18
Blk 3020A #01-33

Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408714

Accident date:03 MARCH 2018
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SJZ1177L MERVEDES C180

Descriptions AMOUNT

|Lump Sum repair cost as recommended by ) $9,600.00
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD s

Surveyor : Mr Adrian Ling

Tota $9,600.00

S/DLRS: NINE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED ONLY
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