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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 30 November, 2018 4:36 PM

To: PBSP

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: PAYMENT REMINDER (PRE-SIGNED DV ENCLOSED) - SKF1089B & SLU2997H 

ON 05.03.2018 LKK REF CC4/ASM18004423/T1hb3

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Caroline, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Please be informed that we are still pending for instruction/approval from our principal with regards to your request 

on the LOU. 

 

We will continue to follow up and will get back to you for an update. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 30 November, 2018 3:55 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto); CS A Team 

Subject: Re: PAYMENT REMINDER (PRE-SIGNED DV ENCLOSED) - SKF1089B & SLU2997H ON 05.03.2018 

 
 

URGENT PAYMENT REMINDER - $3835.14 

From: PBSP 

Sent: Wednesday, 14 November 2018 1:51:06 PM 

To: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com; CS A Team 

Subject: PAYMENT REMINDER (PRE-SIGNED DV ENCLOSED) - SKF1089B & SLU2997H ON 05.03.2018  
  
Dear Vic 

 



2

Based on the new NIMA Benchmark, loss of use is at $60/day. 

 

Further, our client's vehicle is a BMW.  

 

Please settle in full with our attached dv. 

 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 
C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601 

 

From: PBSP 

Sent: Thursday, 27 September 2018 1:19 PM 

To: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 

Subject: PAYMENT REMINDER (PRE-SIGNED DV ENCLOSED) - SKF1098B & SLU2997H ON 05.03.2018  

  

Dear Sirs 

 

We refer to the above and our LOD dated 04 July 2018. 

 

Please let us have your payment soonest. 

 

 

 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 
C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601 


