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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Dear Eliza,

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 7 March 201 8 8:49 AM
'Eliza Ho'; SUR

RE: Market Value - SJY7029Y/DOA: 04.02.2018

The.market value for SJY 7029Y is 550K-S53K (EST) as at Feb 2018

Best ReBards,

Veron chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 I email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Eliza Ho Imailto:Eliza_Ho@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Tuesday,6 March 2018 4:53 PM

subject: Market Value - SJY7029Y/DoA: 04.02.2018

Hi,

Pls advise on market value, thank u.



i:.i :. : j:

Eliza Ho
Assistant Executive, Ctaims Services
D: +65 6594 2554 | F: +65 6225 74Oz

(Motor)
I eliza ho@sq. msiq-asia. com
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
-lqo$l,lrs

- --- , :T
Owner lDType: " Singapore NRIC

Owner lD:

Vehicle Details

5951G

$v K0- K 4

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

sJY7029Y

No

lntended De-registration Date: 05 Mar 2018

Vehicle Make: B.M.W.

Vehicle Model:
. 

325I AT 2.51ABS D/AB GAS/D 2WD 4DR SR

Primary Colour:

Manufacturing Year:

..____"r"t -._2o7o \n I|/c.('
Engine No.: 73897329N528254F

Chassis No.: WBAPH 16070NM50533

Maximum Power Output:

Open Market Value:

160.0 kW 1274 bhpl

$42,030.00

Original Registration Date: 24Sep 2O7O

First Registration Date: 24Sep2o7o Z , GlC

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

0

$42,030.00 )l t t-t'
lntended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

lntended COE Rebate Details

Yes

23 Sep 2O2O

$2s,218.00



COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE RebateAmount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 05 Mar 2018

23 Sep 2O2O

B - Car (1601cc & above)

10

$42,s01.00

$10,837.00

$36,055.00

OK


