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Print Sent Message

 
This mail is associated with :

  
*SHC6106D (C0471940)

 [SHD9512P]
 TP

 PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD
 Mar 5 2018 4:00PM

 [TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD]
 Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd
  

 
From   LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 02/05/2018 11:33 AM.
To   AXA_SG; AXA_CynthiaLoh
CC   Admin-a@lkkauto.com; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
Subject   <SEEK MANDATE> Fw: Re: C0471940/P1680520
 
Dear Cynthia,
 
PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL AS BELOW:

 COR(w/gst):$1,230.50
 LOR           :$   326.79 ($108.93 x 3 recommended days)

 LOI            :$   120.00 ($40 x 3 recomemnded days)
 TOTAL       :$ 1,677.29

 REMARKS   : BOLA NIL (Both turning- TP on its lane, TP VIDEO FOOTAGE ALREADY FORWARDED VIA ACCELLION)
 
For your approval.
 
Thank you.
 
Vic
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6841 2096
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: LKK_HQ
To: AXA_SG; AXA_CynthiaLoh
CC: Admin-a@lkkauto.com; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 19/04/2018 01:54 PM
Subject: Re: C0471940/P1680520
 
Dear Cynthia,

  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD 9512P(OI) AND SHC 6106D(TP) ON 05/03/2018

  
Please be informed that a copy of TP video footage was forwarded to you via accellion as requested.

  
Based on the footage, TP was turning within its lane.

  
Thank you.

  
Vic Alpeh

 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
 Tel: 6841 2096

 
 
 
 
 
<-- Original Message --> 
From: AXA_SG
To: LKK_HQ; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 08/03/2018 03:43 PM
Subject: C0471940/P1680520
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Dear LKK,
 
OI reported that TP cut into his lane.
 
Please assist to obtain evidence and liaise with OI before any settlement.
 
Regards,
Cynthia Loh


