Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

x

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 September, 2018 3:56 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); kKLaw; Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB8814G (OI. SNM18D01254C02/4)

AND SHB1254Y (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18004344/Sws3) on 02/03/2018

LKK REF - CC3/CT118004344/5ws3
CTI REF - SNM18D01254C02/4 (GBB8814G)

Dear Vivian
You may proceed to conclude the property damage claim at $5,342.27.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 T175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred toh@sg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
In Simgapore sinee 1938

Diselaimer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commifment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use aor dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, September 20, 2018 11:48 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin [LKKAuto)
<thinthin@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong
(LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; KkLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB8814G (01: SNM18D01254C02/4) AND SHB1254Y (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/CTI18004344/5ws3) on 02/03/2018

Dear Alfred



We refer to the email below.
We offer TP LOR/LOI 6.5 days TP rejected our offer counter propose LOR/LOI Tdays ( G/S $ 5,300.00)
We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd is as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repair (+GST) 55 10,819.74 55 4,050.00
2. Loss of RENTAL ($111.28 x Tdays) 8§ 778.96 S$ 778.96 ( Surveyor recommend 5 days)
3. Loss Of INCOME ( § 72.33.00 x Tdays) S§ 50631 S§ 50631
1. GIA SEARCH 5% 7.00 5% 7.00
5% 12,112.01 5% 5.342.27

Amount of claim at liability 100% 838 5,342.27

For your approval please.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlauw@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Thursday, 13 September, 2018 5:54 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=; Hsiao Tong
(LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB8814G (O!: SNM18D01254C02/4) AND SHB1254Y (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/CT118004344/Sws3) on 02/03/2018

LKK REF - CC3/CTI118004344/5ws3
CTI REF - SNM18D01254C02/4 (GBB8814G)

Dear Vivian

We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.

You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $5,105.32.
We await your payment advice to enable Boon Sen to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department



China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079309
DID: +656389 6183

FAX; +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Ifred.tohi@sg.cntai .COIM

www .sg.cntaiping.com

ANATRSARY
In Simgupare uwee 958

Disclaimer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pre. Ltd. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. [f you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, September 13, 2018 5:46 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept .cntaiping.com>

Ce: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Thin Thin
(LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBBBB14G (O : CTI - SNM18D01254C02/4) AND SHB1254Y (TP :
LKK REF - CC3/CTI18004344/Sws3) on 02/03/2018

Your Ref : SNMI18D01254
Our Ref : CC3/CTIH 8004344/5wa3

Dear Boon Sen,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 8814G AND SHB 1254Y ON 02/03/2018 ALONG TPE TWDS SLE

We refer to the above matter

This is a head-to-rear collision.

We have surveved the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.
We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd is as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repair (+GST) S$ 10,819.74 S$ 4,050.00
2. Loss of RENTAL ($111.28 x 6.5days) 88 778.96 8% 723.32 ( Surveyor recommend 3 days)
3. Loss Of INCOME ( § 50.00 x 6.5days) S§ 3506.31 5§ 32500
3. GIA SEARCH 5% 7.00 5% 7.00
S$12,112.01 §%5.105.32

Amount of claim at liability 100% S$ 5105.32

For your approval please.



TP chasing for settlement

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlan@lkkauto.com! fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 September, 2018 1:49 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.comz>; Thin Thin
[LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBBB814G (01 : CTI - SNM18D01254) AND SHBE1254Y (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/CTI118004344,/Sws3) on 02/03/2018

Your Ref : SNMISD0O1254
Our Ref ; CC3/CTI18004344/Swa3

Dear Boon Sen,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 8814G AND SHB 1254Y ON 02/03/2018 ALONG TPE TWDS SLE

We refer to the above matter
This is a head-to-rear collision.
We have surveyed the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.

We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd is as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair (+GST) 5% 10,819.74 5% 4,050.00
2. Loss of RENTAL (%111.28 x 6.5days) 5% 77896 S$ 72332 ( Surveyor recommend 5 days)
3. Loss Of INCOME ( $ 50.00 x 6.5days) 8% 50631 8§ 325.00
3. GIA SEARCH 5% 7.00 S% 7.00
8% 12.112.01 5% 5,105.32

Amount of claim at liability 100% S$ 5105.32

For your approval please.

TP chasing for settlement



Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S${408033)

From: Vivian Lau |[LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 July, 2018 4:45 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsd sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <bgonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Thin Thin
(LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com:>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBBS814G (01 : CTI - SNM18D01254) AND SHB1254Y (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/CT118004344/Sws3) on 02/03/2018

Your Ref : SNMI18D01254
Our Ref : CC3/CTN 8004344/Swa3

Dear Boon Sen,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 8814G AND SHB 1254Y ON 02/03/2018 ALONG TPE TWDS SLE

We refer to the above matter

This is a head-to-rear collision.

We have surveved the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.
We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd is as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repair (+GST) S$ 10.819.74 $$ 4,050.00
2. Loss of RENTAL ($111.28 x 6.5days) 5% 77896 S$ 72332 ( Surveyor recommend 5 days)
3. Loss Of INCOME ( § 50.00 x 6,5days) 5% 50631 5% 325.00
3. GIA SEARCH 5% 7.00 S$ 7.00
S$12,112.01 S%$ 5,105.32

Amount of claim at liability 100% S% 5105.32

For your approval please.

TP chasing for settlement



Thank vou
Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@ lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 22 May, 2018 2:41 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>; '"Alfred Toh'
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB8814G (O1 : CTI - SNM18D01254) AND SHB1254Y (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/CT118004344/Sws3) on 02/03/2018

Your Ref : SNM18D01254
Owur Ref : CC3/CTH 8004344/Swa3

Dear Boon Sen,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 8814G AND SHB 1254Y ON 02/03/2018 ALONG TPE TWDS SLE

We refer to the above matter

This is a head-to-rear collision,

We have surveyed the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.
We seek vour approval to offer to TP repairer SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd is as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repair (+GST) S$10,819.74 S$ 4,050.00
2. Loss of RENTAL ($111.28 x 6.5days) 5% 778.96 S$ 723.32 ( Surveyor recommend 5 days)
3. Loss Of INCOME ( § 50.00 x 6.5days) S8 506.31 S§  325.00
3. GIA SEARCH bk 7.00 5% 7.00
S$ 12,112.01 5% 5,105.32

Amount of ¢laim at liability 100% S5 5105.32

For your approval please.



Thank vou

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shirley Hiew [LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 9 March, 2018 6:18 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Lucas Lee <|ucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Vivian Lau
(LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=>; C5 A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB8814G (O : CTI - SNM18D01254) AND SHB1254Y (TP : LKK

REF - CC3/CTI18004344/Sws3) on 02/03/2018

Dear Lucas,

Thanks and noted

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew®@ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933}

From: Lucas Lee [mailto:lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Friday, 9 March 2018 1:21 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB8814G (O : CTI - SNM18D01254) AND SHB1254Y (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/CT118004344/Sws3) on 02/03/2018

Dear Sirs,
Kindly refer to the above attachment.
Case Handler: Chong Boon 5en

Regards,

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3, Anson Road, #16-00

Springleaf Tower,



Singapore 079909

.Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6181

Fax: 6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Email: lucas lee@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 March, 2018 8:58 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBBE814G (Ol : CTI- TBA) AND SHB1254Y (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI118004344/5ws3) on 02/03/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SHB 1254Y at M/s SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd - Woodlands.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
: TP GIA report
TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408333)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
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SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
G0 Weoodlands Industrial Park E4

Singapore 757705

Tel : 65 600G 2647

Fax .65 G368 7421

WAWW SITITE COM.50

3 SMRT

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte Ltd

clo LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date: 9" April 2018

No. 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi Industrial Park Our Ref; TAX/03/18/2015/LG
Singapore 408933

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT ON 02/03/2018 INVOLVING SHB 1254Y & GBB 8814G
ALONG TPE TOWARDS CHANGI AIRPORT

LETTER OF CLAIM

We claim on behalf of SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd, the owner and the hirer of taxi no.: SHB 1254Y. Your
insured’s negligent driving has caused the above accident As a result, our clients have suffered
the following losses:-

1. Cost of Repair . Rhu30-co
2 LossofRRentalfor _ 4 days @ S$ \\| 28 jday . B 33%-9 ‘
3. Loss of Income for _4 _ days @ S$ P‘ 31 rday - B 506.%3]
4. Police Report/ SAS Report! LTA Search Fee S O A
5. Survey Fee i

Total Claims © {18 10py 1]

We enclose the following documents:

Letter of Authorisation
LTA Search result
Others -

Repair Inwice
Survwey Report
Fhotagraphs pcs

- BEE

Investigation results vehicle laid-up report

".']({f‘&n’ c Nde o b Nerecament

OO0

Proof of Loss of Use/Rental/lncome

A

2.
[7] Police / SAS report of SHELMHY 3

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this
letter. Payment by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT TAXIS PTELTD.

Yours sincerely,
SH__RT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD

Tan Lee Gek

For Manager, Claims

Claims Department

DID. 6866 2647

Email: leegek@smrt.com.sg

FR-AS-CLM-02 REV 2
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51 UREAVE 1L #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ¢ (065) 62563561 FAX : (B05) 62364313

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18004344/5ws3

27 March 2018

KMD Engineering & Construction Pte Ltd

1 SOPHIA ROAD

#04-26

Singapore 228149

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 8814G AND SHB 1254Y ON 02/03/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

rs faithfully,

Vivian Lau
Case Handler

DID: 6841 8625

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: Vivianlauglkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

I/We, SMRT TAXIS PTELTD (“the third party claimant™) of 60 WOODLANDS
INDUSTRIAL PARK E4. SINGAPORE 757705 (address), owner of SHB 1254 { vehicle
no.) hereby authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to

act for me with respeet to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use ( “claim”)
for my vehicle no. SHB 1254Y that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred
on 02/03/2018 (date) along TPE TWDS SLE EXIT 10 (location) involving vehicle no/s
GBB 8814G (*'the accident”).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they
deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of

my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a

without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers

of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

. [ () nl j
Dated this J' ~___(day) of éi rﬂ’ (month) ?.E]J_E_[yeur}

-

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop”™
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



&5 SIMIRT

ALUTOMOTIVE

— 3,3[:1@:8"

Qur Ref. MNo.:

| etter of Authorisation

I, MOy Nor B VAL ES (NRIC No.: S/ S350 -] ) the

registered hirer / +efief-driver-/ contract hirer of SMRT taxi registration number
=R /254 ¥ hereby authorise SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
(“AutoSvs™) to degl with all matters arising out of the accident between my taxi
and G988 PEAG happened on CU/‘?{/-*C-‘?J"" 7 ’;’J Pm
along TR E Towarp CHANG, AR CExry 0],

(the “Accident”) on my behalf, including but not limited to instituting and any claims or
proceedings against such party or parties (as AutoSvs deems fit in its absolute
discretion) in respect of any claim, demand, loss, cost, expense, liability, damages or

action made against us or incurred or suffered by us.

Without prejudice to the foregoing, | further authorise AutoSvs to negotiate, resolve
and settle any proceeding or claim arising out of the accidents, including but not limited
to doing any act or executing any document or signing the Discharge Voucher on my

behalf as may be required.

{

Name  Mous Mok B, ;’;“ <7 .._Signature: »1?( | 03/03 /22/§
NRICNo, .S 678770 = .. |
TR v i A

Address T e g e e s ST 0 R S A R

FR-AS-CLM-03 REV 3



Policy No ¢ DMCVSN3IO011951800 Claim No @ SHMIBDO1ZS54CD2/4
Claimant + EMRT TAXIS FPTE LID
Amount . 5§ 5, 300,00

Singapore Dollar Five Thousand Three Bundred Only
1/We agree to accept the above mentlicned amount to be paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injurles / damages

sustained by me/us through an aceident involving

Claimant Vehicle No., i SHE 1Z54Y

Insured Vehicle No. ¢ CGBB BEL4G
pate of Losas s 02/,037/2018
Piace of Accident s TPE 'TWDS 5LE EMIT 10

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURARNCE (SINGARORE} ETE. LTD.; 1/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAFPORE) PTE, LID. and/or

Insured Hame + KMD ENGINEERING & CONSTRUCTION BPTE: LTQ
Driver Name : MUBRUCGESAN MUGUNDHARAJAN

from @il claims, present or future in respect of dll loss, injury-or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the said accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TATPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

Global Sum 5% 5,300.00
TOTAL g5 5,300.00

Claimant Name il i..:.“? NRIC No i g}['.-{- B*ﬂ'@f:{f'

24 SEP 20%8

Sigrniature z - Date




@iy

Costomer Code: 3000083

L4

SMRT Automotive Services Fte Ltd
251 Morth Bridge Road Singapere 178102
Tel: 65 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247

Tax Invoice

35T Eeg HNo. MR-8500001-7

£ CEN : 1990042802
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD A Invoice No. : IV180300313
- Date + 15.03.2018
Block WUnit = Claims Vehicle No. @ SHBEl254Y
<, Department Your Ref No. : TAX/03/18/2015
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PRRK E4 OFWE E."E-‘?“\]l Our Ref No. : 24094863
SINGRPORE TET7T05 Terms : 30 Days
Description oty Unit Add / (Diseount) Amount
Cost % Amount
LUME 5UM AMOUNT FOR REPAIR 1.00 s 4,050.00
AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMENDATION
GRAND TOTAL s 4, 050.00

Femark

Make/Model : CHEVROLET EFICA 2.0
Accident Date : 02.03.2018

¥.B. Payment by cheque should be crossed and
made payable te 'SMAT Automotive Services Pte Ltd'.
No receipt will be issusd unless requested.

Autherised Signature
for SMET Automotive Services Pte Ltd

E. &3



S smnr

SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd MEMORANDUM
To: Claims Dept Our Ref: FTAX/03/18/2015
From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd Date: 12/3/2018

ACCIDENT ON 02/03/2018 INVOLVING SHB 1254Y & GBB 8814G
ALONG TPE TOWARDS CHANGI AIRPORT

This is to confirm that the daily rental rate for SHB 1254Y is $111.28 per day.

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely
SMRT TAXIS PTELTD

ATTANS

[SXTAEN
(3( #% ) T:IE
\‘- : oy _’:‘_,-"'
for Manager

/



3/5/2018

Enquire Transaction History
Transaction History Details

Vehicle Hub

Log Date/Time: 05 Mar 2018 / 08:19:08
Asset Type: Wehicle [ransaction Amount:
Asset 1D: GEBEE14G
i H|
Transaction Type: 1832 Insurance Enquiry (GIRO channek
Payment)
e ESASBAHO - BALOISH BINTE ABDUL  Business Transaction
! HALIL Reference Mo.
search Date [ Tire, _EE_MEI 2018 154300
Insurance Company: CHIMA TAIPING [MSU RAMCE (SINGAPORE) PTELTD

infarmation displayed is correct as at the log date and time.

Enquire Related Logs (0] ,4

$7.49

External Agency

20180305081908760535

1M
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Tax Raference Mo . SXXO{X340D
Year of Assessment 1 2017

Income Tax
Date 21 Dec 2017

NOTICE OF ASSESSMENT
ORIGINAL

Please quote the Tax Reference Number (eg. NRIC. FIN, &tc) in full when corresponding with us

MR MOHD NOR BIN TALER
2888 WOODLANDS DRIVE 50

%?I%E%EE’GRE 731899

N AU I

TRADE

DIVIDENDS

TOTAL INCOME
ASSESSABLE INCOME

LESS: PERSONAL RELIEFS
Earned Income

Spouse/Handicapped Spouse

Child (QCR)
TOTAL PERSOMAL RELIEFS

CHARGEABLE INCOME
TAX PAYABLE

13251

OTHER
S'PORE ($) COUNTRIES (3]

26,400.00
1.00

26,401,00

1,000.00
2,000.00
12,000.00

@ g0
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13251

am

TOTAL (%)

26,400.00
1.00

26,401.00
26,401.00

15,000.00
14,401.00

0.00

IMLAMD REVENUE
AUTHORITY
COF SINGAPORE
£5 Mewton Road
Revenus House
Singapore 307887
Tal: 1800-356 8300
Website: http./fwww.iras gov.sg
a-Services: hitps:imytax iras.gov.sg

1. Your tax assessment is
based on information given by
you in your income tax return.

2. If you have any objection,
please submit your objection
online within 30 days via the
Object to Assessment
e-service or email us at myTax
Portal.
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