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' Vd V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

:H"_ﬂ_; 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 1%.0607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref - CC3/LPC18004326/K1ea3
o e o courseswansore sosss % o= | [IIHIHNIN
Code . LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBA 7174G Veh. Inspected SHD 4115K
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. 1718718/ C00I020449 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date D6/0372018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer : Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre ram
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/03/2018 |inspection Date 06/03/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAFPORE 508969
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




COmautanrs
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Y our rel 1181 8/VCDDMD20449 Date: OB/O3/2018
Our ref: CCHLPCIRO04326/K 1es3
The Motor Claims Department
M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
Dear Sir/Madam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHD 4115K

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had condueted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 06.03.2018

at the M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Lovang) have the following to report:-

6.491.20

2.541.76

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5%
Revised Estimate Amount : 5%
"Check” Items Amount 158
Market Value 1 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value 55
Nett Value : 55

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages a1 the
O/S Body

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Estimated normal period for repairs: 3.0 days

Yours faithfully,

KALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser



Catkerine Chnnﬁ (LKK Auto)
- “

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ericwoo®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 March, 2018 9:27 AM

Ta: assignments@|kkauto.com

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VC00/020449  Accident involving GBA7174G & SHD4115K
along Tuas Ave 2 on 2/3/18

Attachments: 06032018092230.pdf

Cear Catherine,
Kindly refer to our attachment.

Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle SHD 4115K on without Prejudice Basis.

We look forward to receiving your report soon.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Ce:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Categories:

Dear Shirley,

GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Monday, 2 April, 2018 2:34 PM

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

MT_Claim_SG

RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VC00/020449  Accident involving GBAT174G & SHD4115K
along Tuas Ave 2 on 2/3/18

Follow up
Completed

AGNES

Kindly verify with the surveyor and ascertain if there is any damage

to the rear bumper.

Best Regards
Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext,255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shirley Hiew {LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 March, 2018 2:29 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG; ONG LI LI; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VC00/020449 Accident involving GBA7174G & SHD4115K along Tuas Ave 2 an

2/3/18
Dear Gerald,

Thanks and noted,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 21 March 2018 2:07 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt claim@leonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/vC00/020443 Accident involving GBA7174G & 5HD4115K along Tuas Ave 2 on

2/3/18

Dear Shirley,



Our insured has yet to lodge a report and we are making enquiries.

The premium for the policy has been settled.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShideyHiew@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 21 March, 2018 1:30 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG; GERALD POH WEE BIN; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: ONG LI LI; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: FW: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VC00/020449 Accident involving GBAT174G & SHD4115K along Tuas Ave 2 on
2/3/18

Your ref: 17/18/18/VC00/020449
LKK ref: CC3/LPC18004326/K1es3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter,

Meanwhile, please advise whether insured has reported.

If s0, kindly assist to verify validity of our insured’s policy, and let us have a copy of insured’s accident report
for our necessary action,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 March 2018 10:05 AM

To: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Asher Sng
(LKKAuUto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: llong@lonpac.com; ericwoo@lonpac.com; Vie (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Qur Ref: 17/18/18/VC00/020445 Accident involving GBAT174G & SHD4115K along Tuas Ave 2 on

2/3/18

Your ref: 17/18/18/VC00/020449
LKK ref : CC3/LPC18004326/K1es3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
This is a third party direct settlement case.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SHD 4115K

Date of survey: 06,/03/2018

Enclosed for your perusal is:
» TP GlA report
* TP estimated cost of repair
* Preliminary advice
» Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

oo

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 March 2018 9:11 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_5G <mt _claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VC00/020449 Accident involving GBA7174G & 5HD4115K along Tuas Ave 2 on
2/3/18

Dear Shirley,
Our insured has yet to lodge a report and we are making enquiries.

The premium for the policy has been settled.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShideyHiew@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 March, 2018 9:09 AM

To: MT_Claim_5G; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: ONG LI LI; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT,; GERALD POH WEE BIN; Admin A

Subject: FW: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VC0D0/020449 Accident involving GBA7174G & SHD4115K along Tuas Ave 2 on
2/3/18

Yourref: 17/18/18/VC00/020449



LKK ref: CC3/LPC18004326/es3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter,

This is a TP direct settlement case from M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd - Loyang,
We have not authorized repairs.

We will revert preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, Kindly assist to verify validity of our insured's policy, and let us have a copy of insured’s accident
report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email; ShirleyHiew®|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT [mailto:ericwoo@lonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 6 March, 2018 9:27 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VC00/020449 Accident involving GBA7174G & SHD4115K along Tuas Ave 2 on 2/3/18

Dear Catherine,
Kindly refer to our attachment.

Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle SHD 4115K on without Prejudice Basis.

We look forward to receiving your report soon.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767
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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

| enpal -

VEHICLE NO : SHD 4115K DATE 5/3/2018 13:45
MAKE
MODEL : HYUNDAI SONATA
Qty Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price Amount
Rear Bumper I~ $ 578.40
Rear Bumper Protector (RH) > 5 38.00
Rear Fender (RH) )¢ A¥ <) $ 1,935.90
Rear Fender Inner Lining (RH) X $ 74.10
Rear Windscreen Moulding X S 60.00
Rear Door (RH)  »— $ 1,294.70
Rear Door Protector(RH) > M"y $ 54,50
Rocker Panel Outer Garnish (RH) X #4¢”" S 463.40
Rear Wheel Hup-Cap (RH) ~— 5 145.00
S5UB TOTAL 5  4.644.00
LESS 20% 8 928.80
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 371520
Rear Bumper Advertisement Logo «~ 5 50.00 |Nett
Rear Windscreen Sealant » b 46.00 [Net
Rear Door Advertisement Logo (RH) il b 10000 | Nett
$ 196.00
Labour Charge Yoo
Panel Beating 5 LM =
Spray Painting Charge 8 EW"—?Z-
Wiring Charge 5 S0-Bfr| A
Tuff Kote § 5060 22
Remove/Refix Cushion & Upholstery Rear 5 ISM e
Remove/Refix Rear Windscreen Glass 5 IM xX
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor b IM X
Transfer of Door s 12 o
Rear Wheel Alignment 5 12060 | <
O € ,h it 0 X
TOTAL LABOUR $ 2,530.00
ESTIMATE TOT{T o ——1— S 644120 | {41
Kok (0t T TR e
/ /J/f !‘n?n / i
> Lo
/Z# fop p - |
This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection af"‘fhE above vehicle. The final repair quantu+1 will
be prepared afier the vehicle is surveved by a motor d“ﬂrt’mwumr.:d_b_ the insurance L'-Tm]-'-'ﬂl“.f
—

Page 1

of 1



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD )_@Mgﬂ =

VEHICLE NO : SHD 4115K DATE 5/3/2018 13:45 ot
MAKE
MODEL : HYUNDAI SONATA
Oy Parts Description/ Labour l Type Unit Price Amount
Rear Bumper x=  [Mp~— $ 57840
Rear Bumper Protector (RH) X Ll g 38.00
Rear Fender (RH) X A¥ =+ £ 1,935.00
Rear Fender Inner Lining (RH) X £~ g 74.10
Rear Windscreen Moulding X, " $ 60.00
Rear Door (RH) »— $ 1,294.70
Rear Door Protector{RH) * My’ b 54.50
Focker Panel Outer Garnish (RH) K"'f'm g 46340
Rear Wheel Hup-Cap (RH) »~— W 5 145.00
SUB TOTAL $  4,644.00
LESS 20% % 92880
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 3,715.20
Rear Bumper Advertisement Logo «~ il 5 50.00 |Nett
Rear Windscreen Sealant o A $ 46.00 |Nett
Rear Door Advertisement Logo (RH) — B % 100.00 |Nett
5 196.00
Labour Charge fro
Panel Beating 5 I,}Jﬁﬁfﬁf =
Spray Painting Charge b EW.-?I'
Wiring Charge $ SOB671C 4 o
Tuff Kote S 504073
Remove/Refix Cushion & Upholstery Rear 5 5,043{ E
Remove/Refix Rear Windscreen Glass S 120607 | X a &
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor b ,O-ﬂU" X
Transfer of Door $ 12040 |70
Rear Wheel Alignment $ 12.0'.6{5/ s
TOWWA K # D | xw
TOTAL LABOUR 5  2.530.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL § 644120
I b (L - 22 a0
S [/ 1o A B alo syt henc oy
? To resurvay bel rSray palntin
j‘?f . :L i : ; 1 --.-:'q vey
B |IEE o
= syed apd
This is an muinal estimate bascd on a visual mspection o 'l|h_j._¢1b§_._1'~_|._.'_j._i_;||~:-\:lc The final repair '.i;l.l-i-”':i-”n il
be preépared after the velucle 1= surveved by a motor '.\'urx chion :rpp;u.m:;:d by the insurance company,

Page 1 okt




COMFORIDELGRO.

ENGINEER

Qur Job Ref Mo 305121788 NGH ING
ComfortDelGre Engineering Pte Lid

Date : 08/03/16 58 Loyang Ditve Singapare 508959
Fax: 6546 8156

FINALIZATION FORM

To ¢ LEK Fax:

Attn - KALVIN

Vehicle Reg Mo, : SHD4115K Date of Accident : 02/03/18

The survey and estimates of ihe repairs of the above-mentioned vehicle are as follows:-

1, The repair job shall bill to: LONPAC - GBAT174G

o
2, Tha finalized amount shall be:

{a) Spare Parts after List discount

(b} Lebour Charges i

Total for Part-By-Part Rapair Cost

{c) Lumpsum Repair {if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less:  _20% £2,080.00

Final Lumpsum Repair cost

3. Eslimated normal period for repairs: 3 warking days
4 ‘'We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmad if there Is no reply from you

within 7 working days
5. Thank you for your assistance. . wﬁ confirm the E_sﬂ;l.ﬂ.a_'l:ﬂﬁ_ _and 3

finallzed amount

Signature : W Slgnature :

Name : JUMANI N\ Name : J¢ alr

Tel 6214 8415 Date q)3).¢

T 7

Fax - 65488 ‘Ikﬁ

‘For Officlal Use Only
pcument
Ttem Amaount Attached lcggr:a:lnwig Ramarks
Yes or No
1. Rental Rate P/Day YES
2. Loss of Incoms Paid N
3. Survey Faes
4. LTA Search Fee §7.49
5. Medical Fees (on behalf
of drivar, if applicable)

(6 Overrun

Remarks:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4313

Reg. Mo 1096807108R GST Reg. No 19-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

300 BEACH ROAD r
#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555 0%'®  20:072018 ” mm"mllwl"u

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Ref : CC3I/LPC18004326/K1ealn2

Code : LPC2

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. GBA 71746 Veh. Inspected SHD 4115K
Policy No. Z/17/VC00M00057 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 171818 CODI020449 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 06/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI SONATA c.c 1991
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2012
Chassis No. KMHET41WMCAB23611 Colour BLUE
Odometer 165242 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R1& WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE WVEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date 02/03/2018 Inspection Date 06/03/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRC ENGINEERING PTELTD
58 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
5a. Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BYIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
Sb. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Wo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 4115K
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | FSUmate tiy}l {$]II
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR. SEE 578.40 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER PROTECTOR (RH) TO REPAIR SEE 38,00 .
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER (RH) TO REPAIR SEE 1,935.80 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER INNER LINING (RH) SERVICEABLE 74,10 =
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING MOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
1|REAR DOOR [RH) DENTED 1,254, 70 1,294 70
1|REAR DOOR PROTECTOR (RH) TO REPAIR SEE 54 50 -
LABOUR
1|ROCKER PANEL OUTER GARNISH (RH) TO REPAIR SEE 483 .40 i
LABOUR
1|REAR WHEEL HUP-CAP (RH) GRAZED 145.00 14500
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -928 80 -287.94
3,715.20 1,151.76
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (SN) MECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 46.00 -
1|REAR. DOOR ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (RH)(SM) MECESSARY 100.00 100.00
156.00 150.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1,000.00 400 00
BUMPER,REAR BUMPER PROTECTOR (RH),REAR
FEMNDER (RH},REAR DOOR PROTECTOR (RH) AND
ROCKER PANEL OUTER GARNISH (RH)
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE BO0.00 T20.00
WIRING CHARGE, NOT NECESSARY 50.00 .
TUFF KOTE. 50,00 30.00
REMOVE/REFIX CUSHION & UPHOLSTERY REAR. 150.00 50.00
REMOVE/REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR MOT MECESSARY 120.00 -
TRANSFER OF DOOR, 120.00 50.00
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Estimate By | Our Adjusted
f Parts Condition
Qty Description o Workshop (8)) ()
REAR WHEEL ALIGNMENT. NOT NECESSARY 120,00 -
TOWING NOT NECESSARY 50.00 :
2 65B0.00 1.250.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,491.20 2,551.76
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,050,00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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KALVIN ANG WEI KUN

Automotive Assessor [ Investigator

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made sobsly for the use and benefit of the CHemnt named on the front page of this Report.

Ha lability of respensibility whalsoever. in contact of tort,
Beport. in wivihe or In part, does so at his o el oo sk

|8 agcupted to any third party wiv may meely on the Beport wholly of in pan. Any ihird party acting cr replving oin ihis




