Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 August 2018 430 PM

To: ‘James Lim'

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FBJ3203K /YN9988X ON:02/03/2018 DISCHARGE VOUCHER *LKK
REF:CC4/ASM1B004297 /R1pal3

Attachments: DV FBJ 3203K.pdf

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC4/ASM18004297/R1pa3
Your Ref: FBJ 3203K
Dear James,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 9988X AND FBJ 3203K ON 02.03.2018

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we have received the mandate approval from our principal.

As such, we hereby confirmed settlement as follow:-

1. Cost of Repair(w/GST) SS  2,566.00
2. Loss of Use (525 x 3days) 55 75.00
55 2,641.00

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return for payment processing.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed /[ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms,/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4080933)
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Hsiao TunE (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAUto)

Sent: Friday, 4 May 2018 11:12 AM

To: ‘Ang Chye Hoon'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 9988X AND FBJ 3203K ALONG/AT LONG NORTH

BUONA VISTA RD TOWARDS AYER RAJAH RD ON 02/03/2018

04 MAY 2018

M/s Chip Hong Farm Product
Dear Sirf Mdm

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18004297/R1pal

YOUR REF YN 97988X

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 9988X AND FBJ 3203K ALONG/AT LONG NORTH BUONA VISTA RD TOWARDS AYER
RAJAH RD ON 02/03/2018

We refer fo the above subject matter. We wiite to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by
your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from HKL LIM TEAM MOTORSPORT acting on behalf of the owner of FBJ 3203K
against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed
to negotiate for an omicable settlement with the Third Party.

Flease be informed that your No Claim Discount ([NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against
your palicy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take
conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply fo us
within 10 days from the date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to us and acknowledged
By us.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to
chewhldikkauto.com within 10 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting cenfre. The
list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

. Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
. Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

. Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

. Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

. Video footage of accident (if any)

. Statement and/or police report from independent witness|es) (if any)

. If you or your passenger|(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s], you are to

keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third
Party(s] and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settiement without AXA's prior
knowledge and consent,

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any
breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.



In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the
final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarificotion, please do not hesitate to contact us at 4742 3197 or email us at
chewhi@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Best Resards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)
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AUTHORISATION TO ACT

I/'We, t;ah Kot Hiel HERRY (the third party claimant™) of APT Bk 203
Shprfu Rood  Heb-129 (address), owner of FEI 32034 (vehicle no.) hereby

authorize Bk Lin TEAM MoTerspoiT (*the workshop™) 1o act for me with respect
to my claim lor repair costs and/or rental and/or loss ol use (“claim™) Tor my vehicle no.

FRT 20525 that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 22 !H 113 (date)
along _Neebv  Buowa Victe Rpad  Torasds i‘qu'cf Rajaw Road  (location) invalving
vehicle nofs YN 9983 x (“the accident™).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they
deem fit and the workshop is further authorized 10 receive payment Turther o settlement of my

claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the waorkshaop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on omy behalf is on a
without prejudice and without admission ol lability basis insolar as the driver/owner/insurers

of the other vehicle/s is concerned,

Dated this L (day) of rfferf (month) 20 F(year)

Qéﬁ /g//

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™

{with company stamp if applicable) {with company siamp)



Ay FA

P redefining / insurance

CLAIM REF : SBMO0SYD
INSURED : Chip Hong Farm Product

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We/l Goh Kok Hin Henry, NRIC No. $8208572/F) hereby agree to accept the sum of dollars [two
thousand six hundred forty one only | (54 2,641.00) paid to us/me by AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD as
full and final settlement of all claims of whatever kind Including damages for personal injuries and
damages to property that we/l may have against the said AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD or their Insured
or the driver of motor vehicle no. YN 9988X as a result of an accident along on 2™ March 2018 of
which we/| were/was the driver/ owner/ hirer/ passenger/rider/pillion/ insurer of motor vehlicle no.
FB] 3203K.

We/l hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/or driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. YN_9988X in connection directly or
indirectly with the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/l hereby declare that we/l are/am the person(s) entitied to receive the above settlement and

hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in
respect of this settlement.

it is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of liability whatsoever
on the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. YN 9988X:

Dated this 29 day of AUGwt 2018
Claimant's Signature ; Qﬂh
NRIC no./ Company Stamp : SR etshLF
Occupation/ Business . ReTRAROER
Address . BUE 7o} FAunru pohn #06-114 S‘(r.?-ﬂ 103 )
Telephone No. : TESLH?W
Witness's Name ; ?M du. :lm Qm
Witness's Signature ] _'%4’
Witness's NRIC No. . 3P 4500 A
WITHOUT PREJUDICE to: |
\&) Insurers’ Subrogated Claim and/or
AXA tnsurance Pte Lid {Compary Reg. No. 1889035120) {b) Any Personal Injury Claims
B Shenton Way, #24-00 AXA Towet, Singapore 088811 |Note: This Notice supercedes any
Customer Centra 48101 j

inconsistencies found in this

Tel: +65 ARA0 4BBB Fax +85 6338 2522 Website: www.aka,com.5¢ Discharge Voucher]



= HKL Lim Team Motorsport s ass

b m 1008 Bukit Merah Lane 3. #01-24, Alexandra Village Industrial Estate 159722 Singapore Slngapare
L v - Tel Mo 62756566, 627566866 Fax Mo 62729291  Email - hkllimteamg@gmail. com

INVOICE
Date 12/04/2018 (17:52:00) INVOICE: INV-92499
Pane i1 of 2
Bill Te ' AXA INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTELTD Job Sheet No @ INWVD3147
Address Vehicle No.  © FBJ3203K
) Model

Milsage ]

PO No

Payment CHEQUE
Cantact Mo. Client Code ¢ G1133
Svz. Advisor
Mechanic
E;SEFEFD-F?l_ T - R ___@;r"“"_ Unit Bnce Disc % Sub Tolal  Total Amauni
g e oo e I G e _ SG0 . G0 N oLl 0 S
Labour
TOWING 0.00
FROMNT FORK ALIGNMENT 0.00
STEERING COMNE BEARING 0.00
TOP BOX RACK 0.00
HANDLEBAR 0.00
HANDLEBAR BALANCER LH 0.00
SIDE MIRROR LH 0.00
I LUNIT 0.00
I LINIT BRACKET 0.00
CLUTCH LEVER 0.00
FRAME SLIDER 0.00
PULSER OIL COVER / GASKET 0.00
EMGINE OIL 4 LITRE : 0,00
GEAR PEDAL / RUBBER 0.00
GEAR PEDAL ROD 0.00
FROMNT FOOT REST LH 0.00
TOPBOX GIVI 471 (MADE IN ITALY) 0.00
LABOUR 0.00
TOTAL 1.00 2 568.00 2,566.00 2,566.00

Remarks



