6/2/2020 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

RE: SLS 4207 C - DOA 13.02.18 //LKK REF: CC4/AXA18004184/Kpb3

L.H. Car Rental P.L. <lhcar@hotmail.sg>
Fri 29/5/2020 5:45 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Dear Sir.
We agree the settlement @ $2500.00 global.

Best Regards,
James from L.H. Car Rental Pte. Ltd.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, May 29, 2020 5:43 PM

To: L.H. Car Rental P.L.

Subject: Re: SLS 4207 C - DOA 13.02.18 //LKK REF: CC4/AXA18004184/Kpb3

Without Prejudice
Dear sirs/Mdm,
We refer to our below email.

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,

whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@]lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 30 April 2020 2:58 PM

To: L.H. Car Rental P.L. <lhcar@hotmail.sg>

Subject: Re: SLS 4207 C - DOA 13.02.18 //LKK REF: CC4/AXA18004184/Kpb3
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Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement at a global sum of $2,500.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,

whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: L.H. Car Rental P.L. <lhcar@hotmail.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 30 April 2020 12:15 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLS 4207 C - DOA 13.02.18 //LKK REF: CC4/AXA18004184/Kpb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Docs attached.

Best Regards,
James from Lian Her Motors.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, April 27, 2020 3:15 PM

To: L.H. Car Rental P.L.

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: SLS 4207 C - DOA 13.02.18 //LKK REF: CC4/AXA18004184/Kpb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
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We refer to our below email.
Kindly let us have your full set of LOD with all the supporting docs for our necessary action.
Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@]lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 20 April 2020 12:49 PM

To: L.H. Car Rental P.L. <lhcar@hotmail.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLS 4207 C - DOA 13.02.18 //LKK REF: CC4/AXA18004184/Kpb3
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have your full set of LOD with all the supporting docs for our necessary action.

Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,

whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

terms/settlement.”
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 20 December 2019 1:19 PM

To: L.H. Car Rental P.L. <lhcar@hotmail.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLS 4207 C - DOA 13.02.18

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Please be informed that this matter is now handled by my colleague, Ms Hsiao Tong.
Hi Hsiao Tong,

FYNA, our ref CC4/AXA18004184/Kpb3

""Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 (Ext:119) Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: L.H. Car Rental P.L. [mailto:lhcar@hotmail.sg]
Sent: Friday, 20 December 2019 12:29 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLS 4207 C - DOA 13.02.18

Dear Officer in charge,

Your prompt reply will be appreciated by us.

Please revert the matter soonest.

Best Regards,
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James from Lian Her Motors.

From: L.H. Car Rental P.L.

Sent: Friday, March 22, 2019 12:41:17 PM
To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: SLS 4207 C - DOA 12.03.18
Dear Joy,

Attached is the video footage for SLS 4207 C

Best Regards,
James from LIAN HER MOTORS.
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