Hsiao Tnng (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 10 August 2019 1:37 PM

To: ‘emiautopteltd@gmail.com'’

Subject: Your ref: SLD336T *Our ref: CC4/11118004162/M1 pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH

6525X(II1) /SLD 336T / OTHERS ON 28/02/2018]

Your ref: SLD3346T Without Prejudice
Qur ref: CC4/1IN18004162/M1pb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 6525X(Ill) /SLD 33T / OTHERS ON 28/02/2018

We refer to the above matter,

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $13,950.00(all-in).

Flease confirm acceptance.,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-35 | 5(408933)



Hsiao Tuna (LKKAuto)

From: Chia 5in Muk <emlautopteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2019 2:21 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: Re: Your ref: SLD336T *Our ref: CC4/11118004162 /M1 pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH

6525X (1) /SLD 336T / OTHERS ON 28/02/2018)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Hsiao Tong,

We confirmed acceptance of Global sum at $13,950.00 (all-in).
Kindly proceed to arrange payment/DV to EM-1 AUTO PTE LTD,

Thanks & Best Regards,

Karen, on behalf of,

Chia Sin Muk (Mr)

m: (65) 9666 6556 | o: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643

Co, [ GST Registration Numbser: 201316330R

Important: This email is confidental and may be priviteged. i you are not the intended fecipient, please delate it and notify us immediately; you should not
COopy or use i for @ny purpoda, nor disclose its conlents to any other parson, Thank you

On 5at, 10 Aug 2019 at 13:36, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com> wrote:
Your ref: SLD334T Without Prejudice
Our ref: CC4/118004162/M1pb3
Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 6525X(Ill) /SLD 33T / OTHERS ON 28/02,/2018

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $13,950.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sale intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080933)



EM-1 AUTO PTE LTD

BLK 8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE SECTOR C
#01-68 SINGAPORL: 575643

Contact Number: 6452 3298 (0) 9666 6556 (11/P) 6457 5776 (1)

Email Address: emlautopteltd@gmail.com
COMPANY [/ GST REG, NO: 2013 16380R

M/S TAN SAY JOON

Proforma Invoice

Date

India International Insurance Pre 1.id

Motor Claim Department
64 Cecil Street

HO4-/#05 108 Building
Singapore (04971 1

Date ol Aceident

» 18/PIOO333/5226 1P
0 05-0Oct-2018

Without Prejudice

28-Feb-2018

Our Client's Vehicle Number ¢ SLD 3367

Vehicle Make/ Model
Your Insurer

HONDA CIVIC
SH 6525X

DESCRIPTION SUB-AMOUNT  GST 7%  AMOUNT (SGD)
Lump Sum Repair Cost (Recommended by LKK Mr Ma) 12.600.00 882 .00 13,482.00 SR
GIA Fee 27.10 1.90 29.00 SR
Towing Fee 60.00 60.00 LS
Loss of (Rental/Use) (15 days x $ 115) 1.725.00 120.75 1,845.75 SR
SGD - ( Fifieen Thousand Four Hundred Sixteen And Cents GRAND TOTAL 15,416.75
Seventy-Five:only:) Subject to 7% GST 1,004.65

Authorised Signature and Company Stamp

Page 1 of |



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

ACCIDENT INVOLYING (any vehicte) L0220 g SHET0T ¥

oN 28)>|13 aLoNG - Gamba¢  Huve twds  Vishun

I -:’".e_- _.-.. Ll AV o o B MRIC Mo/ Company Reg. No.
1203004 0)  _ of (aidress) _ e

Postal Codle

LD 326 / heveby anthorise your workshop EM-1 Aulo -l gl (Company/Gi57T RIG.Na.

o the repistered owner {or authorised agent) of molor vehicle registeation number

F0)3 16 2C0E. ) Bik 8 #0168 Sector C Sin Ming Industrial Estate Singapore 575643 to -
L. Bepin or commence repairs to myfour motor vehicle:
L Start or initiate thied party claims for damages incurred by me aggainst thinl party(ies) responsible for the accident,

3. Toinstruct EM-1 Auto /! o inyfour behall w negotiate o settlement with the third party and/
o his insurers as you deem fit
4. Toappoint vehicle surveyor on my/our behalf to determine reasonable costs of repair and period of repair.

3. To act on mylour behalf for any documents mailed 0 EM 1 Auto FrL by the third party and/or his
insurers for the clvim of my vehicle, if 1 am not contactable,

Fam prepared w atend at myfour solicitors’ office or (o attend Court in congection with myfonr claim, if necessary, | shall
give my full co-operation and support for the claim for cost of vepair and loss of use and shall keep you informed of any

correspondences and/or summons that | may receive due (o this action before agreeing o pay up or reeeive any moics
due o this claim,

1 authorise you o claim for the period of loss of use as specified by the motor surveyor o sueh shorter period due to
secelerpled work, 1 further authorise you 1o accelerate the repair period with overtin: work and additional resouree, 1 will
Py you a reasomable amount to eeflect the additional period of time 1o shortes,

Lagree wo keep you informed of any document(s), ineluding chegues, mailed o o by thind party and/or his insurers before
taking any action. 1 also will not bauk in any cheques issued by third paty insurance anbor his insurers without the

approval of BM-1 Awo _ /L . and should 1 get approval from EM-1 Auto [/ | i hank in the said
cheques, 1 agree o pay BM-1 Auto [/ e Full setthement awunt as stated on the cheques within 5 working
days,

Should mylowr claim be partly successful or wisnecessful or cannol be procecded with andior if any judgement o
settlenent is not honoured or satisfied by third party, UWe:

I Agree to pay you the sum of monies (as agreed) or as certificd by the sarveyor appoinied, being the costs of repairs,
survey fees mubfor any other expenses reasonably incurred by you on mylour behalf, Yon may use the recovered
amount from my claim for loss of us to partially offset the difference.

L. Agree to pay you such increased cost for additional resources and overtime work o shorien the period of repair,

3. Will pay for any shortfall that may tesult in the settlement amonnt,

oy s
[ thee event that EM-1 Aotg * /! or the Repairer is compelled 1o mﬂqrm this undestaking, UWe agree thit Twe
shall pay on a full indemuity basis, the legal costs ineurred by EM-1 Auto [/ | __ or the Repairer,

Bigunture: JAEI- | ; M. ) oM S
Company Stamyp: NRIC Nux 1 7302609 (

(if applicable) GAA S neap

Clomibact Ny

Prate:: sl



1, Rochor Hoad, #2-574
Mochier Centre Singgsore 180001
;E il ﬁf{ lﬁ B *-".l. A :ﬁ BE /N | Tl 6292 7655, Fix: (65) G294 972

g Esmail uiviglooy i singiul com s

UNIQUE TOUR]ST SERVICE (F‘]“E) LTD ‘,’ STH LIG TADO76

Co. Heg, No,, 1974000671
GSTHeg, Mo M2-00159671 6

| MeTm Soy doon | 20, simmingtane, (RS ANCLELER

Blk 283 Tampines Street 22 i #08-51, Midview City | ) WP2017333
#07-131 | Singapore 573968 A NC

| Singapore 520283 | 6162027656 46 03 2018

i: || Sirngapme 20

PARTICULARS

Rental of one unit Honda Civic 1.6 Aulo

- Registration no. SJG 9865 G self driven as from |
“ 01.03.2018 at 1240 hrs to 15.03.2018 at 1540 hrs. (
' 15 days at $115.00 per day $ 1725.00
‘ $ 172500
Add GST at 7% $ 120.75
Amount Due $ 1845.75

( SIN DOLLARS: ONE THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED FORTY FIVE & SEVENTY FIVE CTS ONLY )

Slandard Rated Supplies-$ 1725.00 : |
Total Amount of GST-$ 120.75




UNIQUE TOURIST SERVICE (PTE) LTD.

20, Sin Ming Lane, #08-51, Midview City, Singapore 573968 ~L

P33t

P/

TEL: 6292 7656 EMAIL: uniglour@singnet.com.sq |

COMPANY REG NO: 197401067R

CAR RENTAL AGREEMENT

GST REG NO: M2-0019671-6

rmaNo. 21356

VEHICLE ND, 3 MAKEMODEL |y p
X 99965 (3 HONDE (1Y
- ' 1 ] I ™ T b = 5
(nsorvmen 10 Say & o0 D\ oweon DTTZIS weour [ILOFR
3 — R L .:!|
sooress BLIC D80S I §21 1 / : _"‘ ) -151 FFTHDI.[‘ILIT £ W (L)
. W )
mHEIrB 20 34 DATE IN ‘n' \.”'I(B TIME 184 f%“’{] J‘WE
Iy o AP f
OFFIGE TEL FES TEL w7 Ld'<a PETROL IN E oo At @)
NAMED DFEVER RENTAL FATES: . g @
MONTHLY @8
CCOUPATION NATIONALITY
i '_ - a I \ .
s 1 23 646 oworsem ) ] » WEEKLY &% |
P ] vy I & P ;
pamaricno, o 7 2V 2 L (40 sai] el A o ?"])«.{'? 0D
C.0W. FEE !
PLACE OF ISSUE DATE PASSEXPIRY | J ’ ] Iy
PETROL CONSUMPTION
%—_—h
DELIVERY CHARGE
ADOITICNAL NAMED DRIVER
COLLEGTION CHARGE
ALDRESS |
SUB-TOTAL .
EINGAPORE .
75
OFFICE TEL RES TEL He . : / r’ﬁ 15
! e FENTAL DEPOSIT
DGCLPATION HATIONALITY
TOTAL: > ¥ Py
PASSPORT f NRIC DWTE OF BIATH /e 3 'i-f" 7:5
DRIVING LIC NO
PLACE OF 158U DATE PASSEXPIRY
BY INITIATING MARK X" HIRER AGREE TO PAY THE FOLLOWINGS PEPOSIT REFUND
A, COLLISION DAMAGE WAIVER (COW) AT § PER DAY / WEEK / MONTH “x* anmmmcumgﬁmmxw /
B. SURCHARGE OF § FENA LISE IN MALAYSLA, FROM A
[1e] Le 1 E " \ \K \L r
® THE HIFIER IS RESPONSIBLE FOR ANY DAMAGES UP T0 THE EXTENT OF TOTAL LOSS OF ATTEMDED BY:
CAR, LOSS OF INCOME AND COST OF RECOVERY OF VEHICLE IF THE GAR 15 DHIVEN INTO Fl‘l;

J
~

Y MALAYSIA WITHOUT PRICR CONSENT FROM THE COMPANY.

& 00

KC;_HPIJI.MEIOEH. DOLLAR

HIRER K LIABLE FOR ALL PARKING & T‘ﬁ*-nc WJOLATIONS.

YOUR ATTENTION 15 DRAWN TO TERMS & CONIITIONS

PRINTED OVERLEAF.

\— A

(FOR SINGAPORE DRIVE ONLY)

A

SIGNATURE OF HIRER

\, OF UNIGUE er;'gsechE

DECLARATION

| HEREBY DECLARE THAT NO MOTOR
ACCIDENT HAD OCCURED DURING MY HIRE
OF YOUR MOTOR VEHICLE AS STATED IN
THE ABOVE MENTIONED SCHEDULE * OR TO
ANY SUBSTITUTED VEHICLE AS STATED
IN THE MEMORANDUM DATED,

REPLACEMENT VEHICLE NO:
1. 0N TIME
2 ON TIME
3 O TIME
]
DATE: ,:’}T/

SIGNATURE OF HIRER



GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
GENERAL G Rafflles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURA.NCE Fhone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am lo S5pm '
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTERI GST Registration No: M400017735 |

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-1B-0327G67
Date of Request: 02/03/2018 Your Rel No: VALK IN KOA,

EM1AUTO PTE LTD
BLK 8 #01-68 5IN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE SECTOR
SINGAPORE 575643

Dear SirfMadam,
Date of Accident: 28/02/2018
Vehicle No: SLD336T

Place of Accident; ALONG GAMBAS AVE TOWARDS YISHUN
Involving Vehicle No:  SHER25X

With reference to your application for the accident report, we have attached the following accident reporis as requested.

DOCUMENTS  |ACCIDENT LOCATION B [PER DOC (S§)  |QTY |AMOUNT (S$)
SHEE?EX ALDNG__GAMBAE AVE TGWﬁRDS YISHUN 14.IZII'.'_II 1
GST Amount - - B |

Iotal Amount Due {GST I_r_u_:lusi-.::‘:}

The images provided to you are taken from the onginal reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for
any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

Thank You,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[1GIRO [X] Cash [ ] Cheque



GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

INSURANCE Frone +65 6524 0010 fan. 264 622 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9%am lo 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTHR GST Registration No: M400D01 7735 \
TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-18-032022
Date of Request: 01/03/2018 Your Ref No: VALK IN KOA
EM1 AUTOC PTE LTD
BLK & #01-G8 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE SECTOR
SINGAPORE 575643
Dear SirfMadam,
Your Vehicle No: SLD336T
Date of Accident; 2800272018
Place of Accident: GAMBAS AVE TWDS YISHUN
Invaolving Vehicle No:  SHES25X (NO REPORT) CALL WITHIN 7 DAYS 2-12/3
'DESCRIPTION o - |AMOUNT (s8)

E-File Search Fee _{ﬁublh:_]
GST Amount

,l'!'otal AmnunlEue fGS1 Inclusive}_

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC G-If'fi-::ial use
Date:
[ ] GIRO [X] Cash| | Cheque
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92412019

Merimen a-Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlement

rCLAIH SuB FD LI'.'IER TMCKIHG

| Case _1. Hifted = Ay .'-'_"-'_'-'.:J..." 1 | Aadf Rpt Adj Subpnitted
06 Mar 2018 US Mar 2018 ¢y gop.00  S$12,600.00 |
i 0o: ¢600. i
Mty Edit Reg | L Edit Estimates | | wview Rpt | |

Edit Adj Rpt |

| =tatls

'Pending for Survey

| Report

| Cancei Caee ]

Reference

Claim Details

|€LAIM SUBFOLDER DETAI LS

Documents

| Insured:

' Main

| Claimant:
| ".rehiv:le Rﬂg.

Claim Type:
Vehicle Reg. |
Na.

| TAN SAY JOON,

|CDHFI}RT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 199303821R

1D: 572026045

I SLDES 6T

| Date of Loss:

| 28/02/2018 00:00 - :59

TP f MCT 18020’94{!

SHE525X

(Insured): =

Policy/Cover
_ |Mote No.o

Policy No,

gmmmnms

(Claimant): | GA190589/1

|[141 Months and 11 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]

I . E:cess
Repairer: Em-—l. Auto Pte l.t.d (HQ) Blk B Sin Ming Industrlar Estate Sector l.".' #Di GB 575643 Sin Ming - Tel: 54523298
Handling

Iisiirers India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ...

Claimant's
Insurer:
Adjuster;

[Handled by Priya]

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6338 7288

LKK Auto Cnn:ult.lrru Pte Ltd [I-Il:n  Tel: 6256-3561 .

.. [Handled by MA CHIN FOOK] ..
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED o
« 111_SG (02/08/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$13961,55) - SLD336T - Claim Handler: Priya
+ [II_5G(17/07/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SLD336T - Claim Handler: Priya

« III_5G (11/04/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$0.00) - SLD336T - Claim Handler: Priya

. |[Final Rpt due 14{03}2018]

View AN | | Gampose Case Mal U

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS=
Due Date
No results,

View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete | |

Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

https:iisingapore.mermen.comiclaimsfindex cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_cimheader&caseid=6888758extid=266063&CFID=5050,.. 1/2



/2472019 Merimen e-Claims

https:iisingapore. merimen.com/claimsfindex cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_cimheadercaseid=68RR758extid=2660638CFID=50959. . 2/2
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Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*S5LD336T (MCT18020940)

[SH6525X]
TP

TAN SAY JOON
Feb 28 2018 12:00AM

[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]

Upload Documents | Upload Photos | Compose New Letter |

Em-1 Auto Pte Ltd
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2472019 Adjuster Reporl

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd co.regno19seori19sr)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/lll18004162/M1PBE3S2
Date: 24/09/2019

REFERENCE

Handling Insurer:  India International Insurance Pte Lid Policy No: MCOMOD15

Claimant Vehicle

No : SLD336T Insured Vehicle No : SHB525X
Date of Loss: 28/02/2018 Nature of Claim; TP Claim No:  MCT18020940
DESCRIFTION TIF F VEHICLE
Feqg Mo: SLD336T
Make & Model: HOMNDA CIVIC, 1.8 L (A) Engine Mo: R18A11026695
Reg. Date: 17/05/2006 (Man. Year: 2008) Chassis No: JHMFD 163065207880
Caolour: Silver Odometer; 148613 km
Engine Capacity: 1788 cc
Market Value/New Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured (S3): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEH AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Good  Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition;
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/55R16
Front Left Side: Michelin 8 mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 8 mm
Front Right Side: Michelin 8 mm Rear Right Side; Michelin 8 mm
The abave values represent the remaining fyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS '__ - B - _Rapair&r‘s—_ ﬁt':lj'uste_r'_s_ - ~ Difference ___Diﬁ_‘i;;f;_
Parts 18,619.04 12,039.12 6,579.92 35.34
Miscellangous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 6,380.00 4.150.00 2,230.00 34.95
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 24,999.04 16,189.12 8,809.92 35.24
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 12,600.00
(5%) 24,999 .04 12.600.00 12,399.04 49.60
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 1,749.93 882.00 BET .03 49,60
Nett Amount (S§) 26,748.97 13,482.00 13,266.97 49,60
+ Car Rental (11.0 x $5115.00/day + 7.00% GST) (S%) 1,353.55
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 29.00
+ Other Costs (S3) 60.00
Nett Liability (S%) 14,924.55
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 13,950.00

INSPECTION

Date of Assignment: 05/03/2018

Em-1 Auto Pte Ltd (HQ)

Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C, #01-68

Singapore 575643

Date Inspected: 06/03/2018 Inspected At

Estimated Period of Repair: 13.0 days

Adjuster: MA CHIN FOOK Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG
https://singapore. mermen com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjusterdfuseaction=gen_printrpt&caseid=68R8758extid=2660634CFID=595832... 1/5



9724/2019 Adjuster Report

NOTE: This report represents our findings at the fime and place of inspection sfated herein, Such inspection has been camed out fo the best af our knowledge and
atility but any other lability under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.

https:lisingapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cim?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_printrpt&caseid=6888758extid=266063&CFID=505012,... /5



Bi24/2018 Adjuster Repor

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 24 Sep 2019)

Parts: 143 HONDA CIVIC 1.8 L {A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLD336T)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page numbers with

the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
'Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *,

Recommended Parts

No. Qty z:":t Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *BOOT LID ASSY Dented 620.50FL *690.50FL
2 1 *BOOT LID BADGE MNecessary 52.20FL *82.20 FL
a 1 *BOOT LID EMBLEM CIVIC Mecessary 52.00 FL *52.00FL
4 1 *BOOT LID EMELEM 1.8 Mecessary 48.00 FL *48.00 FL
5 1 *BOOT LID EMBELEM IVTEC MNecessary 48.00 FL *48.00FL
6 2 *BOOT LID NUMBER PLATE LAMPS Serviceable 104.00 FL “-FL
7 1 *BOOT LID NUMBER PLATE OUTER GARMNISH Distorted 192.20FL  *192.20FL
8 1 "SET BOOT LID NUMBER PLATE QUTER GARNISH Mecessary 30.00FL *20.00FL

CLIPS

9 1 *BOOT LID KEY LOCK Serviceable 127.20FL *-FL
10 2 *BOOT LID LAMPS Cracked 560.00 FL  *560.00 FL
n 2 *SET BOOT LID LAMP INNER SEALER Mecessary 76.00 FL *T6.00FL
12 2 *SET BOOT LID LAMP CLIPS Mecassary 50.00 FL 20,00 FL
13 1 *BOOT LID STOPPER LONG Mecessary / Distorted 44.00FL 44 00FL
14 1 *BOOT LID INNER LOCK Bent 194.00FL  *194.00FL
15 1 *BOOT LID LOCK CATCH Bent 46 20FL  "46.20FL
16 1 *BOOT LID WEATHERSTRIP Distorted 15920FL *159.20FL
17 2 *BOOT LID HINGES Repair 112,40 FL “-FL
118 1 *REAR BUMPER ASSY Deformed 6B 20FL *689.20FL
19 2 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS Distorted T6.00FL *T6.00FL
20 1 *SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary S0.00FL  *50.00 FL
21 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER ARCH GARNISH Serviceabla 69.10FL *-FL
22 2 *REAR BUMPER MUDFLAPS Serviceable 184.00FL *-FL
23 2 *TAILLAMPS ASSY Cracked 678.40FL *678.40FL
24 2 *TAILLAMP INNER SEALER MNecessary T6.00FL *T6.00 FL
25 2 *SET TAILLAMP CLIPS MNecessary S50.00FL *20.00 FL
26 2 *TAILLAMP LOWER RETAINER Distorted T2.00FL "T2.00FL
27T 1 *END PANEL ASSY Bent S582.50FL *592.50FL
28 1 *END PANEL TOP TRIM Distorted 95.20FL *a5.20 FL
29 1 *END PANEL TOP TRIM COVER Serviceable 36.20FL *-FL
3 1 *SET END PANEL TOP TRIM CLIPS MNecessary 30.00FL  "20.00FL
3t 1 *SPARE TYRE PANEL Buckled 852 60FL *95260FL
3z 1 *SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP BOARD Distorted 321.80FL *321.80FL
az 1 “SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP TOOLS SPONGE Serviceable 116.20 FL *-FL
34 1 *SPARE TYRE WHEEL NUT Serviceable 42.00FL *~FL
a5 1 *REAR CHASSIS FRAME MEMEERS Repair 544.00FL *-FL
B 2 *REAR AIR VENT Serviceable 85.20FL *-FL
ar 2 *REAR FENDER INNER TRIMS Distorted 446,00 FL  *446.00FL
38 2 *SET REAR FENDER INNER TRIM CLIPS Mecessary 60.00 FL *60.00 FL
g 2 *REAR EXHAUST MOUNTINGS Serviceable 76.00FL *-FL
40 1 *REAR EXHAUST GASKET MNecessary 46.20FL *46.20 FL
41 1 *REAR EXHAUST HEAT PLATE Serviceable 93.10FL “-FL
42 1 *BOMNET INNER LOCK Repair 97.20FL “=FL
43 1 *FRONT BEUMPER Deformed 692.60FL *692.60FL
44 2 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS Distorted T6.00 FL *T6.00 FL

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
hittps-'singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&luseaction=gen_printrpt&caseld=6888754extid=2660638CFID=595032... 3/5




8724/2019

Part

No. Qty Mo.

Particulars

45
46
47
48
49

50

51
52
53
54
55

56

57
58
59
60
61
62
63
B4
65
66
67
68
69
T
71
T2
73
74
75
76
T
78
79
80
81
B2

- T S | A

| AT e S

St et | e e R e e el T | e Rl T il T R =Y

—

“SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS
*FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT

“FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKET
“FRONT BUMPER NUMBER PLATE BEASE GARNISH

*FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMPS
“FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMPS COVER

*FRONT GRILLE

*FRONT GRILLE CHROME MOULDING
*FRONT GRILLE BADGE

*SET FRONT GRILLE BADGE
*HEADLAMPS

*HEADLAMPS LOWER RETAINERS

*SET HEADLAMP CLIPS

*FRONT FENDER RH

“FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD RH
*SET FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIP
“FRONT FENDER TOP GARNISH RH
*SUPPORT PANEL

*SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARNISH

*SET SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS
*SET HORNS

*RADIATOR

*AIR CON CONDENSER

*CONDENSER AIR CON PIPE
*CONDENSER SUCTION PIPE
*CONDENSER DISCHARGE PIPE
*DASHBOARD CENTER CONSOLE
*METER BOX OUTER GARNISH

*REAR EXHAUST SILENCER

*REAR NUMEER PLATE WITH HOLDER
*BODY PANEL JOINT SEALANT

“*REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATOR PAD
*SET REVERSE SENSOR

*REVERSE CAMERA

*REAR EXHAUST CHROME PIPE
*FRONT NUMEBER PLATE WITH COVER

*RADIATOR COOLANT
*RADIO SET (LOCAL REPAIR)

F=Franchise part. S=Spchetl. L=ListHemDisc.

Adjuster Report

Condition Repairer's Amount
Mecessary 50.00FL  *50.00FL
Dented 272.00FL *272.00FL
Mot Mecessary 138.00 FL *-FL
Serviceable 56.00 FL *-FL
/s Cracked/N/s Not 592.80FL *296.40FL
Mecessary
s Cracked/Mis Not T2.00FL *36.00 FL
Mecessary
Distorted 196.50FL *196.50FL
Distorted 198 50FL *198.50FL
Missing 22.00FL *52.00 FL
Mecessary 3000FL  *30.00FL
N/s Not Necessary/Ofs 3.549.00FL *1,774.50FL
Cracked
N/s NotNecessary/O/fs 92.00FL *46.00 FL
Distorted
Mot Mecessary 40.00 FL *-FL
Repair 520.00 FL *-FL
Distorted 119.00FL *1M9.00FL
Necessary 25.00FL  *25.00FL
Serviceable 59.00FL *-FL
Repair 612.50 FL *““FL
Cut 149 30FL  *149.30FL
MNecessary 40.00FL  *20.00FL
Cut 120.00FL  *120.00FL
Dented 1,507.00 FL *1,507.00FL
Dented 852 40FL "8B52.40FL
Mot Necessary 196.00 FL *-FL
Mot Mecessary 212.00FL *-FL
Mot Necessary 247.00FL *-FL
Serviceable 426 00 FL *-FL
Serviceable 487.10FL *-FL
Deformed 503.44F5 *250.00FS
Cut TO.00FS *40.00FS
Mecessary 120.00F5 *BO.OOFS
Necessary 150.00FS *120.00FS
Shorted 250.00Fs *220.00F5
Shorted 450.00FS *350.00F3
Cut 240.00FS *120.00FS
Cracked 70.00FS  *40.00FS
MNecessary 40.00F5  *40.00FS
Dented 850.00FS *450.00FS
Sub Total (5%) 22,587.94 14,621.40
- List Item Discount on L Items 20.00/20.00% (5%) 3.968.90 258228
12,039.12

Total Parts (S5) 18,619.04

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https:/isingapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_printrpt&caseid=688875&extid=26606384CFID=595032... &4/5



92472018 Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour Items
1 PANEL BEATING. Mew 2,800.00 1,800.00
2 SPRAY PAINTING. New 2,400.00 1,700.00
3 CHECK WIRING. Mew 100.00 60.00
4 ANTI RUST. MNew 180.00 80.00
5 REMOVE AND INSTALL CARPET AND SEAT. Mew 120.00 80.00
] REMOVE AND INSTALL REVERSE SENSOR. New 90.00 60.00
) REMOVE AND INSTALL REVERSE CAMERA. MNew 150.00 80.00
B8 REMOVE AND INSTALL REAR SILENCER. New 120.00 80.00
9 REMOVE AND INSTALL PETROL TANK. MNew 120.00 80.00
10  TO JACK AND ALIGN REAR CHASSIS FRAME MEMBER. New 350.00 0.00
1 REMOVE AND INSTALL AIR CON. MNew 150.00 120.00
Gross Labour Cost (S5) 6,380.00 4,150.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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