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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July, 2019 9:49 AM

To: Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Ong Chin Kiat; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Tracy Dai

Subject: RE: FOR MANDATE : SNM18D01141C07/LKKDS/0 / SBK 3300H AND SHC 5781K ON 

28/02/2018

LKK REF:  Please advise 

CTI REF:  SNM18D01141C07/0 (SBK3300H) 

 

Dear Joy Irene 

 

We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter. 

 

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim by SHC5781K at $7,389.71. 

 
Best Regards 
 
Alfred Toh    
Senior Executive 
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 

DID : (65) 6389 6183 
FAX: (65) 6224 7478 

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平
太平太平

太平狮

狮狮

狮城

城城

城 Taiping SG 

 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. 
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended 
recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 

From: Lim Shu Min  

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July, 2019 9:28 AM 

To: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com> 

Subject: FW: FOR MANDATE : SNM18D01141C07/LKKDS/0 / SBK 3300H AND SHC 5781K ON 28/02/2018 

 

Dear Chin Kiat, 

 

Please assist and revert. 

 

 
 
Thank you 

 
Lim Shu Min 
Executive  
Claims Department 
  
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 63896156  |   F: (65) 62247175 
   
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
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Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please 
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 

 

 

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 2 July, 2019 2:15 PM 

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: FOR MANDATE : SNM18D01141C07/LKKDS/0 / SBK 3300H AND SHC 5781K ON 28/02/2018 

 

Dear Sirs, 

 

We refer to our mandate request on 01/06/19 

 

We would like to follow-up for your approval. 

 

Please advise. 

 

Thank you. 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Joy Irene | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged 

information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender 

immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email 

is strictly forbidden. 

 

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Saturday, 1 June 2019 3:42 PM 

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com' 

<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FOR MANDATE : SNM18D01141C07/LKKDS/0 / SBK 3300H AND SHC 5781K ON 28/02/2018 

 

SNM18D01141C07/LKKDS/0 
 

 

Dear Sirs, 

 

TP video attached for your viewing. 

 

Our insured hit TP taxi after initially hitting SGL 409J. 

 

Liability is not in our favour. 

 

Summary to offer to repairer M/s TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD is as follows: 
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 TP CLAIMED OUR REVISED 

Cost of Repairs  $ 42,029.19 (per estimate) $ 6,473.50 GST included 

Loss of Rental $      608.76 ($101.46 x 5 days) $    608.76 ($101.46 x 6 ) 

Loss of Income $      300.00 ($ 50 x 6 days) $    300.00 ( $50 x 6 ) 

 $          7.49 $         7.45 

TOTAL $ 42,945.44  $ 7,389.71 

 

 

Relevant supporting claim documents attached for your perusal and reference. 

 

The above summary is subject for your approval to offer. 

 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Joy Irene | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or 

privileged information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please 

notify the sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution 

of the material in this email is strictly forbidden. 
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