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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 May 2018 5:41 PM

To: meili@almsm.com.sg

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Request to register TP Claim- Our client's vehicle SJB 862A insured under AVIVA 

agaonst your insured Vehicle SGY3669L  acc on 31/12/2017 *** LKK REF: 

CC4/ASM18004106/ea3 

Attachments: SGY3669L.MP4; OI SKETCH PLAN.pdf

Without Prejudice 

 

Hi Mui Hong, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJB 862A AND SGY 3669L ON 31/12/2017 

 

We attached here with a copy of our insured’s accident statement and our insured video for your easy reference. 

 

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client changed lane into 

our insured lane and collided into our insured vehicle. 

 

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor. 

 

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable 

to look into your client’s claim. 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 6 March 2018 8:01 PM 

To: meili@almsm.com.sg; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments 

<assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Request to register TP Claim- Our client's vehicle SJB 862A insured under AVIVA agaonst your insured 

Vehicle SGY3669L acc on 31/12/2017 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18004106/ea3  

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 
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Please be informed that this case is pending instruction from AXA’s for direct settlement. 

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher at 6841 6051. 

 

Meanwhile, please arrange appointment for survey. 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: meili@almsm.com.sg [mailto:meili@almsm.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 1 March, 2018 6:02 PM 

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg> 

Subject: Request to register TP Claim- Our client's vehicle SJB 862A insured under AVIVA agaonst your insured Vehicle 

SGY3669L acc on 31/12/2017 

 

Dear Motor Claims Team 

  

We refer to the attachment. 

  

Kindly assist to register our client’s TP claim and assign a surveyor to arrange an appointment to survey our 

client’s vehicle soonest possible. 

  

Regards, 

 

Meili Tan - (Sin Ming) 

176 Sin Ming Drive 

#05-12 Sin Ming Autocare 

Singapore 575721 

Tel : 6456 3637 Fax: 6456 3686 

email : meili@almsm.com.sg 


