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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 March 2018 12:39 PM

To: Goh, Stella

Cc: assignments; SUR

Subject: Re: RE : YOUR REF : NSV1800146, ACCIDENT ON : 02/03/18, INVOLVING CLIENT'S 

(SJZ 2255 M) & YOUR INSURED (SDY 621 D) ALONG STADIUM BOULEVARD

Attachments: SJZ 2255 M (agree & accept).pdf

Dear Stella, 
 
Client's agree & accept your offer recommendation of 50% settlement, attach for your reference & 
attention, we will forwards the letter of demand & necessary documents to you by mail, once your 
appointed survey finalise with us, 
 

Right-click or tap and hold here 
to download pictures. To help  
protect your privacy, Outlook 
prevented au tomatic download  
of this picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

 

On 12 March 2018 at 12:19, Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com> wrote: 

Our Claim ref: NSV1800146 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear David, 

  

We refer to your email dated 07.03.2018. 

  

Based on conflicting versions, we are prepared to consider to settle your client’s claim at 50%. 

  

We are agreeable with a direct settlement with your workshop, subjected to agreed quantum with our surveyor. 

  

Please submit the supporting documents to quantify your client’s claim. 

  

Thank you. 
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Regards  

Stella Goh  

Claims Analyst  

Claims Group  

Global Markets  

   

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd  

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914  

T: +65 6423 0857  

F: +65 6423 0864  

E: stella.goh@awac.com  

W: www.awac.com 

  

From: David Ang [mailto:hupmotor@gmail.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 7 March 2018 5:18 PM 

To: Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com> 

Subject: RE : YOUR REF : NSV1800146, ACCIDENT ON : 02/03/18, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SJZ 2255 M) & YOUR 

INSURED (SDY 621 D) ALONG STADIUM BOULEVARD 

  

Dear Stella, 

  

We are unable to accept your reply & your insured report statement, my client's was traveling the road 
every day for her way home, she was driving in her lane, due to the front vehicle jam brake, she stop in 
time, but your insured following to close ? fast speed ? causing the accident to be happen, as he was 
trying to avoid and filter out to the right, as the result, knock into client's rear right side,  

  

Kindly reconsider our client's third party claims, Please let us hear from you, Failing client's will consult & 
hand over the claims to her solicitors, 

  

On 7 March 2018 at 16:16, Goh, Stella <stella.goh@awac.com> wrote: 

Our Claim ref: NSV1800146 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear David, 

  

We refer to your email dated 02.03.2018. 
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Our insured reported that your client was making a lane change and caused the accident. 

  

Therefore we are of the view that ONUS is on your client. 

  

We regret to inform that we are unable to consider your claim. 

  

Hope this clarifies. 

 

Thank you. 

  

  

Regards  

Stella Goh  

Claims Analyst  

Claims Group  

Global Markets  

   

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd  

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914  

T: +65 6423 0857  

F: +65 6423 0864  

E: stella.goh@awac.com  

W: www.awac.com 

  

From: David Ang [mailto:hupmotor@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, 2 March 2018 3:19 PM 

To: Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com> 

Cc: Team A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 02/03/18, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SJZ 2255 M) & YOUR INSURED (SDY 621 D) ALONG 

STADIUM BOULEVARD 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

Attach our estimate bill, GIA third party insurer search fee, client's GIA report, insurance certificate & log 
card for your reference & attention,  

  

Kindly revert & confirm client's third party claims liability, reference & OIC, as we are looking for direct 
settlement, Please let us hear from yours, 
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For your info, we will assign your panel surveyor Mr Marcus Chua from LKK auto consultants to survey 
client's damaged vehicle On : 05/03/18, at 11am to 1pm, 

  

  

Best Regards 

 

David Ang 

 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076 

HP : 9815 4655 

 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  

Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 

#01-120 

Singapore 528838  

  

Right-click or tap and hold here 
to download pictures. To help  
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Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

The information contained in this e-mail and any attachments hereto is confidential. If you are not the intended 

recipient, you must not use or disseminate any of this information. If you have received this e-mail in error, please 

immediately notify the sender by reply e-mail and permanently delete the original e-mail (and any attachments 

hereto) and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this e-mail and any attachments hereto are believed to be 

free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is 

the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by Allied World 

Assurance Company Holdings, GmbH or its subsidiaries or affiliates, either jointly or severally, for any loss or 

damage arising in any way from its use. 

 

 

 

  

--  

Best Regards 

 

David Ang 

 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076 

HP : 9815 4655 

 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  
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Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 

#01-120 

Singapore 528838  

 

 

 

 

--  

Best Regards 

 

David Ang 

 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076 

HP : 9815 4655 

 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  

Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 

#01-120 

Singapore 528838  


