Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 23 March 2018 12:33 PM

To: 'suhaimi@firstautoworks.com.sg'

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; 'ronnie.tan@firstautoworks.com.sg'
Subject: RE: SDGY5S against your insured SJH1912B DOA:09/02/018
Attachments: SDG95S (FRONT).mp4; SDG95S (REAR).mp4

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC6/CT118004076/Aks3
Your Ref: SDG95S

Dear Suhaimi,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJH 1912B / SDG 95S / OTHERS ON 09.02.2018
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the available information and
evidence at hand, our principal is in the view that our Insured is not liable of the accident.

Based on the enclosed copy of your client’s CCTV footage, our principal is in view that our insured is not liable to
losses incurred by your client’s vehicle (refer BOLA scenario 15(a) and 28(d)).

Under such circumstances, we have our principal’s instruction to reject your client’s claim.

As such, we will close the matter at our end.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Suhaimi [mailto:suhaimi@firstautoworks.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 23 March 2018 11:04 AM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SDG95S against your insured SJH1912B DOA:09/02/018

Noted on this matter Zaini.

Thanks & Regards

Suhaimi Ong

Service Executive

1st Autoworks Pte Ltd
23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4,
#04-01 (South Wing)
S'pore 415933

Tel : 6844 1985

Fax : 6844 5185



