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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX 6256 4315

Reg Mo: 195607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automohbile

CHIMA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00

Ref : CCs/CTIMB004076/Aks3

LA

SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 Date 02:05-2018
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJH 18128 Veh. Inspected SDG 958
Policy No. DMTPSN1754741700 Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. SNM1BD00835C02 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 02/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model C.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Req.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer ) Steering
Brakes Modification
General
1. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre i
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  09/02/2018 |Inspection Date 01/03/2018
Survey held at 15T AUTOWORKS PTE LTD
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
#04-01 (SOUNTH WING)
SINGAPORE 415933
5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WaAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




1st Autoworks Pte Ltd
23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01 {South Wing) Singapore 415933

Repair Estimate

Date ; 1/3/2018 Reference: SDGO5S
OPEL ASTRA
Make: HBE 1.4 AT

To Whom It May Concern
Dear Sir,

RE: VEHICLE .:SDG955
CHASSIS NO.:WOLBEGECEHGD02692
ENGINE NO.:B1162297GSGX0079

Name of insured ..NG TIM PENG
Date of accident.: 09/02/2018

We append hereunder the estimated cost of repairs to be carried out to the above vehicle.

Parts
No. Qty Part Description Price (SGD)
1 1 |Front Bumper | ' 5 1,600.00 |
2 1 |RHF Fender ~ j: 3 426.00
3 1 |RHF Headlamp 5 1,200.00
4 1 |RHF Bumper Bracket $ 65.00
| & 1 |RH Wind Mirror Cover 5 120.00
6 1 |RH Wind Mirror Assy I+ $ 360.00
7 1 |RH Wind Mirror Glass 3 208.00
8 1 |RHF Bumper Guide 5 65.00
Parts Total: $ 4,044.00
Less10%: $ 404.40
Total: $ 3,639.60
Labour

Labour Description
No. Price (SGD)

Front portion

To dismantle | renew the accident damaged portion,to panel
1 beating,reshape,straighten,orientate and align repair /replacement parts. {($650] $ 3_.25!).01}
|perday)
2 Carry out spray painting on accident affected area ($550 per panel) $ 2,200.00
3 To disconnect wire harness of electrical component to facilitate g 30.00
* repairs,reconnect and check electrical function after repair 2
4 To refocus headlamp 3 80.00

Labour Total : $ 5,560.00



Other Description
No. Qty Price (SGD
Front portion
1 10 |Front bumper clip At s 5 65.00
2 3 |RHF Fender Liner Clip - 5 19.50
Other Total: $ 84.50

GRAND TOTAL: 5 9,284.10

NE: THIS IS ONLY AN ESTIMATE AND SHOULD ADDITIONAL WORK BE FOUND NECESSARY TO BE CARRIED OUT IN THE
COURSE OF REPAIRS, EXTRA MATERIALS AND LABOUR COST WILL BE CHARGED ACCORDINGLY WHICH HOWEVER, YOU
WILL BE INFORMED PRIOR TO ACTION TAKEN. PARTS PRICES ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGES.

Yours faithfully =

Service Executive b > D033
Suhaimi Ong AN '
HP . 8298 8933 Fax:6844 5185




Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com=

Sent: Manday, 5 March 2018 11:03 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auta)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJIH1912B (Ol : CTI - SNM18D00835C02)

AND SDG95S (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18004076/Aks3) on 09/02/2018

Hi Shirley,

As spoken, kindly refer to the above subject for your reference,
Regards

Lucas Lee

Claims Department {Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road, #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 075909

Co Reg. No. 200208384E

D'E’] - :I_'.-_.'. >4 824
Fax: 6224 71
Email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Website. www.sq.cntaiping.com

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 5 March, 2018 11:01 AM

To: Lucas Lee

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 5JH19128 (O1 : CTI - TBA) AND SDG955 (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/CTI1B004076/Aks3) on 09/02/2018

Dear Lucas,

Kindly Provide us your claim no.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Shirley Higw | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-00%5% | email: ShireyHiew @ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Uhbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 5 March 2018 10:04 AM

To: Sharon Tan <sharon.tan@directasia.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>;

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 5JH19128 {0l : CTI - TBA) AND 5DG955 (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTIL8004076/Aks3) on 09/02/2018

Dear Sharon,



Thanks and noted.

Thank you,
Bast Regards,
Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

flk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uk Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4084933)

From: Sharon Han [mailto:sharon.han@sg.cntaiping.com]
Sent: Monday, 5 March 2018 9:43 AM
To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJH19128 (01 : CTI - TBA) AND 5DGS55 (TP : LKK REF -
CC6H/CTI18004076/Aks3) on 09/02/2018

Dear Shirley,
Qur insured’s report attached.

Thank you & regards

Sharon Han
Motor Division
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd,
3 Anson Road #15-02

Springleaf Tower Singapore 078909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6193

Fax: 6224 717516224 7478

Email. claimsdept{@sg.cntaiping.com

sharon.han@sg cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer - This message is confidential; its contents do not constituie a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapare) Pre. Lid. excepl
where provided for in a written agreement berween you and China Taiping Insurance (Stngapore) Pre. Lid Any unauthorized disclosure, use or
dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If vou are not the intended recipient of the message, please notifis the sender immediately

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 5 March, 2018 8:59 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Sharon Han <sharon.han@sg.cntaiping.com>; Zaini {LKK
Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.coms>, Adeline Chng
<adeling.chng@sg.cntaiping.com=




Subject: Direct Settlerent - Accident Involving SJH19128 (Ol : CTI - TBA} AND SDG95S (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTII8004076/Aks3) on 09/02/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
We have inspected TP vehicle SDG 958 at M /s First Autoworks Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report

We will revert preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Zaini and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2132.
To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you

Best Repards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShideyHiew@Ikkauto,com | fax; 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408233)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service,
For more information please visit http://www symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hittp://www.syinanteccloud.com




Zaini (LKK Auto)

I s R S TSI S PR S —————————— e

From: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng®sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent; Friday, 23 March 2018 12:10 PM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuta); Admin A; Alfred Toh; Angie Foo; Sharon Han
Subject: RE; OUR REF: SNM18D00835C02/2/LKKDS & YR 5DGH55 (TP @ LKK REF -

CCh/CTIBO04076/Aks3) on 09/02/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Zaini

Please proceed to reject the claim (refer BOLA scenario 15(a) and 28(d)).
Our insured is not liable lo losses incurred by SDGY5S,

Thank you.

Regards,

Adeline Chng

Executiva

Claims Dapariment (Malar Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Lid.
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleal Tower

Singapcre 073909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

oD 63896155

Fax: G224T478/6224T175

Email: adeline. chng@sg. cntaiping. com

Email glaimsdepl@sg.cnlaiping.com
Website, www.sg.cntaiping.com

vaclaymer

This messoge s confidential: fts contents do not constitute o compmitment by Ching Taiping Insurance (Singopore] Pte. Lid. except where
provided forin a written agreement hetween you end Ching Towping Insurance (Singopore) Pre, Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or
disseminatian, either in whale or partial, is prokibiced, If vou are not the intended recipien of the message, please natify the sender

rymediately

h% Please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Zaini (LKK Auto) [mailto:Zaini@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Friday, 23 March, 2018 11:10 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Sharon Han <sharon.han@sg.cntaiping.com=

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=; Adeline Chng
<adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com=; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping. com; Angie Foo
<angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM18D00835C02/2/LKKDS & YR SDGA95S (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18004076/Aks3) on
05/02/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sharon,



We refer to our email dated 13.03.2018.
Kindly let us have your approval/ instruction as third party {1st Autoworks Pte Ltd) is chasing for liability clearance.

Thank you.

Taini Kusaini | e Heandliey
LKK Avic Consultfanis Ple Lid
1348412132 | amodl; Jaini@kkauto.comy | fos 6741-4108

ayallbi inddshial Park, Ui Avenos 1, #02-25 | S{408733)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 March 2018 4:14 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg cntaiping:.coms; Sharon Han <sharon han@sg entaiping.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Adeline Chng
<adeline.chng@sp.cntaiping. com>; 'alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com' <alfred toh@sp . cntaiping coms>; "Angie Foo’
cangie foo@se cntaiping coms

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM18D00835C02/2/LKKDS & YR SDGI55 (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18004076/Aks3) on
09/02/2018

WITHOUT PREIUDICE

Your Ref: SMM18D00B3SC02/2
Our Ref: CCo/CTI1B004076/Aks3

Dear Sharon,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES 5JH 19128 / 5DG 955 / OTHERS ON 09/02/2018

We refer to the above matter.

TP reported that he was travelling on 2* lane when Ol vehicle cut into his lane and collided onto TP vehicle.
Enclosed copy of TP CCTV footage for your further review.

Ol reported that he was unable to stop in time and steered left immediately, resulting in a collision with TP vehicle.
Ol further stated that TP vehicle was driving from the left lane and the collision caused damages to his right main
headlight, frant right bumper and left side mirror. No CCTV footage provided by Ol till date.

We had spoken to the OID where he confirmed that at the material time, he was travelling within his lane at the said
location as reported when he suddenly change lane to avoid collision with the front vehicle. CID further mentioned
that he was nat fully aware if TP vehicle was travelling from the 2™ lane or 1% lane prior to the collision. However,
010 informed that TP vehicle was positioned on his left immediately after the collision took place.

In view of the available evidences on hand, we opined that the above accident best fit the below BOLA SCENARID as
follows;



: SCENARIO DESCRIPTION

28, Driver of the vehicle behin
100% liable for losses incl

Wj_,l - > vehicle immediately in froi
..;?'_u_-

Reason: To avoid costly |
Stop collision damages

For your further instructions,

Best Regoid

Laini Kusalni | Case Handlor

LKE Auto Cansultants Ple Uid

(2000 sB41-2) 32 | emall Zoini@kkouts com | fox! 4741-4108

Blk 51, Payatlly Induskial Fork, Ukl Avenue |, #02-25 | 5[408%33)

From: Angie Foo [mailto:angie foo@sg.cotaiping.com]

Sent: Thursday, & March 2018 4:01 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg,.cntaiping.coms;
Sharon Han <sharon.han@sg.cntaiping.coms; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.coms

<adeline. chnp@se ontaiping. coms

Subject: OUR REF: SNM18D00835C02/2/LKKDS & YR SDG95S (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118004076/Aks3) on 09/02/2018

Dear Shirley,
We refer to youremail of 5 March 2018.
We dattached our Insured’s SAS Report and SKB9307] Third party report for your necessary action,

Please be advised that we are unable to issue LKK assignment letter to due motor-trade policy for this vehicle
S5IH19128

Kindly take note, the claim handler on this case is Sharon Han 63896193,
Thank you,

Regards

Angie Foo

Executive

Metor Drvizion

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleal Towe)

Singapore 0729049

Co.Reg Mo 200208384E

DID: 6389 8186

Fax 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email angie fooifisg.cntaiping.com
Email claimsdeptisq.cntaiping.com
Website www.sg.cntaiping.com




' V4 4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
;;‘__1;_! 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. No, 199607 198R G5T Reg. No. 19-9807198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref . CCBICTIM8004076/Aka3s2
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 DA IO ” ‘ll'""”""lu“
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJH 19128 Veh. Inspected 5DG 955
Policy No. DMTPSN1754741700 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D00835C02/2 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 01/03/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model OPEL ASTRA c.c 1389
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. WOLBEBECBHGD02692 Colour RED
Odometer 24220 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[225/45R17 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45R17 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre [225/45R17 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45R17 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  09/02/2018 |Inspection Date 01/03/2018
Survey held at 1ST AUTOWORKS PTE LTD
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
#04-01 (SOUNTH WING)
SINGAPORE 415933
5a, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

[ESTlMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-8607188-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SDG 958

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

Page Mo..1 of 2

Description of Parts Condition Estimate By | Our Adjusted
- i Workshop (§)| (5
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 1,600.00 -
LABOUR
1|RHF FENDER DENTED 426.00 426.00
1|RHF HEADLAMP NOT NECESSARY 1,200.00 &
1|RHF BUMPER BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 65.00 -
1|RH WIND MIRROR COVER MISSING 120.00 120.00
1|RH WIND MIRROR ASSY BENT 380.00 380.00
1|RH WIND MIRROR GLASS NOT NECESSARY 208.00 )
1|RHF BUMPER GUIDE NOT NECESSARY 65.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT 404,40 =80 80
363960 815.40
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIP (SN} NOT NECESSARY 65.00 -
3|RHF FEMDER LINER CLIP (SN} NOT NECESSARY 19.50
B4 .50 -
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE / RENEW THE ACCIDENT DAMAGED 3,250.00 1,300.00
FORTION. TO PANEL BEATING, RESHAPE, STRAIGHTEN,
ORIENTATE AMD ALIGN REPAIR /| REPLACEMENT
PARTS. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT BUMPER.
CARRY OUT SPRAY PAINTING ON ACCIDENT AFFECTED 2,200.00 1,200.00
AREA.
TO DISCONNECT WIRE HARNESS OF ELECTRICAL 30.00 30.00
COMPOMNENT TO FACILITATE REPAIRS, RECOMNECT
AND CHECK ELECTRICAL FUNCTIOMN AFTER REPAIR.
TO REFOCUS HEADLAMP NOT NECESSARY 80.00 =
5,560.00 2.530.00
GRAND TOTAL 9,284.10 3,345.40

Report Ref No. CCB/CTI18004076/Aka3s2




IV 74

- B . .
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Page No..2 of 2
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 3,345.40|

Report Ref No. CCB/CTI18004076/Akads2

% g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.
WMWW contact or torl. i accepted to any third party who may reply on the Bepor Wiy Grin par

Any third party &Cring o




