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I8 Matiman a-Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)
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(CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS = S

| Iasured: _TEO IIA JIN ALOYSIUS, ID: 59222951C

: TEO SO0 HWA, 1D: S13363168H = ————
SGQ4762K ' | Date of Loss: 27/02/2018 23:00 - :59

TP / 550971 | Policy/Cover Note No.: e S e i

SLA7968P | Policy No. (Claimant): -
| Extess: . 15$2,000.00 o

i _ Alans United Auto Pte Ltd (HQ) BLK 7 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE #01-76, 575642 Sin Ming - Tel:
|T-fnnn||ng T m’:'tgg‘hggzgﬂnﬁwuj Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 465 6827 7888 .., [Handled by Monica Chung Pel

| Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Imm.Advice due 02/03/2018]

Adj Asg, Remarks: | CUIENT REQUEST -let LKK Auto Cansultants Pte Ltd Mr, Kennsth Kong to conduct pre repair survey |
|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED =

I.'Fﬂﬂi:l are no mail for this case. -
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Mivitha (LKK Auto)
B e e T —

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuta) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 3:26 PM

To: assignments

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW:ATTACHED SGQ4T&2ZK REPAIR ESTIMATE ,GIA REPORT TO REQUEST JOINT
Hi,

FYNA please

Thnnk you

Rest Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phtitie: 6366 bo55 | emiall: MelFwinelkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Bk 51, Payn Ubd Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408053)

From: kennychan@alanutd.com [mailtokennychan@alanutd.com]

Sent: Thursday, 1 March, 2018 3:19° PM

To: 'Eileen Goh' <gileen_goh@sg.msig-asia.com>

Cz: 'Monica Chung' <Monica_Chung@sg.msig-asia.com>; 'Christina Wong' <Christina_Waong@sg.msig-asia.com>;
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: ATTACHED S5GQ4762K REPAIR ESTIMATE ,GIA REPORT TO REQUEST JOINT

De=ar Eileen

Thank you for sending us jolnt expert surveyor and we have decided to let LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Mr. Kenneth
Kong to conduct pre repair survey .

Regards

Kenny

Alan's United Auto Pte Ltd
Bd538686

From: Eileen Goh [mailtecelleen goh@se msig-asia. com]

Sent: Thursday, March 01, 2018 3:07 PM

To: kennychan@alanutd.com

Ce: Monica Chung <Monica Chung@sg. msig-asia.com>; Christina Wong <Christina Wong msig-asia.coms
Subject: ATTACHED SGQ4762K REPAIR ESTIMATE ,GIA REPORT TO REQUEST JOINT

Importance: High

Dzar Sir,
We refer to your email dated 01/03/2018 earlier on

Please choose one surveyor from the list that you wish for us to appoint to conduct the pre-repair
inspection:



1)  LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
2)  Formteam Consultancy Pte Ltd
3) Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd

To faciiitate an expeditious claim settlement, we hope you are agreeable for the above surveyor to
be the SJE (Single Joint Expert)

It not, you may wish to nominate any of the 10 surveyors listed below as the SJE. depending on
their availability:

1)  Adrian Ling

2)  Kenneth Kong

3)  Marcus Chua

4)  Henry Ng

5) Lau Kwok Kwong
6) Frankie Pang

7)  NagYou han

8) Gary Soon

9) Chow Bo Xiong
10) Benjamin Chua

NB: If both of us could not agree with each other's list of nominated SJE, we may still proceed to
aopoint a motor surveyor to conduct a pre repair survey & post repair inspection within the
timeline stipulated under the NIMA protocol.

Thank you

Have & great week ahead!

Eileen Goh
Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2584 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | eileen_goh@sg. msig-asia.com

TV b .
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MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong B*uﬂdiaﬁn pore 048581 | T: +65 6220
S&44 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg
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CONFIDEMTIALITY NOTICE
Thith e-mall meduding any attachments ] may cont@in informatien that s prviieged o confideatial Thio sending of this e-miail g any
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porson mnu-rm intended reciplent is sut a waiver of the prvilege or confidentiafity that attaches to it If you are not the inpemsded
recipierit, please notify the sender immediately, delets the emall and do not copy, distribute or distiose its cantents.



Nivitha !LKK Autn!

From: Shu Pei (LKKAUto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 March 2018 6:11 PM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: YOUR REF: 550971 YOUR INSURED VEHICLE SLAT968P TO WITHDRAW T. P.
CLAIM FOR 5GQAT62K ACCIDENT ON 27-0-2016

Attachments: SKM 28421803061 5200.paf

Eest Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Fhone: 6366-0055 | emall: thupe @ ikkaytocom | fax: 67414108
Elk 51, Paya Ubl Industiial Park, Ukl Avénue 1, §02-25 | sla08933)

From: kennychan@alanutd.com [mailto:kennychan@alanutd.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 6 March 2018 6:05 PM

To: 'Monica Chung' <Monica_Chung@sg.msig-asia.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: YOUR REF: 550971 YOUR INSURED VEHICLE SLA7968P TO WITHDRAW T. P. CLAIM FOR SGQ4762K
ACCIDENT ON 27-0-2016

Dear Monica

Flease to inform you that your insured vehicle owner had came to our workshop for doing pte settle our client
vehicle damaged repair cost, enclosad mutual agreement form for you to closed file at your end thank you.

Dear Catherine [LKK)

Flease to inform you for withdraw the survey of our client vehicle SGQ4762K ,kindly closed file-at your end thank
you .

Regards

kenny

Alan's United Auto Pte Ltd
£4538686



MUTUAL AGREEMENT,

We, the undersigned, hereby agreed to mutually settle among ourselves regarding an accident involving
SEC T« o> SLATREP | 06 —03- >y (g
slong SUGEPAT soDL SR (fencPo ] (s Tmprpoes

As there is no Personal Injury and/or Death involved, both parties have agreed fo seftle this maner
amicably e follows:

[ JNEITHER PARTY SHALL BE LIABLE TO COMPENSATE THE OTHER PARTY FOR
ANY LOSS OR DAMAGED INCURRED AND/OR TO BE INCURRED AS A RESULT

OF THE ABOVE ACCIDENT.

[ /F WITHOUT ANY ADMISSION OF LIABILITY, OWNER/DRIVER OF VEHICLE NO
SLA TR HAS PAID A SUMOF s§ (OB O [=—

(CASH/CHEQUE NO. ) BEING FULL AND FINAL SETTLEMENT
OF ALL DAMAGES AND COSTS INCURRED AND/OR TO BE INCURRED AS A
RESULT OF THE SAID ACCIDENT.

Both parties have not and will not make 2 POLICE report or GIA/IDAC report to the respective

Authorities in regards to this sccident.
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