
Priority :.ltiORMAL / URGENT

of A\G

Itl OPS : Yes / No DOA'.:__.._ -i_1..

KET:

:$

Fiom (Person) :

Date/Time:

Registration Date:

TYPE; M.cai / M. cycle 1 Bus i Van I Lorry/ Taxi / prime Mover / Truck / Trailer oi'

vehicle No : ' 
Ssur Setrex D.O.A./ A.sAt d"lp -

Make & Modet: , Tsgqh .Alrlgv4 NEW eAR PR.ICE:$

boe rxpiry nate: . ttrrl>0ffi
LTA. Total Rebate Arnount: ipARF) + (COE)

Date

SV:$

MV,$_J5-E_Quote ly- : Adtrqn

FS:$



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Dear Bernard,

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Friday, 2 March 2018 7:38 AM
'Ler, Bernard-JQ'; SUR

RE: SJU5379X/ 4116844303SG I Date of Accident 9/2/2018

The market value for SJU 5379X is S55K (EST) as at Feb 2018

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, UbiAvenue t,#02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Ler, Berna rd-JQ [ma ilto : Berna rd-JQ. Ler@a ig.com]

Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 4:04 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@fta.com.sg>; Rogass mailcrogassociates@gmail.com>

Subject: SJU5379X/ 4116844303SG I Date of Accident: 9/2/21tg

HiAII,

. Appreciate if you all could assist to compute market value of the vehicle above please.

Thank you very much.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler
AIG
Complex Claims Examiner
Claims lAlG Asia Pacific lnsurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-'16 Singapore(O79120)

Ts1 +(65) 6419 1946 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bernard-JQ. Ler@aig.com I www.aig.com.sq

IMP6RTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. lf you are not the intended recipient, you must

not use or disseminate the information. lf you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by

"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and

any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into

which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no

responsibility is accepted by American lnternational Group, lnc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or

severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page I of 2

Dor\: tf "f tc

cAlq)

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

vehil 
f 

e oyr:.l Pinj"ili::

Owner ID Type:

;;",;;,

Vehicle Details

Singupo.e wRIC

4460J

Sru5379X

Ii Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended De-registration Date: 27 Feb2018

, Vehicle Make:
:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:

: Manufacturing Year:

iEngineNo.:

I Chassis No.:

TOYOTA

ALP}IARD 3.5G A

Black

2009

2GFt0702285

GGH208028670

{c-

,o'loe/rr

ptv : SS

Maximum Power Output:

Open Market Value:

206.0 kw (276bhp)

$s3,749.00

Original Registration Date :

First Registration Date:

15 Dec 2009

l5 Dec 2009

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Delails

PARF Eligibility:

0

$53,749.00

Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

14Dec2019

$29,561.00

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/ltalvrVaction/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTI... 212712018



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

COE Expiry Date: l4Dec20l9

B - Car (160 lcc & above)COE Category:

Page2 of 2

; COE Period(Years): l0

l

r QP Paid: $18'389.00

: coE Rebate Amount: ' $3'302'oo

i Total Rebate Amount: $32,863.00

ioK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTI... 2/2712018


