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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

LT 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL; 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. No- 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607188-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref ; CC4/LPC18004019/T1hs3
$19-04107 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE gsss Dale: 01032018 Mmm"mulm m
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJG 2418K Veh. Inspected SLE 66368H
Policy No. Z17VPO5014874 Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. 17/18/18/VP05/020437 Excess ($) 0.00
1Assign From Assign Date 01/03/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Modification
General
|3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre v
L/H Rear Tyre ]
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/02/2018 Inspection Date 02/03/2018
Survey held at PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD
303 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 159341
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WaAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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Your ref; 17/ 1871 8/VPOS020437 Date: 05032018
Our ref: CO4LPC18004019/T Ths3

The Motor Claims Depariment

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE ™0 SLE 6636H
We refer 1o the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 02.03.2018
4t the M/s Performance Motors Limited ( Alexandra) have the following to report:-

Warkshop Estimate Armount v5% 6,149 .45
Revised Estimate Amount 5% 4,459.55
"Check” Items Amount : 5% 114.90
Market Value 153 -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 8% z
MNett Value 1 5% -

Description of Damage: ) e
The vehicle sustained damages at the Ll
N/S Fortion .

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 5.0 days

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: PESP <pmil-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 22 June, 2018 7:51 PM

To: Vie (LKKAuto); Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Subject: Fw: FINAL REPORT / SLEBB36H
Attachments: Final Report SLE6636H. pdf

Urgent reminder

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 27 April 2018 1:55 PM

To: PBSP; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: FINAL REPORT / SLE6636H

Without Prejudice

Hi Caroline,

Thank you for the email.

Hi Vic,

Please kindly assist.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

----- Original Message-—--

From: PBSP [mailto:pmli-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 27 April 2018 1:01 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FINAL REPORT / SLE6636H

Dear Sirs

We refer to the above and attached Final Report.

Please confirm COR as follows:

Total Labour : 3,780.00

Total Parts : 778.55

Tatal Labour & Parts : 4,558.55

Repair days: 5



Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint

303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient”) and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby
disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or
other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and
do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”
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Performance Motors Limited

i & member of the Eime Darby Group

Co, ®eq. Ho

103, Alexandea Road
sime Darby Perfosmance Centre
159941 finapara 438180

fingapors

el 63150100 [Sales & Admind Tel.
£31%0111

Fax 3T TITO

1974015598 08T Reg, Mo M2-00200BL-X

315, Alexandra Road

gime Darby Business Centrds
gingapora 15595944
Teml ., S3190330

»R0, Kampong hrang Rood
East Coact Centre
[(Afrar3alesl
£3190533 /630 (Motarrad)
Fax. G4796E01 iafterfales]
E4THER24 iMotorradl

3190888 [REcersSalaal
(RfterSales] Fax., 63443773

GST REG. NO M2 - 0020081 - X

ESTIMATE

Estimate No. : hl 46084 Page No.
Date Estimated : 28/02/2018
prepared By : Inthiran A/L Thurasamy
R
((~ ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 40000 ]
Lim Peck Hoon Cash Sales - Service
8 Tao Ching Road Singapore
#11-13
| Singapore 618724 =
i b’
REGH. NO. CHASSIS NO. REGH. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
SLE6636H 5B45035 28/07/2016 216d G TOURER 0
| —
DESCRIPTION VALUE ]
To repair rear fender left and rear left door. (23§ 255000
Painting rear left fender and rear left door. J T30 1,823.00
To check electrical wiring systems /52 477.00
To replace tyre and wheel rim including balancing. (1x). v 9400
To check steering geometry and conduct wheel alignment #5) 531.00
according to BMW specification (1X)
Sundries. 7 go00
Total Labour 5,355.00
DESCRIPTION QTY PRIC S S ALUE
ALLOY RIM 7.5%17 DOUBLE SPK 385 1 759.55 759.685
HUB CAP WITH CHROME EDGE 1 34.90 7 3490
U Total Parts 794.45
}[wfﬁ Ql(s5 R
+ W
— :
Labour 1 5,355.00
b Parts 794.45
|: Labour 2 0.00
ﬁhJﬁ‘M\ Q Ud o, i Excess 0.00
5% . Total GST @ 7% 430.46
Grand Total 6,579.91

| ** THIS ESTIMATE IS VALID FOR A PERIOD OF 30 DAYS ONLY™
-» PRICE FOR PARTS ARE SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE **



CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

Please call +65-6322-2072 for FWD Emergency Assistance
if Your Car breaks down or is involved in an accident.

Al accidents must be reported within 24 hours of the incident regardless of whether it will lead to a claim,
e e ——— == —=

POLICY NUMBER: PNPV2017-00000829-01 (Comprehensive - Prestige Plan)
Car plate number: SLEG636H

Your name (As the policyholder): Lim Peck Hoon

Coverage start date: 15/01/2018

Coverage end date: 14/01/2019

Covered geographical area: Singapore, West Malaysia and Southern Thailand

Who is insured to drive:
(a) You; and
{b) Anyone with a valid driving license who You give permission to drive Your Car.

Important things to know:

Your Policy comprises this Certificate of Insurance, the Contract, the Car Insurance Summary and any
Endorsements attached by Us. These documents should be read together as one. You must make sure that
any person You give permission to drive Your Car understands Your duties under this Policy and complies with
its conditions.

Your Policy is only valid if Your Car is being used for non-commercial activities in accordance with Your contract.

Finance company: United Overseas Bank Limited

We canfirm that this Policy complies with the Motor Vehicles (Third-Party Risks and Compensation} Act (Chapter 189).

Issued on: 15/11/2017

Abhishek Bhatia Please immediately inform us at +65-6820-8888
Chief Executive Officer or email us at contact.sg@fwd.com if any details
FWD Singapore Pte Ltd in this Certificate of Insurance need to be changed.

FWD Singapore Pe. Lid. 6 Temasek Boulevard, # 18-01 Suntec Tower 4, Singapore 038586 T: {65) 6BZ0 8BA&. Company Reglstration Mo. 200501737H | www-haed.comusg
Crmwright B 2016 FWD Sinsannre Pre_ | rd. All Riehts Recsned.
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103, Alexandra Koad
gime Parby Performance Centré
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157401553W GET Reg.

Performance Motors Limited

HO MI-00Z0981-K

315; Rlexandra Road

Eime Darby Business Centre
3ia ore 150
Zingapore 43810 ;ﬂqas

280, Eampong Arang koad
East Coafl Qentoe

Sipgapore 1H¥I41 EI180538 Atteriales]
Tel. €11 ob - (fales & Admliol Tel girsoakE |Afeerfales) £1150533/630 (Motorrad)
£51901311 (Aftersales| Fax d134977] Fax. BaTSE603 IAfewrinles)
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GST REG. NO : M2 - po20081 - X
ESTIMATE "BFE?-’(LMB
| ?‘ ¢+ T P
Estimate No. . bl 46084 Page No. : 1 of 1 y
Date Estimated : 28B/02/2018
Prepared By . Inthiran A/L Thurasamy
— ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - — ACCOUNT - 40000 )
Lim Peck Hoon Cash Sales - Service
B Tao Ching Road Singapore
#11-13
Singapore 618724 ]
3
REGH. HO. CHASSISE NO. REGEN. DATE MODEL MILERCE
SLEGG3EH 5B45035 28/07/2016 216d G TOURER o
r b
DESCRIFTION VALUE

To repair rear fender left and rear left door.
Painting rear left fender and rear left door,

To check electrical wiring systems

according to BMW specification {1X)

To replace tyre and wheel rim including balancing. (1x).

To check steering geometry and conduct wheel alignment

(273G 2550.00

15271 g23.00
597 177.00
v 8400

45/~ 531.00

LS

Sundries. 1N 53? 80.00

Total Labour 5,355.00

'_D_E_CCRiFTI'::ﬁ QTY PRTC ) VALUE

ALLOY RIM 7.5X17 DOUBLE SPK 385 1~ 75955 *1%.85 “ 750 55
HUB CAP WITH CHROME EDGE 1 3490 VAT 34907

U , ured 1 Diract € Total Parts i 794.45

PBIBCUS oo~

| e i il j
[_ - _ __. Labour 1 5.355-Dﬂ]

ST b__'_ ———— Parts 794.45

z Tl el LD LERLTE: Labour 2 0.00

'f'q-..t‘uk G U('Eq'hl_w | Excess 0.00

ey Recommend _____Sden . j Total GST @ 7% 430.46

Grand Tetal 6,579.91

© +* THIS ESTIMATE IS VALID FOR A PERIOD OF 30 DAYS ONLY™ o \hA-k5

|+« PRICE FOR PARTS ARE SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE **



Performance Motors Limited

A mermber of tha Sime Darty Groun
o, Rizg. ho, 197401 3556, GET Reg. Mo ME-0020081-¥

FINAL REPORT
Estinmate Mo ' bl 46084 Page Mo, .
Cote Estimated ’ 28/02/2018
Frepared By : Inthiran A/L Thurasamy
REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 158
Lim Pack Heoon Lonpac Insurance Ehd
B Tac Ching Road 300 Beach Reoad
#11-13 #17-04/07 The Concourse

Singapore 199555
Singapore 618724

FEN WO CHASSI S ND FEQN [ATE MIE M LEACE
SLE663EH 5B45035 28/07/2016 216d G TOURER 0
DESCRIPTION ORIGINAL PRICE ~ DISC. % NETT
To make good the rear LH fender, rear LH door include 1275.00 1,275.00

remaving attachments to faciltiate repairs and knocking
out dents caused by the accident

To spray paint rear LH fender and rear LH door 1730.00 1,730.00
To check electrical wiring systems and ligntings at the LH 150.00 150.00
section for proper function

To replace wheel rim include balancing (1x) 94,00 94.00
To check steering geometry and conduct wheel alignment 451.00 451.00

in accordance with BAMW specifications (1x)

Sundries. 80.00 B0.00
DESCRIPTION LINIT PRICE aQTy DISC. % MNETT
ALLOY RIM 7.5X17 DOUBLE SPK 385 778.55 1.00 778.55
# SUPPLEMENTARY ITEMS
Total Labour : 3,780.00
'I'_{}_tal_Parts_: — - = ) 778.55
Total Labour & Parts : 4.558.55
Deduction for Excess: 0.00
Total Repair Costs less Excess: 4 558,55
GST@7%:. 319.10
Grand Total : 4 B877.65

Final Report SLEGG36Hxsx, Page 1 Finalised by; Caroline DID: 63190174 Fax: 64794601



5hirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 2 March 2018 10:14 AM

To: ' Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Cc MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT-SLE6636H AND SJG2418K ON 26/02/2018
Attachments: 02032018101012.pdf

Dear Shirley,
We attached a copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

The premium for the policy has been settled.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [rna|'Il:-:::ShirlevHim@!kkautn.cum]

Sent: Friday, 2 March, 2018 9:48 AM

To: 'mt_claim@lonpac.com'’; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: ONG LI LI; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; GERALD POH WEE BIN: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT-SLE6636H AND S1G2418K ON 26/02/2018

Your ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020437
LKK ref: CC4/LPC18004019/hs3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case from M/s Performance Motors Limited - Alexandra.
We have not authorized repairs.

We will revert preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, Kindly assist to verify validity of our insured'’s policy, and let us have a copy of insured's accident
report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you
Best Regards,
Shirley Higw | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phena: BI6E-0055 | email: shifleyHiew @Ikkauto.com | faw: 6741-0108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408333)

Erom: GERALD POH WEE BIN [maiIm:geraldpnh@lonnac,cc:-m]

Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 5:32 PM

To: assignments@Ikkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt claim@lonpac.com>; PBSP <pml-phsp@simedarby.com.sg=>
Subject: FW: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEM ENT-SLE6636H AND 5JG2418K ON 26/ 02/2018

Our Ref - 17/18/18/VP05/020437
Dear Catherine,
Please proceed to survey the vehicle accordingly.

At the same time, kindly assist in obtaining the video footage
as stated in the third party report.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 28 February, 2018 5:11 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Subject: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT-SLE6636H AND 51G2418K ON 26/02/2018

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

We have instructions from our client to seek repair cost and loss of use/car rental from you through Direct Settlement.
Attached is the estimates and supporting documents for your consideration.

Please let us have your confirmation that you agree that liability is clear and we may proceed with Direct Settlement.

If Direct Settlement is approved, kindly let us have your offer for LOU / rental.

Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601



“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the
named addressee ("the Recipient”) and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or
proprietary to the Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws.
If you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding
and/or printing the Message. Pleasc notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete
all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for any error. loss or damage arising from the
Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions
expressed in the Message are solely those of the author’s and do not necessarily represent those of Sime
Darby's.”



Vic (LKKAuto) e

From: Vie (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 1 August, 2018 10:58 AM

To: PBSP

Cc admin & Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SLE6636H LKK REF CC4/LPC18004019/T1hb3q2
Attachments: DV.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Carolineg,
We refer to the above matter and we confirmed in receipt of the LOD.

purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured’s
part, we have our principal's mandate and we confirmed acceptance of your offer of $5,179.65 (all in) to settle your
client's claim.

Kindly let the owner sign the sttached DV and forward back to us(LKK) the original signed DV for payment processing.

Thank you.

nplease note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also nat be disclased in any other reloted matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
maotter is made solely to resolve this matter anly. No reference shall be made to this offer ar any settlement arising from this offer
in any aother refated matters.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

¥y ISYS

-1 s

suanin WU Sgue the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
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From: Vic (LKKAuto)

sent: Thursday, 28 June, 2018 2:05 PM

To: PBSP; Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Ce: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SLEGG36EH

Without Prejudice

Dear Caroline,



We confirmed COR @ $4,558.55 with 5 Days (subject to our principal’s approval).

Kindly forward after repair photos if available.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: h741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)
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Erom: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.s
sent: Thursday, 28 June, 2018 1:50 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FINAL REPORT / SLEBB3IEH

URGENT REMINDER

From: PBSP

sent: Friday, 22 June 2018 7:51:14 PM

To: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com; taufikh@lkkauto.com
Subject: Fw: FINAL REPORT / SLEE636H

Urgent reminder

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 27 April 2018 1:55 PM

To: PBSP; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: FINAL REPORT / SLEG63EH

Without Prejudice

Hi Caroline,

Thank you for the email.
Hi Vic,

Please kindly assist.

Thank You.



Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

----- Original Message-—-

From: PB5P [mai'Itc:-.pm!—phsn@simedarbz.g.cam.sg]

sent: Friday, 27 April 2018 1:01 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>; Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FINAL REPORT / SLEGG36H

Dear Sirs
We refer to the above and attached Final Report.
Please confirm COR as follows:

Total Labour : 3,780.00
Total Parts: 778.55
Total Labour & Parts : 4.558.55

Repair days: 5

Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint

303 Alexandra Road Singapore 1595941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient”) and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby
disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or
other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and
do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”



Pgrfp_rmapce Motors Limited

Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road

#17- 04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555
Attention; Motor Claims

08 Qctober 2018
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE6636H AND SJG2418K ON 26.02.2018

Dear Sirs
We refer to the above matter.
We are pleased to enclose the Discharge Voucher duly executed by our client.

Please let us have your settlement cheque made in favour of “Performance Motors Limited”
within the next 14 days.

For any correspondence, please contact Ms Caroline Tan at 6319-0174/ Fax, 6479-4601 or
email to pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg.

Yours sincerely

Teng Wai Khan
Customer Service Manager, Body & Paint




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL B256 3561 FAM: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref - CCA/LPC18004019/T1hb3n2

[TIMATEAN

300 BEACH ROAD

4#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555 Diate:. “17-10-2048
Code: LPC2
Al Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJG 2418K Veh. Inspected SLE 6636H
Policy No. Z17VP0OS014874 Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. 17/18/18/VP05/020437 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  GERALD Assign Date 28/02/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model BMW 216D c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. WEBAZE320205B45035 Colour SILVER
Odometer 23400 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre 205/55 R17 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[205/55 R17 BRIDGESTOMNE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55R17 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 205/55 R17 BRIDGESTONE & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/02/2018 Inspection Date 02/03/2018
Survey held at PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD
303 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 159941
Ba. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AMWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjiN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR! 5 Working Days




¥ L L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sl ; ; s » 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315
Reg, Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. Mo 19.9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLE 6636H
Estimate By | OQur Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1/SUNDRIES (SN) NECESSARY 80.00 80.00
i|ALLOY RIM 7 5%17 DOUBLE SPK 385 (SN} cuT 750.55 778.55
1|HUB CAP WITH CHROME EDGE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 34.90 :
874 .45 B5B.6B5
LABOUR
TO REPAIR REAR FENDER LEFT AND REAR LEFT 2 550.00 1,275.00
DOOR .
PAINTING REAR LEFT FENDER AND REAR LEFT DOOR . 1,923.00 1,730.00
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING SYSTEMS. 177.00 150.00
TO REPLAGE TYRE AND WHEEL RIM INCLUDING 9400 94.00
BALANCING.
TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND CONDUCT 531.00 451.00
WHEEL ALIGNMENT ACCORDING TO BMW
SPECIFICATION
5,275.00 3,700.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,149.45 4,558.55
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 4,558.55|

Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18004019/T1hb3n2

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI,L AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor

Automotive ASSessor




