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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

54 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18004016/R1qd3
396,01 CIT HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Bala: -dudnia NH"NMM”H' " M
Code: FCI2
14 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHA 3640H Veh. Inspected SGD 8866L
Policy Me. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18001698MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  CWS (MAY CHUA) Assign Date 01/03/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mim
L/H Front Tyre i
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
53 General Information
Accident Date  26/02/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08 .
SINGAPORE 159722
5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJURICE” BAEIS.

B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REFAIRS.
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51 UBLAVE 1, §01.25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAX : (165) 62564313

Your Ref: D18001698MFESH Date: 13 March 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCI18004016/R1qd3

The Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam.,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SGD 8866L .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 12/03/2018 at the premises of M/s MOVA. and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S§$  1.280.00 (Labour Only)
Revised Estimate Amount (88 680.00

“Check” Items Amount 1 8% -

Market Value =83 -

LTA Reimbursement Value (8% -

Nett Value :S§ -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the ofs rear portion.

Yours faithfully

Rasul
Automotive Assessor



MS‘ Fi rstCa Pital M5 Firs1 Capital Insurance Limited twnsg no 1990003005 447 Beg ho. ME 00QLG76-Y

& Raffles Quay §21-00 Singapore D4ASE0
Tel (B5) 6222 2311 Fax (65) 6222 347
Claims & Mater Undersriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-C1 City House Sengapore 058877

Tel: (6G)R507 3R4A Fax (B5] 5507 3840
wianel ST S1CAPITAL COMUSE

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 28-02-2018 Qur Ref No. D18001658MFSH
Accident Date 26-02-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHA3B40H Third Party Vehicle. SGDB26EL
Survey Location ELOCK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08
Contact Person. NITHA
Contact No. 62723892/ 0 Fax No. 62708314
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Apgointen LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

MOWVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE
Cc : Workshop Attention. NIL
LTD
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge MAY CHUA
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 August 2018 4:21 PM

To: 'Jacelyn': SUR

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: SGD8866L - TP/FC| - BMW 3201 (DOA 26.02.2018)

Dear Jacelyn,

WITHOUT PREJUDISE
Confirm final fig $900.00 before GST and 3 repair days.

Kindly send the relevant documents to First Capital Insurance.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsci@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: lacelyn <jacelyn@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 26 April 2018 5:15 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: FINALIZATION: SGD8866L - TP/ECI - BMW 3201 (DOA 26.02.2018)

Dear Siao Chan,

Please help to finalize the below case.

Thank you, have a nice day.

Best Regards,
Jacelyn Ooi
Estimator
946B6-9275

Email; jacelyn@mova.com.sq
Mova Automotive Pte Lid

From: Jacelyn [mailto:jacelyn@mova.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 March 2018 6:20 PM

To: 'Rasul (LKK Auto)'

Subject: FINALIZATION: SGD8866L - TP/FCI - BMW 3201 (DOA 26.02.2018)

Dear Rasul,

Please find the attached ‘Marking Estimate’ & ‘After-Paint’ photographs for your reference.
We propose the finalize amount at Labour $ 900.00. Kindly revert.

Thank you, have a nice day.

Best Regards,



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) v

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 March 2018 3:01 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System'; assignments

Ce: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001698MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI18004016R1qd3 pdf

Dear May,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SGD B366L.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan {Ms) | Caze Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: bas6-9561 | email: siewse@lkkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 4:30 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001698MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

KK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignmepts@lkkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Warkflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims @msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 3:11 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; MAYCHUAB@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001698MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,
Admin Team
Claim Workflow System



: @MOVA
Main Office:
Mowva Building
2, Jatan Kilang,
Page # < 1
Veh # . SGDasceL
28/02/2018
Veh Model - BMW 3201
mS FIEST GAEIT.ZL INSURANCE LIMITED Estimatet -~ CK417129 a2
36 Robinson Roa : Tel - (65) 6272 3892
#16-01 City House Claim# - TP/ (K 120%&4 Fe: (65) 62708014
Singapore 068877. ACC. Date .- 26/02/18 BT B
Terms - C.OD Days
Allention - XA0Z6 Remarks :- mMFq 03 Jm yots { wi4 )
Mo,  Description Qty UJ.Price Amounts S5
LIST ITEMS : 7
1 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH - CHECK { PO* e
2. REAR FENDER RH - REPAIR 1 PC
3. REAR FENDER INNER WHEELHOUSE PANEL-REPAIR 1 pcf
4, REAR BUMPER - REPAIR 1 PC
5 REAR WHEEL RIM RH- REPAIR i PC

LIST TOTAL 3§
5% DISCOUNT 55

LABOUR :

TO KNOCK & STRAIGHTEN ON REAR RIGHT FENDER

& WHEELHOUSE . TO REPAIR ON REAR BUMPER.
TO REALIGN CONNECTION

TO REMOVE & REFIT FUEL TANK & HOSE
TO REMOVE & REFIX AFFECTED COMPARTMENT
TO SPRAY PAINT ON REPAIRED AREA

TO REPAIR ON REAR WHEEL RiM RH

% QA X s000
3 dowp N b
SN s s il

TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT [ [ 4 }m’
LABOUR TOTAL 5% e _41 gg—a_o_n
({2\ ol T s -
>
Lonsultants hence nofify
rofthet Wl owinie:
i spray [';.I..'.!."g
» o ispay damaged pars)during resurvey £ %\D'E NON-TAX AMOUNT §
b e aT T e AMOUNT S$ 1,280.00
* No flegal modica owed % GST@ 7% 89.60
L 0% il 5 B r "'i-"il:.";""" and /_,/f.; _:'t'l‘ AE e —————— G E R R
al app om Insurance Company |/ . ¥
A AMOUNT DUE S$ 1,369.60
AT Oy Repanal & 222~ == T TPt
Qustomer’s Signature/Co. Stamp mdva Aummumje PTE LTD
Date; L .l— ) __




28/02/2018

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
36 Robinson Road
#16-01 City House
Singapore 063877

Attention ;- XAD2E

Page #
Veh # -

Veh Model =

Estimate# :
Claim #
ACC. Date

Terms -

Ll

Remarks

1

SGDBaseEL
BMW 320

CK417129

TP[ CK 120284
26/02/18

C.0D Days

Mg 03 Jm oIS (04)

Automotive Pte Ltd

Main Office:

Weova Bullding

Mo, #2, Jalan Kilang,
Sincapore 158415
Tel: (B5) 6476 3333
Fax: (65} 6271 BBOY
WWWLITIDVELCOIMLE]

Warkshop Dept:
Block 1008,

Bukit Merah Lana 3,
#01-04/08/08/94
Singapore 158722

Tal: (66) 52723882
Fax: (86) 6270 8314

Co. Reg. 1988040336
GST Reg. M2-0088B64-2

MNo.  Description

Qty

U.Price Amounts 8%

LISTITEMS :
REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH - CHECK
REAR FENDER RH - REFAIR

REAR EUMPER - REPAIR
REAR WHEEL RIM RH- REPAIR
LIST TOTAL 5%

5% DISCOUNT 5%

Ll

LABOUR :
TO KNOCK & STRAIGHTEN ON REAR RIGHT

REAR FENDER INNER WHEELHOUSE PANEL-REPAIR

FENDER

& WHEELHOUSE . TO REPAIR ON REAR BUMPER.

TO REALIGN CONNECTION

TO REMOVE & REFIT FUEL TANK & HOSE

TO REMOVE & REFIX AFFECTED COMPARTMENT

TO SPRAY PAINT ON REPAIRED AREA
TOREPAIR ON REAR WHEEL RIM RH
TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT

LABOUR TOTAL 5§

4

LKK Auto Consultants hence nolify

e

d s smwET e — e —

~| g Repairer of he Tollowing:

* Ta resurvey beforelalier spray painting

» To display damaged partfs) during resurvey

= Parts prices ara subject Lo confirmation

* Third party survey ks on 2 "Without Prejudice” basis

-:: ;Lqu medification]s) is allowed

. amentary ifem(s] must be resurveyed and
h:uhhcthl':al ap;:m};val fram H::Inma C!H?DMH

NON-TAX AMOUNT S

AMOUNT S%
GST@ 7%

AMOUNT DUE 5%

[~ ACknoWIEdgd b REgErer A

Date:

usiotder’s Signature/Co, Stamp Mf_

b AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD



Tyre Warehouse Pte. Ltd

BLK. 1002, Bukit Merah Lane 3

e e s L —i

#01-89, Singapore 159719
Phone Number: 8828 7733 /8866 7733 / 68163089
Fax Number:
Customer: Date: 20/3/2018 5:28 PM
Company: VIN
License NO: SGD8866L Technician:
Odometer: Order NO:
VEHICLE ALIGNMENT REPORT
BMW, 2011, 3 SERIES - F30 {Customized)
Primary Angles Initial Specifications Final
Min. Max.
Caster Left —_— —— T i
Right s =, o G
crok Camber Left 020 -p°s0° o*10' -0°19'
ron Right -0°19' -0°50" o0 -0*18'
Toe Left 0.42° 0.01° 021° a.10°
Right 0.35° o.01° D.21° 0.10°
Total 0.77 0.03° 0.43° 0.20°
Camber Left -1°34' -1°48' 0°58' 1234
Right -1°08' -1°48' -0°58' -1°07"
Rear Toe Left 0.11° 0.05° 0.25° 0.18°
Right 0.05° 0.05° 0.25° 0.18°
Total 0.16° 0.10° 0.50° 0.36°
Max Thrust Angle -0°02' —_ o000’
Initial Specifications Final
Secondary Angles iy e
Left — s it e
SAl
Right — — ——
Included Angle Left i — — —
Right — 2 - —
Toe Out On Turns Left — =t = e
Right - = i g
Max Turn Inside Left —_— — — —
Right — — — —
Toe Curve Change Left o — = —
Right s — — e
Setback Front -0.04" — —_— -0.04"
Rear -0.44" o= o £.44"
Track Width Diff. -1.24" -1.24"
Whee| Base Diff. 041" 0.41"
Front Ride Height Left — e - —
Right — i 5 —_—
Rear Ride Height Left — _— S e
Right - — =i u
Frame Angle —

kk.tyrewarehouse@agmail.com




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
= i TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-5607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internatlonale Des Experts En Automobile
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref - CS/FCI18004016/R1qd3n2
#1601 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Rl (s N Hl’llll”"”lm "n
Code: FCI2
1: Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHA 3640H Veh. Inspected SGD 88e6L
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D1800169E8MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From  MAY CHUA Assign Date 01/03/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model BMW320IED c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. WBA3J92070J642783 Colour BLACK
Odometer 44516 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R18 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 BRIDGESTONE B8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/50 R16 BRIDGESTONE & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHIGLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/02/2018 Inspection Date 12/03/2018
Survey held at MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08 .
SINGAPORE 159722
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B256 3561 FAX. 6250 4315

Reg. Mo: 183807198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607194-R Page Mo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGD 8866L
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty P Workshop ()| ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH (NPA) SERVICEABLE - -
1|REAR FENDER RH (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE 2 z
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER INNER WHEELHOUSE PANEL (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE 3
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER (MPA) TO REPAIR SEE -
LABOUR
1|REAR WHEEL RIM RH (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE 2 "
LABOUR
LESS 5% DISCOUNT : :
LABOUR
TO KNOCK & STRAIGHTEN ON REAR RIGHT FENDER & 450,00 300.00
WHEELHOUSE TO REPAIR ON REAR BUMPER.TO
REALIGN CONNECTION.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
REAR FENDER RH REAR FENDER INMNER WHEELHOUSE
PANEL REAR BUMPER AMD REAR WHEEL RIM RH.
TO REMOVE & REFIT FUEL TANK & HOSE. NOT NECESSARY 80,00 c
TO REMOVE & REFIX AFFECTED COMPARTMENT. 100.00 &0.00
TO SPRAY PAINT ON REPAIRED AREA 450.00 400.00
TO REPAIR ON RERA WHEEL RIM RH. 120.00 B80.00
TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT. £0.00 60.00
1,280.00 900.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,280.00 $00.00
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 900.00|

Report Ref No, CS/FCI18004016/R1qd3n2

i

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

S

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOEAMIRTE. AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TG THIRD PARTIES:- This Report ks made scdely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




